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Dean Smith in action at the World 
¥eterans Championships where he 
won a gold medal in the 800-meter 
run in the SO-55 age group. Photo' by 
Bob Pates. 
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HANNOVER, WEST GERMANY, 
August 3. Three thousand, one 
hundred twenty-six athletes from 42 
nations competed in the 3rd World 
Veterans Championships July 27-
August 2. ' 

It was the largest track and field 
meet in history, surpassing the 2799 
competitors from 27 nations in the 
2nd World Veterans Championships 
in Gothenberg, Sweden, in 1977. 

Entrants competed in S-year age 
divisions starting with 40-44 for men 
and 35-39 for women. 

Oldest competitor in the meet was 
Petor Goic, 83, of Yugoslavia. 

The caliber of competition was 
outstanding . A decade ago, few 
would have thought the human body 
was capable of such achievements. 

Twenty-eight new world S-year age 
division marks were set. John 
Gilmour, 60, of Australia put on -a 
performance never to be forgotten. A 
prisoner of war in Japan in World 
War II. Gilmour won 5 gold medals 
and set four world records in the 800 
(2:19.3),1500 (4:32.5), '5000 (16:54.9) 
and 10,000 (35:07.7). His 1500 time 
was virtually the first "S-minute 
mil e" in history for a man over 60. 

Two world marks were broken by 
Americans: George Braceland ran 

the 400-hurdles in 73 .22 to break Bud 
Deacon's old mark of 73.7 in the 
65-69 division. Herb Anderson won 

;' the same event in 90.65 to break his 
own standard of 92.5. 

With 90 % of the results tabulated, 
Americans won 59 gold medals, 60 
silver medals and 38 bronze medals. 

Of the 3126 entrants (about 200 
didn't show), 1349 were from 
Germany and 1777 from other 
nations. 

A total of 2688 of the competitors 
were men (86%) and 438 (14%) were 
women . 

The USA was the 2nd largest 
delegation with 226 entrants. Great 
Britain had 201 and Sweden 199. 

New Zeahind, Australia, Yugosla­
via and Japan bid for the 4th World 
Championships in 1981. New Zealand 
won and will host the Games in 
Christchurch in J anuary .. 1981. 

'Six new American records were 
established: Irene Obera 's 12.62 in 
the women's 45-49100 and 61.69 in 
the 400 . Shirley Kinsey's 77'2" in the 
women's SO-54 Javelin; Ruth Ander­
son's 20:15.9 in the women's SO-54 
5000; Cathy Hargus' 88.86 in the 
women's 60-64 400, Ed Oleata's 
58.46 in the men 's 40-44 400-hurdles 
and Ruth Anderson's 2:45.4 in the 
women's SO-54 800. 

The American men swept the 100 
and 200 in the 45-49 group . Lloyd 
Riddick, Marion Sanchez _and Nick 
Newton ran 1-2-3 in 'both events. In 
the 100, Matt Brown was 4th. 

Ern\e BiHups won the 40-44 800 in 
1 :56.6, and led all the way in the 1500 
before tiring to 4th. 

The great Jack Greenwood was 
"held" to only 3 gold medals in the 
two , hurdles and 4x400 relay as 
competition was tougher than ever 
before. 

Miki Gorman won 3 golds in the 
women's 40-44 5000, 10,000 and 
marathon. Dorothy Stock won both 
the 5000 and cross-country in the 
women's 45-49 group. 

The ubiquitous Herb Anderson 
repeated his 1977 Sweden perfor­
mances with 10 golds, 4 silvers and a 
bronze in the men's 75-79 class. 

Ruth Anderson won first places in 
the women ' s SO-54 category in the 
cross-country, _ marathon and XC 
team, 

The Germans generally put on a 
,tight, well-run, precise meet. 
Equipment was first class . The 
electronic scoreboard, flashing the 
running time, names, lanes, numbers 
and countries of the finalists was a 
marvel. Every event ran right on 

cantin ued on page 2 
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At the water jump in the 3000-K 
steeplechase age SO-54 division at the 
World Games at Hannover. Photo by 
Bob Pates. / . 

World Veterans Championships 
continued from page .l 

time . 
Yet hard feelings came abcut due 

to . alleged cbeating by German 
officials in favor of German 
competitors. There was lack of 
sufficient officials in the walk which 
led to " blatant running" and 
subsequent protests by competitors. 

A sour , note to the whole 
proceedings was what one described 
as "the biggest ripoff I've ever 
experienced. " 

"They charge you for everything," 
bemoaned Chris Miller on opening 
day. It got worse as the week 
progressed . From a $2 .25 extra 
entrance fee to a $5.50 charge for 
results, to an $18 admission charge to 
the farewelI party (food and drinks 
extra) to a $5 .50 masseur charge, to 
very high meal and hotel prices, to' a 
lack of free trolley fare (as we had in 
Sweden), to miscellaneous nickle-and 

-dime charges, competitors felt 
fortunate to survive the week with 
purses and walIets intact. Many 
didn't, As Leon Trout summed up, 
"Every time you go to the bathroom, 
they charge you." 

The Germans were strict and 
precise, but not always. The 

language was an enormous problem. 
Often, when a dispute came up, a 
German official would say "Nein," 
rather than try to resolve the 
problem. 

(Ed. note-This story is being 
written in Hannover to meet the 
NMN September deadline. The 
October issue of NMN will cover the 
3rd World Games in more specific 
and complete detail.) . 

The South Africans were alIowed to 
run, but not as South Africans, but 
Rhodesians. If the logic of that 
escapes you, you're not alone . It was 
an 11 th-hour compromise. No one 
was happy about it, but the South 
Africans at least got to compete. 

Nearly-blind Norm Bright of 
Seattle raised enough money to make 
the trip and compete well. 

Totally blind Fritz Assmy of 
Germany, with the aid of his nephew 
guiding him with a short rope 
connected to their wrists, won the 
100, 200, 400 and 4xl00 relay in an 
inspirational performance . 

Nick Newton won 2 silvers and 2 
bronze in the men's 45 division, just 
missing the 400 gold by 0.2 second in 
a photo-finish with took 2 hours to 
decide . 

Dean Smith won the M50 800 in 
near world-record time of 2:03 .5. 

Bob Hunt won the M55 400-hurd­
les in 64 .92. Bob Backus took 'the 
M50 hammer at 157'9 112". Tom 
Pat salis &uccessfully defended his 
long jump world's championship at 
19'41/4" . 

BilI Andberg copped the 800 in the 
65-69 class. Emery Curtice won the 
70-74 javelin. Lou Gregory won the 
marathon. 

Unnoticed by everyone but AI 
Guidet, the hurdle distances for men 
50 and over were published as 8.6 
meters (29 feet) instead of the usual 
8.9 Imeters (30 feet). 

Defending champion and world 
record-holder Jack Greenwood was 
livid, since the World Veteran ' s 
Athletic Association had never 
authorized such a change. 

In spit!,! of protests by virtualIy alI 
competitors, who legitimately feared 
injury as welI as a sub-par 
performance, the Germans were 
adamant. 

To Greenwood's credit , and as a 
testament to his ability, he won the 
event, chopping his stride noticeably. 
AI Guidet, who cleverly had been 
practicing the shorter distance, also 

won. Bob Hunt was not as fortunate, 
chop-chopping his way to a 4th place 
finish. Several hurdlers fell in their 
attempt at the unfamiliar situation. 

The wea'ther was generally fair and 
cool. Sweaters were needed during 
the day. The mornings were sunny, 
and it usualIyrained in the afternoon. 

At the bi-annual VW AA meeting, 
the date-of-birth, not year-of-birth 
was reaffirmed as the basis for 
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com petition. 
All present officers were re-elected 

for another 2~year term. 
Italy IS exploring an Indoor 

Veterans Championship' for 1980. 
Venezuela is expected to bid for 

the 1983 games. 
English was designated as the 

official language for WV AA meetings 
with a French translation only. 

The concept of meeting minimum 
standards to win a medal was tabled 
till 1981. 

ENTRANTS IN 3RD WORLD 
VETERANS CHAMPIONSHIPS 

BY COUNTRY AND SEX 

Argentina · 
Australia 
Austria 
Brazil 
Canada 
Denmark 
Spain 
Finland 
France 
Germany 
Great Britain 
Guyana 
Holland 
Hong Kong 
Hungary 
India 
Ireland 
lsI 

-~-- - Israel 

2 
77 
57 

3 
51 
64 
19 
94 
61 ' 

1134 
172 . 

2 
53 
2 

11 
22 
24 

1 
5 ' 

96 Italy ~ 
Japan ~ .... __ ,!23 

Korea 
Luze mbourg 
Norway 
New Zealand 
Poland 
Portugal 
Puerto Rico 
Rhodesia 
South Africa 
Romania 
Singapore · 
Switzerland 
Sweden 
Syria 
Czechoslovakia 
Turkey 
URS· 
Uruguay 
USA 
Venezuela 
Yugoslavia 

TOTAL 

7 
1 

99 
20 

1 
9 
4 
3 

51 
7 
3 

20 
172, 

1 
76 
2 
1 
1 

193 
23 
21 

2688 

.. ~ 'y 

~ f.,,~ 
~O ,,0 

13 · 
16 93 
7 64 
o 3 
3 54 
20 84 
I 20 
9 103 
8 69 
215 1349 
·19 201 
0""" 2 
II . .64 
o 2 
4 1'5 
I 23 
o 24 
o 1 
o 5 
4 100 
3 26 
6 13 
o 1 
8 107 
6 26 
o 1 
o 9 
o 4 
I 4 
13 64 
o 7 
o 3 
2 22 
27 199 . 
() 1 
I~ . 90 
o 2· 
o 1 
() I 
3.1 · 226 
I 24 
5 26 
438 3126 

U.S. MEDAL WINNERS 

Division 
M 40 
M45 
M50 
M55 
M60 
M65 
M70 
M75 
W35 
W40 
W45 
W50 
W55 
W60 
W65 
Total 

Gold 
1 
3 
8 
4 
4 
3 
6 
14 
o 
5 
4 
6 
o 
o 
I 

5q 

Silver 
4 
7 
8 
3 
8 
5 
6 
9 
o 
4 
2 
1 
1 
2 
o 
60 

Bronze 
1 
5 
2 
4 
8 
5 
3 
3 
o 
3 
1 
o 
1 
4 
o 

38 

Tota'l 
6 

15 
18 
11 
20 
13 
15 
26 
o 
12 
7 
7 
2 
4 
1 
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.. , Schedu-Ie of Events .. 

Sat. Sept. 1. 2nd British Veterans 
Athletic Federation Decathlon 
Championships at Loughborough . 
Contact: David Williams, 19, High­
fields Dr., Loughborough LE11 3JS, 
England. 

Sun Sept. 2. 2nd annual Southwest 
T&F meet; Univ. of New Mexico, 
Albuquerque. 

Contact Dave Douglass, 5804 Greenly 
Rd. NE; Albuquerque, N.M. 87111. 

. Sun. Sept. 16. National AAU 
Masters 50K Road Champioriships, 
Brattleboro, Vermont. Contact: Kurt 
Steiner. 1660 E. 21st St., NYC 11210. 

Sat. Sept. 29. National ,AAU 
Masters 25K Road Championships, . 

· Tulsa, Okla. Contact: Vern White­
side, 69.16 S. Knoxville Ave" Tulsa, 
Ok: 74136 . . . 

Sun. ·Sept. 30. 1st British Veterans 
Athletic Federation Marathon Cham­
pionships at Stoke-on-Trent. Contact: . 
P. Hoon, LC.L. Sports & Social Club, 
Westfield,~ Kidsgrove, Stoke-on­
Trent~ngland. 

Sat. Oct. 6. 6th annual Santa 
Barbara Masters T&F meet; Univ. of 
Calif., Santa Barbara, Calif. Contact: 
George Adams, P.O. Box K, Goleta, 
Ca. 93017. 

Sat. Oct. 13 . New Zealand Road 
Championships, Northland . Contact: 
€' Gl"e, a greave St., 
Wellington 2, New Zealand. 

Sat. Oct. 13. National AAU 
Masters Marathon Championships, 
Niagara Falls, . N. Y. (Skylon Mara­
thon). Contact: George ·· Bailey, 
Skylon Tower, 5200 Robinson ' St., 
Niagara Falls, Ontario, Canada L2 G2 
A3. 

Sun. Oct. 21. British Veterans 
Athletic Federation 20K Road: Waik 
Championship (Meri) and · 10K 
(Women.) Coventry, ,England .. Cori­
tact: Eric Horswm, "Pevensey," 79, 
Enville Road, Wall Heath, Brierley 
Hill ~ West Midlands . .DY6 07X. . , 

Sun. Oct . .. 28. Natio·nal AAJJ 
Masters. 15K Cross-country Cham­
pionships ; Ne"Y York City. Contact: 
Kurt Steiner, 1660 E. - 21 St., NYC 

: 11210 .. · 

Sun. Nov. · 4: . National AAU 
Masters a~d 40K Walk Champion-
ships, West LongBranch, N.J. ' 

SOn. Nov. 11. National AAU 
Masters. 10K Cross-country, Bel­
mont, Calif. ContaCt: Roger Bryan, 
950 E. Hillsdale #210, Foster City, 
Ca. 94404. . -

Sat. Nov. 17. National AAU 
50-mile open and Masters Track 
Championships, Los Angeles. Con-. 
tact: Tom Sturak, Box 1602, Santa 
Monica , Calif. 90406. 

Sat. Nov. 24. National AAU 5K 
Cross-country Championships, San 
Diego, Cal. · Contact: Ken Bernard 
xl o AAu, - 1124 Garnet, San Dieg~ 
92109. 

Sat . . Dec. 1 and Sun. Dec. 2. 
Glendale College Decathlon Cham­
pionships (Open & Master~), Glen­
dale, Calif. Contact: John Tansiey, 
Glendale College, 1500 N. Verdugo 
Rd., Glendale, Ca. 91203. 

Sat. Dec. 8. Weightman's ~enta~ 
t~loil - . Championships . (Open & 
Masters); Glendale College, Contact: 
John Tansley, above. 

Sun. Dec. 16. National AAU OPen 
and Masters 3SK Walk Champion­
slijps; Houston, Texas. 

Sat: · Dec. 29. Holiday Weight 
Pentathlon, Univ. of Florida. ContaCt 
Roy Benson , Univ. Athletic Assn., 
Box 14485, Gainesville, Fla. 32604. 

Sat. Dec. 29 and Sun. Dec. 30. 
Hawaiian Senior Olympics. Contact: 
J.P. Kai:bens, 3140 Waialae Ave., 
Honohilu,. Hi. 96816. . 

Sun .. Jan. 27, 1980 National AAU ­
Masters Marathon Championships, 
Saratoga, Ca. (Paul Masson Mara­
thon). Contact: Dan O'Keefe, 20032 -
Rodrigues, Cupertino, Ca. 95014. 

New age records set in_,worl~ meet 
~ .. • ( -, " . • ~ o· • ~ • • 

The following .new woI'ldmen's 
5-year division age records were set 
at the 3rd World Veterans Track & 
Field Championships in Hannover, 
Germany. 

Listed are the division, event, 
name of the new record holder, 
country, mark, followed by the 
name of the previous record -holder, 
his mark and the date set. 
40-44 
Javelin, Urs Von Wartburg, 
Switzerland, 259' 11/4", Urs Von 
Wartburg, 258'1" , 8/ 10177 
400H, Leon Hacker, South 
Africa, 54.08 , Noel Clough, 54.3, 
8/ 11 177. 

4x400 relay, Burger, Grujic, 
Mathe, Hacker, South Africa, 3:23 :8, 

· previous record not listed. 
· A5-49 
, IIOH Valbjoern Thorlaksson, 

Iceland, 14.86, Jack Greenwood, 
· 15.0,9/1 4172. 

SO-54 
400, Peter Higgins, Great Britain, 
52 .26, J ack Greenwood, 52.9, · 
R) IO / 77 . . 

3000SC, Arthur Taylor, Canada·, 
10:18.1, Arthur Taylor, 10:18.6, no 
date. 
Jav., Veikko Jaranainen, Finland, 
184'3% " ., Jaranainen, 183', 8/ 12177. 
TJ, Carlos Vera-Gua·rdia, Venezuela, 
42'9" , Tom Patsalis, 40'9" ~ 6129175. 
55-59 
3000SC, Eligio Gali,cia, Mexico, 
10:39.0, Eligio Galicia, 11 :05.8, 
4/ 1/79. 
60-64 
800, John Gilmour, Australia, 2:19.3, 
Ray Gordon, 2:19.9, 8/ 5178 . . 
1500, Gilmour, 4:32.5, Don 
Longnecker, 4:49.8,6/ 24178. 
5000, Gilmour, 16:54.9, Erich 
Kruzycki, 17:23:0,9 / 9173. , 
10,000, Gilmoqr, Australia , 35:07.7, 
Clive Davies, 35:19.8, 8/ 19178. 
3000SC, Olle Evland, Sweden, 
11 :41.6, Elvland, 1]:52.0. 
65-69 
200, Yngve Brange, Sweden, 27.24 , 
Harry Koppel, 27.5 , 7/ 8178. 
40(\ Brange, 63.]9, Koppel, 63.88, 
7/ 8/79. 

'-

. ' 

400H, George Bracelarid, USA, 
73.22, Bud 'Deacon, 73,7, 7/2/ 77. 
HJ, Richard o 'Rafferty , Ireland, 
4;9%", Ivan Sand, 4'9 1/4",8/8177 
LJ, Willi Rumig, Germany, 16'1[", 
John Satti, 16'1.",5112/ 79. 
Shot, ·Konstanty Maksirpczyk, Great 
Britain, 45'3 1/4", James York, 44'5", 
1017178.- , . 

Discus, Maksimczyk, 165'5", Olav 
Reppen, 157'4",8 / 10177. 
Hammer, Aarne Miettinen, Finland, 
140' 1/4", Reppen, 137'7",9125178. 
n: Heikki Simola, Finland, 35'6%", 
Ivar Sand, '34' 4 J/4 ",9113178. 
70-74 _ 
100, Frederick Reid, South Africa, 
13.80, Joe Packard, 13,9,8/9177. 
200, Reid, 28.62, Packard, 29.2, 
8/ 10177 . 
Discus, Felix Eratisquin, Spain, 
I3Q' 1/ 2 "; Verner Andersson, 128'4", 
9/ 16178. . 
LJ ,Josef Sapimann, Germany, 15', 
Tormond Resell , 14'7 112" ,9/ 14178. 
75-7~ - . 

400H, Herb Anderson ; USA, 90.65, 
Herb Anderson, 92.5, 8/ 11177. 
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American winners at Hannover 

Here are the American medal 
winners in the 3rd World Veterans . 
T&F Championship~. The list is 95'% 
complete. A few results are missIng. 
WR-denotes world division record . 
AR-denotes American division 
record. 

The listing is in this or.der:division, 
event, name and mark. 

G.OLD MEDALISTS . 

M40 
800, Ernie Billups, 1:56.6 

M45 
100 Lloyd RiddiCk, 11.25 
200. Riddick, 23.55 
HJ Rich Richardson, 5'111/. " 
M50 
IIOH, Jack Greenwood, 15.94 
800. Dean Smith, 2:03.5 
400H, Greenwood, 59.04 
4x400 relay (Dean Smith, 56. 7;. Bob 
Sieben. 55.5; Ozzie Dawkins, 54.5; 
Jack Greenwood, 54.2) 3:40.9 
Hammer. Bob Backus, 157'91/2 " 
M55 
400H. Bob Hunt 64.92 ~ 
LJ. Tom Patsalis, 19'41/4" 
Pole vault. Dave Brown. 10'2" 
Shot. William Walmroth , 46'10 Ih" 
M60 
IIOR A. Guidet. 19.81 
400H. Guidet, 70.78 
Pole vault. Jim Vernon, 10'6". 
Pen., Bill · Morales, ~846 pts : 

- ----..'iL2' M65 ., 
800. Bi~.~A~d~~g, 2,:30~ ,k " .' ' .f 

400H,.George Braceland, 73.22WR 
3000SC. Bob Boal , 13:22.2 
M70 
Jav Emery Curtice. 121'51/2 " 
4x400 relay (Anderson, Fairbanks, 
Madden. Chapson) 5:14.9 
3000SC. Walt Frederick, 17:24.9 
M75 
200. Herb Anderson, 32.92 
400H. Anderson, 90 .65WR 
IIOH. Anderson. 27.15 
400. Harold Chapson. 73.78 
Pentathlon. Anderson. 2430 pts. 
Shot. Stan Herrmann. 35'101/ 2" 
Discus. Herrmann. 9910" . 
800. Harold Chapson. 2:46.3 

1500. Harold Chapson, 5:.43.0 
Marathon. Lou Gregory , 4:14:12 ' 
H.J. Herb Anderson. 4")1/4 " 
LJ. Konrad Boas. 11'9 ~ " . 
TJ. Herb Anderson. 24'7 1/2 " 
Jav .. Herb An'derson. 90'8 1/4" 
Pen , Anderson, 2430 pts. 
Shot, Stan Herrmann; 3S'10 Ii 2" 
HT. Herrmann, 99' 10" 
800, Chapson, 2:46.3 . 

W40 .. 
100, Cherrie Sherrarq, ~2.'78 I 

5000, Miki Gorman, 17:39.2 . 
10.000, Miki Gorman, 36:2L9 
Xc. Linda SippreHe. 43:00.9 . 
Marathon. Miki Gorman,: 2:54:).0 :· 
W45 
5000, D9rot~y .Stock,. I·I):)? 9 
100. Irene Obera. 12:62AR 
Xc. Dorothy Stock, 44:39.1 
Marathon. Nikki Hobson, 3:12:08", 
W50 
XC, Ruth Anderson. 44:32.1 .: 
Jav .. Shirley Kinsey, 77'2"AR 
XC Team. Ruth' Anderson. 1 st; · 

. , 

Marcia Spaeth , 5th; Anne Noble, 
10th. 

. Mar.athon, Ruth Anderson·,.3: 15:32 . 
W65 I 

Discus. Dorothy Herrmann, 43'4 1;4" 

- S.ILVER. MEDALISTS 

. M~.o 
.PV , Henry Davenport, 12'51/2 ~ ' 

LJ , .AI Henry, 21 '71/4 " 
20 Km. Walk, Ron Laird, 1:34:.14.4 
llOH Al Henry 15.59 

M45 
100, Marion Sanchez, 11.35 

.' 

200. Sanchez. 23.65 
HJ, Nick Newton , 5'11 1/4" 
10,000 . Hal Higdon , 32:32 .0 
3000SC. Higdon, 9:55 
TJ . Dave Jackson, 43'3" 
LJ. Jackson, 20' 1/ 2 " 

M50 
200, Jack Greenwood, 24:23 
JH. Spotswood Hall, 5 '41/2'" 
4xlO0 Relay (Green , Schuler, 
Dawkins, Greenwood) 46.78 
TJ, Novica Milicevic, 38'3 " 
400, Jack Greenwood, 53.52 
M55 
400H, Ray Spencer, 68.95 

Ernie Billups leads jn the 800 at the 
World G;:tmes , enroute to his gold 
medal in 1 :56.6. Photo by Bob Pates. 

400. Bob Hunt. 59.70 
IIOH . Tom Patsalis. 18.46 
M60 
Hammer. Tom McDermott, 137'2 3/4" 
Jav .. Bill Morales . 159'31/4 " 
Marathon , Jim Olesson , 2:59:09 
4xl00 Relay (Killion, Guidet. 
Fairbank. Morales) 59.98 
PV. Orval Gillett. 10' 
M65 
400R Bud Deacon. 77.3 
5000, Ed Stotsenberg, 18:44.3 
1500. Stotsenberg, 5:08.1 
Pen. , George Braceland, 3278 pts. 
Hammer, Nolan Fowl.er, 123'4" 
M70 
TJ, Homer VanGelder, 26'3~" 
4xl00 Relay (Madden, Anderson, 
Boas, Chapson) 65.90 .· , 
110H, Walt Frederick, 24.21 
M75 
100, Herb Anderson, 15.60 

continued 



continued 

200, Konrad Boas, 33 .65 
HJ, Boas, 3 '7 1;4" 
400H, Walt Frederick, 93.55 
Hammer, Stan Herrmann, 89'21/ 2" 
T J. Konrad Boas, 20' 43/4" 
400, Herb Anderson, 74.04 
Pen. Konrad Boas, 1666 pts. 
800. Herb Anderson, 3:13.0 
W40 
Sooo Walk, Lori Maynard, 26:10.2 
Marathon (team) 1. Miki Gorman, 
2:54:10; 6. Donna Gookin, 3:17:21; ~ 
14. Linda Sipprelle, ' 
3:40:10-9:53:41. 
W45 
200. Irene Obera, 26.41 
400, Obera, 61.69AR 
W50 
5000, Ruth Anderson, 20:15.9AR 
W55 
400. Martha Fairbank, 89.46 
W60 
100. Josephine Kolda, 17.11 
200, Kolda, 35.74 

BRONZE MEDALISTS 

M40 
10Km. Walk, Ron Laird. 45:48.7 

M45 
100, Nick Newton, 11.65 
200" Newton, 23.68 
PV, Vic Cook, 13'11/2" 
400H, Leon Trout, 61.83 
HJ, Herm Wyatt, 5'10" 
M50 
800, Kelsey Brown, 2:05.3 
LJ, Novicia Milicevic, 19' 11/2" 
M55 
Discus, William Walmroth, 
139'1 I;''' 
3000SC, Avery Bryant 11:17.8 
TJ, Dave Brown, JS'101/4" 
1l0H, Bob Hunt, 19.74 
M60 
Discus, Tom McDermott, 146'8" 
100, Clarence Killion, 13.12 
200, Killion, 27.42 

, 4x400 Relay, (Killion, Deacon, Bill 
Fairbank, Henry Fairbank) 4:25.9 
400, Henry Fairbank, 62.94 
M65 ' 
400H, Claude Hills, 79.57 
10,000, Ed Stotsenberg, 39:43.6 
Pole Vault, Blid Deacon, 8'21;4" 
1500, Bill Andberg, 5: 11.6 
Pen. , Claude Hills, 3263 pts. 
M70 
800, Paul Fairbanks, 2:49.1 
3000SC, Paul Carmichael, 18:40.3 
400, Paul Fairbank, 78.64 
M75 ' / 
XC, Lou Gregory, 53:29.0 
100. Knorad Boas, 15.97 
LJ, Herb Anderson, 10'8" 
W40 
SP. Cherrie Sherrard, 35'81/2" 

, 200, Sherrard, 27.01 
'XC, Sue Trees-Stricklin, 49:28.5 
W4S 
200; Gretchen Snyder, 28.87 
W~S 
XC, Els Tuinzing, 58:38.8 
W60 
400, 'Cathy Hargus, 88.86AR 
5000, Hargus, 26:10.7 

fp'rinted with permission of Running 
Times] 
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12th World Veterans Road Running 
Championshi'ps from Bolton', E~gland 

By TOM STURAK 

The 12th World Veterans Road 
Running Championships attracted 
some 1500 competitors from 30 
countries, but only 10 were American 
'Masters (see "Open Letter," 
following this article). Runners 
ranging in age from 35 (the 
internationaUower limit for women) 
to over 80 Game to England from 
South Korea and South Africa, New 
Zealand and Venezuela, and nations 
in between, including Guyana and 

1 Romania, t6 race ," against their 
age-group peersov~r~ 10Km. 'and 25 
Km. 

Among the 791 finishers in the first 
day 's larger 10KI1l. ra'ce, English arid ' 
German runners dominated indiv­
idual standings, . the latter taking 
three women's titles and. scoring 
heavily in the over-60 categories. But 
local hero Michael Freary (40) was 
the big winner in 30 minutes ~ 'dead" 
(an- Anglicism-for-~f1at") over the 
single-loop course that featured three 
fair hills (the two steepest grades 
coming in the final 4Km.) and 'a 
quarter-mile finish over , a turf 
athletics 'grounds. 

A former cross-coupg-y in.tePlat­
ionalist and ' holder of the British 
Veterans 10,OOOm track record (29:33 
on cinders), Freary won handily over 
compatriots David Turner (30:55) and 
Fred Pendlebury (31:03), the three 
giving Great Britain the "Country" 
team championship by a big' margin 
over Ireland and Australia. The 
English over-SO team similarily 

- trounced Canada and Belgium, with 
the . top three individual finishers 
placing 34th through 36th overall 
inside of ten seconds (33:j9~3:48). ' 

The outstanding individua.1 Ameri­
can performer was Ruth Anderson, 
just days shy of turning SO, who won 
the 45-49 category-as she did the 
next day in the 2SKm. Only three 
other competitors (all males) took 
back-to-back championships. Highest 
placing among U.S. men was Jim 

. Oleson's second in the 10Km 60-65 
division. Suzanne Trees-Strickland 
placed third ' in the 40-44 category. 
Partially sighted Norman Bright, who 
was guided through both races, did 
best in the 10Km with a respectable 
43:38-good for seventh among 43 
65-69 finishers. 

Both races were well-organized, 
except for a chaotic start of the 10Km 
remml~cent of the "voluntary 
'seeding" nonsystem employed by 
some U.S. race directors. (At one 
point, a harried official bullhorned 

. "Please, move back of the start line: 
This is the world championships, not 
some bloody interscholastics ' 
match!" At the gun, as the shuffling, 
shoving mass lurched forward, one 
competitor's false teeth clattered to 
the pavement.) Also. though each 
kilometer was clearly marked, no 
split times were given. The weather 
both days-overcast, blustery, 

threatening rain and unseasonably 
cold-proved almost ideal conditions. 

In the 2SKm Freary proved (in the 
words of a fellow Englishman) that 
"he is ~till a class runner," winning 
comfo,rtably by over two minutes 

65-69 : 
Hildegard Keuchel (Ger.) 56:37 
Leni Schuberack (Ger.) 63:33 
70-over ' 
Justin,e Bucher (Ger.) 65:06 

from a fresh John Robinson (40) of Men 
New Zealand and, in storybook style, 
leading the Bolton United Harriers to 40-44 
the club championships contested by Michael Freary (GB) 30:00 
38 teams (31 English). A clubmate David Turner (GB) 30:35 
and competitive peer of Ron Hill's , Fred Pendlebury (GB) 31:03 
Freary, though never in the 
international limelight, is a living 45-49 
legend among English roadracers Michael Barratt (GB) 32:24 ' 
(who; in toto , may be the . world's Ronald Allen (GB) 32:29 
best). Here, the day ' after ' racing Richard ~alding (GB), 32'.55 ' 
10Km at' 4:49/ mi.he cruised 5:09 19th place, Tom Sturak(US}.3S:S0 
pace for lS.Smi., his - right thigh- SO-54 ' 
limbs thin and harc:i as split-oak Hugh Foord (GB) 33:39 
railings-tightly banoaged, painter's Ronald Franklin (GB) 33:46 
cap closely pulled aslant, relentlessly William Marshall (GB) 33:48' 
pulling away from Robinson (who two 55-59 . 
weeks earlier in . Brugge, Belgium, Edwar? Joynson (G~) 35:08 
had narrowly beaten Ron Hill-in his GerI?am J.ean-Baptlste (Fr.) 35:11 

~r.st_Masters:only race=-at2SKm. in ___ FI~nan LeItner (Austria) 35:54 
1 :20-and-change). 61>-64 

Again led by Freary, Great Britain John Gilmour (Australia) 35:05 
won the 40-49 -as well as the James Oleson (U.S.) 38:38 
SO-over -national team champion- . Gottfried Beck (Switz.) 39:24 
ships. In the younger category, 65-69. .,' " . 
how~ver. the United States trio of Joe H. 1 MIC on F. 41 :24 
Burgasser, (40), Alan Dirkin (40), and Enc~ Pa~l~k( er.) 41:51 . 
John Rudberg (45), came through DaVId Momson.(GB) ~2:3'4 ' 
with a strong second-place finish 7th, Norman BrIght (U.S.) 43:48 
ahead of Germany, Ireland, Australia 7~-74.. . 
and four other national teams. All Ktzoshl Kmchl (Jap.) 43:29 
members of the Seniors Track Club of Jupp Berg (Ger.) 43:36 
Los Angeles, they also placed third in Arno Rudnick (Ger.) 44:06 
the tougher club ~ompetition-the 75-~9 , 
highest finish of only seven LOUIS Charbonneau '(Fr.r 48:45 
nonEnglish teams. Individually, Alfred AI~haus (Ger.) 51:59 
Rudberg finished best among his Robert Wtseman (GB) 55:12 
peers, placing eighth among 177 80-over 
45-49 finshers. ' Josef Galia(Ger.) 55:00 

RESULTS 

10Km, July 21,791 finishers 

Women 

35-39 
Valerie HQwe (GB), 36:20 
Bridget Cushen (GB) 38:16 
Marianne Buttner (Ger.) 38:21 
40-44 
Sigrid Sucker (Ger.) 39:25 
Denise Alfvoet (Bel.) 39:46 
Suzanne Trees-Strickland (US) 41: 10 
45-49 
Ruth Anderson (US) 41:36 
Edith Holdener (Switz.) 43:27 
Hazel Rider (GB) 43:48 
SO-54 
Tetusko Nakagawa (Jap.) 48:ST 
Gitta Grunberg (Ger.) 49:02 
Margret Reidt (Ger.) 50:54 ' 
55-59 
Georgina Descamps (Bel.) 48:33 
Liselotte Schule (Ger;) 54:24 ' 
Johanna Grelle (Ger,) 55:46 · 
60-64 
E. Tromp (NL) 53:14 
Elisabeth Haule (Ger.) 54:21 
Anneliese Krempel (Ger.) 65:56 

Monji Takazoe (Jap.) 70:34 
Hermann Petzoldt (Ger.) 71 :06 

Teams 
Country 
40-49 
Great Britain 1 :31 :38 
Ireland 1 :40: 11 
Australia 1:41:18 
SO-over 
Great Britain 1:41:13 
Canada 1 :49:01 . 
Belgium 1 :49:56 
Club 
40-49 
Harrogate A.C. 1:37:55 
Manchester Harriers A.e. 1 :38:08 
Bolton United Harriers 1 :38:55 
SO-over 
Cambridge Harriers 1 :53:31 
Canadian Masters 1:57:08 
Wirral A.C. 1:57:53 

2SKm July 22 (632 finishers) 

Men " 

40-44 
Michael Freary (GB) 1 :20:07 
John Robinson (NZ) 1 :22:26 

continued 



, 
f 

page 6 National Masters Newsletter 

continued 

Richard Cooper (GB) 1:23:35 
45-49 
William Stoddart (GB) 1 :26:08 
Thompson Gamble (GB) 1:26:34 
Alan Hughes (GB) 1:28:32 
50-54 
Arthur Taylor (Can.) 1 :27:21 
Ronald Franklin (GB) 1 :29:29 
Andre Monnot (Fr.) 1 :30:03 
55-59 
Edward Joynson (GB) 1 :33:55 
John Brent-Jones (GB) 1:35:32 
Reginald Ferneyhough (GB) 1 :37: 11 
48th place, Verp Whiteside (U.S.) 
2:06: 19 
60-64 
Lim Bong YO!1g (Korea) 1:42:16 
Lee Deok Kyu (Kor.) 1 :43:47 
Robert McMinnis (GB) 1:44:08 
6th , Ed Lowell (U.S .) 1:50:09 
65-69 
Gordon Porteous (GB) 1 :42:06 
Henri Michon (Fr.) 1:45:15 
Samuel Lee (GB) 1 :55:50 
16th, Norman Bright (U .S.) 2:11:43 
70-74 
Arno Rudnick (Ger.) 1:56:59 
Henri Bastien (Bel.) 2:03:44 
Kurt Kristahn (Ger.) 2:06:24 
75-79 
Friedrich Tempel (Ger.) 2:06:15 
Koichi Oshima (Jap.) 2:22:48 
Georg Cochius (Ger.) 2:30:33 
80-over 
JosefGalia(Ger.) 2:32:12 
Arthur Frey (Switz.) 2:49:48 
Hermann Petzoldt (Ger.) 3:32:52 

Women 

35-39 
Ichiko Hokazono(Jap .) 1:39:26 
Bridget Cushen (GB) 1:42:54 
Anne Bland (GB) 1 :46:01 
40-44 
Denise Alfvoet (Be\.) 1 :43:08 

Brenda Cook (GB) 1:45:03 
'Kazuko Ebata (Jap .) 1 :46:07 
45-49 
Ruth Anderson (U.S.) 1:49:09 
Bettz Norrish (GB) 1:54:14 
Edith Holdener (Switz.) 1 :55:27 
50-54 
Resi Vaupel (Ger.) 2:14:14 
Anneliese Landwehr (Ger.) 2:29:47 
Paulette Rembes (Fr.) 2:32:15 
65-69 
Marie Lynnerup (Denmark) 2: 12:09 

Teams 

Country ' 
40-49 
Great Britain 4:07:58 
U S.A. 4:27:30 
Germany 4:30:58 

; 50-over 
Great Britain 4:30:40 
Canada 4:43:59 

. France 4:49:20 
Club 
40-49 
Bolton United Harriers 4: 15:22 
Worcester A.C. 4:27:12 
Seniors Track Club, Los Angeles 
4:27:30 
50-over 
Thames Valley Harriers 4:42:56 . 
East Cheshire Harriers A.C. 5: II :38 
Canadian Masters 5:14:36 

An open letter to the Masters 
Long-Distance Running Committee' 

By TOM STURAK 

[Reprinted by permission of Running 
Times] 

At the recent World Veterans Road 
Running Championships held in 
Bolton , England, 1. became t he first 
U.S. finisher-97th among 791-in 
the 10Km. race with a 35:50 clocking, 
a fact that I personally found absurd 
and embarrassing. Enroute to race 
800m and 1500m in the 3rd World 
Veterans Track &: Field Champion­
ships in ' Hannover, W. Germany 
(July 27-Aug. 2) , I was using this 
road race strictly as . training-but 
had hoped perhaps to contribute to 
the U. S. 40-49 team effort. As it was, 
my sole male compatriots were Jim 
Oleson-who, racing seriously and 
well, placed second in the 60-64 
category (38:38)- and the courage­
ous partially sighted Norman Bright, 
who, guided by his young compan­
ion, finished seventh among 65-69-
year-olds with 43 :48. - . _ 

Oleson's success-and the victor­
ies in both races by Ruth 
Anderson-indicate how well other 
top U.S. long-distance runners might 
have fared at. Bolton had they been 
informed of this opportunity-or 
even helped-to compete against 
their foreign peers . Of the nearly 
1500 entrants from 30 countries 
competing in 17 5-'year age categories 
from 35 (for women) through 80 and 
over, only 8 men and 2 women came 
from the United States. By 
comparison , Australia and Japan 
were both represented by at least 20 
runners, and New Zealand, South 
Africa and South Korea by 10 or 
more. Even an 'Iron Curtain" 
contingent from Czechoslovakia, 
Romania and Yugoslavia outnumber­
ed the U.S. entry. 

Americans like Oscar Moore and 
Herb Lorenz, Miki Gorman and Linda 
Sipprelle, Ray Hatton and Toshiko 
D'Elia, Margaret Miller and Alex 
Ratelle, Clive Davies and Grace 
Switzer, Monty Montgomery and 
Paul Spangler, et al. can run with the 
best in the world in their respective 
age divisions. The Bolton road races 
would seem to have been a natural 
stop-over for the scores of U.S. 
distance runners headed for Hann­
over (as were several of the 
above-named), especially since those 
championships included, in addition 
to the usual longer track events: a 
lOKm. cross-country race (July 29) 
and a marathon (August 2). 

Why; then were not scores of 
Americans at Bolton? My own 
personal "poll" taken in the last 
weeks before coming abroad and 
since being here indicates that I) the 
12th annual World Veterans Road 
Running Championships-the long­
est standing Masters athletics 
competition in the world-was one of 
the best-kept secrets in the United 

States, and 2) many who did 
know-or found out late-of the 
road championships simply could not 
afford the trip (even if coming to 
Hannover). 

In part, the organizers of the 
Bolton championships are perhaps at 
fault for not advertising in American 
running periodicals. Instead, they 
seemed to have relied primarily on a 
selective mailing of entry forms to 
American Masters better-known on 
the international scene-and entries 
closed on May 31. 

But to a great extent, the blame 
must lie with those in control of the 
National AAU Masters Long-Dis­
tance Running Committee and their 
counterparts within the RRC of 
America. Surely some of those 
officials knew about Bolton. But the 
former body apparently exists solely 
(in the words of its immediate past 
chairman) "to set policy" (e.g., t6 
harass the U.S. cross-country .and 
marathon entrants at Hannov.er into 
getting Travel Permits, despite the 
fact . that t he track -and field 
competitors needn't have ..!hem) and 
not to provide essential serviceli7in­
cluding notices of championshipSr-to 
its estimated 12,000 registered 
runners. For its -part, the American 
RRC (despite its English heritage) 
seems philosophically provincial and 
not particularly responsive to the 
phenomenon of increasing participa­
tion by Masters in LD running. 
(When's the last time anyone heard 
of an RRC Masters championship 
race?) 

If the breakdown of entries in the 
past two Boston Marathons are any . 
indication, Masters athletes probably 
constitute nearly a third of the total 
LDR competitors in the United 
States . Like all other runners, these 
men and women pay entry fees to 
sanctioned races and dues to AAU 
and RRC-registered clubs and to 
AAU-district associatrons. 

Reportedly, the National AAU LDR 
Committee's treasury now exceeds 
$6000.00-yet that committee neither 
publishes a newsletter nor provides 
financial assistance to send top 
athletes to national or international 
championships. (Its conduct as host 
of the 2nd U.S.-Canada Cross-Coun­
try Match in Seattle last November 
was embarrassingly tawdry.) Both 
services would seem to me proper 
uses ' of those mouldering funds . As 

, for the RRC, to my knowledge, only 
the New York chapter has helped 
(two) Masters runners with travel 
expenses to international races. 

Masters athletes' from other 
countries-e.g. , Canada, Sweden, 
South Africa, Japan, Belgium, 
Mexico~routinely receive financial 
support from their respective athle­
tics federations. Ironically,' Canada, ' 
South Africa and Belgium have even 
paid travel expenses for U.S . Masters 
to 'compete in those countries. 

At Bolton, the only full U.S. club 
team was the Seniors Track Club of 
Los Angeles. That team received no 
official (i.e., AAU) support, but 
instead were sent all-expenses-paid 
as its prize for winning the Masters 
division of the 20Km . "NIKE/ U.S. 
Club Roadracing Championships" 
this past April in Atlanta. (The 
Southern Pacific Association AAU 
did provide STC partial expenses to 
that event.) ' These three runners­
members of one of the .largest clubs 
in the United States-learned of the 
Bolton championships and received 
their entry forms from a NIKE 
representative. Running the race of ' 
their lives, they placed seco1).d to 
Great Britain in the "Country" 
competition-as the United States 
team, and finished third in the 
"Club" competition against 37 other 
teams from a dozen nations . 

So that if it weren't for the singular 
generosity of an A,merican sportshoe 
company, and , the outstanding 
performances of a California-based 
team comprised of three Amedcan 
citizens (one .a naturalizecrBritisher 
at that), the United State_s would not 
have beep represented in the team 
standings at the WVRR Champion­
ships at all. 

For the record, let it be, known that 
the 13th WVRR Championships at 
10Km. and Marathon will be held 
23-24 August, 1980, in Glasgow, 
Scotland. Address all correspon­
dence: The Organising Committee, 
1980 World Veterans Events, 
Scottish Amateur Athletic Associa­
tion, 16 Royal Crescent, Glasgow G3 
7SL, Scotland. 

In addition to the usu,al individual 
five-year categories (40 through 
80-plus for men; 35 through 70-plus ' 
for women), "Nation team events 
will be held in each (race) and for all 
categories subject to entry." A 
"subsidiary friendship jog for 
veterans, family, friends and sup­
porters" will also be staged "over a 
pleasant 8-kilometers trail." 

Come on AAU andRRC, why not 
reward some of the top individuals or 
teams in your respective Masters 
national championships (or desig­
nated trials) at the 10Km. and the 
Marathon with travel, expenses to 
Glasgow? These talented and 
dedicated athletes set an example 
and help to inspire literally tens of 
thousands of Americans of all ages to 
pursue healthful and fulfilling 
competitive goals. They are the peak 
of the pyramid, the service and care 
of which is your reason for .being. 

Also, if nothing else, please get the ' 
word out. I 

, Sincerely, 
Tom Sturak 



12th annual N'ational AAU Masters 
Track and Field Championships 

GRESHAM, OREGON, july 6-8. In 
the August ·issue of NMN, we 
highlighted the National Masters 

:' Track & Field Championships. In this 
issue are the complete results. 

A summary of events and 
outstanding performances by divis­
ions: 

MEN 

30-34. Hilliard Sumner of Wood­
land Hills, California, won the 100 
and 400 (48.07), and took 2nd in the 
200 and 800. Both Sumner and Mike 
Marbut of Seattle leaned into the 
tape in the, 100 in 10.94, with Hilliard 
getting the judges' nod. Ruben 
Whitney of San Antonio, Texas, 
successfully defended his 200 
championship, edging Sunner, 21.80 
to 21.85. 

Steve Waggener of Santa Barbara, 
California, won the 1500 and 5000. 
Mat Pruitt won the 400-hurdles in 
55.85 after a strong 48.41 2nd ) n the 
400. 

Carl Flowers of Northridge, CaL, 
won both the jumps, while Fred 
Johnston of Foster City, Cal. , nabbed 
the shot and discus. 

35-39. Walt Butler of Altadena, 
Cal. . kept his 3-year undefeated 
s treak intact by successfully defend­
ing his national championship in the 
100. 200 and 1I0-hurdles. Dave 
Romain won the 400 in 49.66, close to 
Hnn Whitney' s division record of 
~K, 9. Ralpb Lee of Los Angeles edged 
Romain in a fast 800, 1 :53.8 to i :54.8. 

Jack Petty of Odessa , Texas, took 
the 1500 in 4:02.2 . Harvey Franklin of 
Canada outdueled George Conefrey 
of Eugene, Oregon, in the 5000 in 

15:20.5 with Conefrey winning the 
10K in ~2:04.5. 

Doug Wells of Taft, Calif. , tripled 
with wins in the Javelin , Shot and 
Discus . -

40-44 . American 400 record holder 
Gary Miller of Glendale, Calif. , won 3 
events-the 400, 400-hurdles and 
200. 

Chicago's Ernie Billups set 2 
American records in the 40-44 
ca tegory with a 1 :55.96 in the 800 and 
4:03.33 in the 1500. 

Earl Ellis of Seattle won tne 5000 in 
15:34.9 and 10,000 in 33:00.8. Ron 
La ird won both walks, while 11 other 
me n each won single victories in a 
\Try competitive division. 

45-49 . Lancaster, California ' s per­
cy Knox won the 100. Inglewood, 
California ' s Nick Newton took the 
400. Knox and Newton met in the 

Postal Relay' Champio'nshi'ps 

The National AAV Postal Relay 
Championships for Masters 
are sponsored by Occidental Life 
Insurance Company of North 
Carolina, Financial Fitness, Inc., and 
the AAV National Masters Track & 
Field Committee. 

The following relays will be held in 
two age divisions: Divis.ion 1 (40-49) 
& Div~sion 2 (50+) 44,0,880,1 mile, 2 
mile" ' 4 mile , ' sprint medley 
(440-220-220-880); distance medley 
(V4 mile , 440, 880, 1 mile.) All 
distances will be in yards . There will 
also be an age group medley at 4 x 
440 with a leadoff of a 40-49·year-old ; 
2nd leg 50-59-year-old; 3rd leg 
40-49-year-old; anchor leg 60+. 

These relays can be run as part of 
any track meet or on a time trial 
basis . We will operate on the honor 

system. The following rules will 
prevail: " 
1. All times must be run from April 
15 to Sept. 15. 
2. An individual can run in more than 
one relay but not more than once in 
any . one relay event. (Example : a 
competitor can run the 440 in the mile 
relay, spring medley, distance 
medley and the age-medley, but can 
not run in more than one mile relay, 
sprint medley, etc.). 
3. An athlete can go down in age but 
not up in age. A Division 2 athle~e 
can compete in a Division 1 relay but 
a Division 1 athlete can not compete 
in a division 2 event. 
4. For the 440 and 880-yard relays, if 
400 meters & 800 meters are run 
instead, an adjustment in the time 

will be made. 
5. A separate entry form must be 
used for ead i relay. 

NO ENTRY FEES: (Thanks to the 
sponsorship of Occidental Life-Finan­
cial Fitness). 
PRIZES: Official A.A.V. National 
Championship medals will be given 
to the first three teams in each relay 
plus A.A. V. National Championship 
Masters Team patches to the winning 
teams . 
PROCEDVRE TO ENTER: John 
MacLachlan will coordinate these 
postal championships . All entries 
must be received by Oct . 1. The 
prizes will be mailed to the team 
director. All team members must be 
registered in the A.A.V. 

- - - --- ----------- - --------- - -
RELAY EVENT ________ _ TEAM NAME ___________ _ 

TEAM MEMBERS: 

NAME AlJlJRE SS 

" 1 stieg AGE AAU 1/ 

NAME ABDRESS 

2nd leg AGE : AAUII 

NAME ADDRES S 

3rd leg AGE: AAU II 

NAME ADDRESS 

4th leg AGE: AAU II 

TIME : TIME OF EACH LEG(OPTlONAL) ___ - - --
~\J\ 1 Ll Nr. AlJlJRESS FOR PRI ZE: NAME_-:--_-:--:-_--'-___ AlJDRESS 
We certify that th , ' abov,e is a true time. 

rEAM »] RECTOR ' :CHIEF ;nME A!JlJRESS.~_-__:~ 

Mail entry form to JOHN MacLACHLAN, HORSESHOE BAY, !lOX 7770 ; MARBLE FALLS, TEXAS 78654 
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100. with Newton winning it in 23.69. 
Newton was only a half-second away 
from Dick Stolpe's world 400 mark 
(51. 7) with a 52.26. . . 

John Weldy of Scottsdale, Arizona, 
garnered the 800 and 1500. 

Ray Hatton of Bend, Oregon, set a , 
new American record in the 5000 in 
15:35:5. outgunning Hal Higdon of 
Michigan City, Indiana, in a classic 
dU,el. 

Higdon won the Steeplechase in 
10:20. 

The great Jack Foster of New 
Zealand flew over for the meet to 
lap everyone with a 30:47.8 
hreathtaking performance in the 
10.000. After a 4:54 first mile by both ' 
Foster and Hatton , Jack settled into 
a series of consistent 75-second 
quarters" with Hatton running 
equally consistent 78's. 

Van Parish of Menlo Park, 
Califor'nia, win both hurdles and Bob 
Fine of New York City took both 
walks. 

Victorville, California' s ~hirley 
Davisson notched both jumps. Vic 
Cook of Woodland Hills, Cal., pole 
vaulted to his first national title. 

Richard Richardson of Decatur, 
III. , tied his 'American mark with a 
6 '0" high jump, and won the 
Pentathlon: 

Phil Brady of Littleton, Colorado, 
copped the shot and discus titles . 

SO-54. The all-time Masters great 
Jack Greenwood of Medicine Lodge, 
Kansas, was ready, as usual, for the 
nationals. The savings and loan 
executive won the 100, 2:00,..499l ... nt. ... _ _ 
both hurdles (using the international 
heights to tune up for Hannover'.) . 

World mile and 800 record holder 
Bill Fitzgerald of Palos Verdes, 
California, after being out with 
injuries for two years, returned to the 
national scene in style with two 
triumphs in the 800 in 2:04.76 and 
1500 in 4:21.94. ' His 800 win came, 
over the toughest 800 field ever 
asse mbled, anywhere, in this 
di vision. The first 7 finishers broke 
2: 14, Dean Smith of Lombard, 
Ill inois, defending champion in the 
XOO and Gothenburg fold medalist, 
lunk the fi eld througi) a 28-sec. 200 
and 59· sec. 400 with Fitz and Kelsey 
Brown of Andover, New Jersey, the _ 
Eastern champion, right behind. 

Smith edged Brown for the place, 
2:06 .06 to 2:06.80. San Diego' s Bob 
Sieben. bronze medalist in Sweden, 
was 4th in 2:09.11 , followed by Don 
Jackson. Ian Jamison and Lake 
Oswego' s George Puterbaugh , the 
silver medalist in Sweden. 

In the 1500, Fitzgerald topped 
defending champion Brown, 4:2L94 
to 4:25.54, Brown improving on his 
1978 winning time in Atlanta. Fitz' 
mark was only 3 seconds off his 
American 1500 mark of 4:18.5. 

Jim O'Neil of Sacramento repeated 
hi s twin victories in the 5000 and 
' I (l .OOO. edging Santa Monica's Pete 
Mundie in the 10K when 'Pete, with 
;111 apparent safe lead, caught a 
hamstring cramp 10 meters from the 
tape as O'Neil'moved throu'gh on the , 
inside to win it . ' 

Bob Mimm of Willingboro, New 
Jersey, won both the walks. Harry 
Hawke of San Diego took the 
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Pentathlon, Javelin and Shot Put. Al 
Brenda from Turlock, Cal., garnered 
both jumps. 

55-59. Indestructible Avery Bryant 
of Palos Verdes, California, won 4 
events (and perhaps 5 when the 
10,000 results for this division are ' 
determined). Bryant took the 800, 
1500, 5000 and Steeple, seeming to 
get stronger as the weekend wore 
on. 

Bob Hunt of Anaheim, California, 
won both hurdles. Bob Cooper of 
Davis, Calif. , topped the 100 and 200 
fields , defeating defending champ 
Jim Upham of Junction City, Kansas. 
Upham won the 400. 

Ray Spencer of Chula Vista, Ca1., 
nabbed the long jump, triple jump 
and Pentathlon. 

60-64. Bill Bowers of Sagle, Idaho, 
won the 200 and 400 (and perhaps the ' 
100?, results are missing). Portland's 
Clive Davies established a new 
American mark of 17:27 .. 5 in' the 
5000, erasing the old mark of 17:35.0, 
set by Don Longnecker of Silver City, 
New Mexico, on June 25, 1978. 

. 35.39. Miki Hervey of Dallas took 
the 200, 400 and 800, topping 
Mountain . View. California's Miriam 
Gerard in the 400, 64:07 to 64.79. In 
the 200, Gerard was leading but 
pulled a hamstring. Gerard earlier 
won the 100 in 13.7. 

Judy Coroombridge of Seattle 
nabbed the 1500 and 5000 crowns. 

40-44 . Former Olympian Sandra 
Knott of Cleveland Heights, Ohio, 
impressively won the 1500 (4:58 .2), 
5000 (18:22.5) and 10,000 (38:05.5). 
Knott represented the U.S: in the 800 
in Tokyo in 1964. 

Christel Miller of Glendale, Calif. , 
won the long jump, triple jump, and 
javelin and tied a division American 
mark in the high jump at 4'6'.'. . 

She had to share . the mark, 
however, and even lost the gold 
medal on the basis of fewer misses, 
to newly-turned-40 Cherrie Sherrard 
of Chico, Calif. , who tied her own 
mark set on June 23. 

Sherrard won the shot. discus' and 
pentathlon. 

Almeta Parish of San Francisco . 
took the 200 and 400 . 
45-49. Irene Obera of M~raga, Calif .• 
continued her demolition of women's 
age 45-49 division records. Once 
again. she lowered her 400 record of 
64 .6 to 61. 73. 

Ruth Anderson won the 800 (Ruth 
turned SO on July 27) and Marjorie 
Fox of Smartville. Cal., took the 
javelin. shot and discus. 

SO-54. La Crescenta, California's 
Shirley Kinsey won the 200, 100. 
javelin, shotand discus, breaking her 
own division mark in the javelin with 
a 66'7" heave. 

Ellen Rose of Irvine, Cal., broke 
. her own 400 mark with a 74.81 and 
won the 1500. _ 
55-59. Edith Leiby of Honolulu won 
the 100, 200. 400,_800 and 1500 in a 
busy weekend. 

60-64. Josephine Kolda of San 
Francisco copped the 100, 200 and 
400. 

65-69. Multi-record holder PoHy 
. Clarke of Loveland, Colorado, won 

the 100, 200, '400 .and 800. 

. Santa Ana, 'California' s Bill 
. Morales won the long jump, javelin 
(Pentathlon results missing) and Reflections on the Nationals 
110-hurdles. . 

Don Johnson garnered both walks 
and Jim Vernon repeated in the pole 
vault. 

65-69. Harry Koppel of Belmont, 
Calif., won the 100, 200 and 400. He 
broke the 65-69 world 200 mark of 
27.6, held jointly by Yngve Brange of 
Sweden and John Satti of San 
Francisco, with a 27.48. In the 400, 
Koppel broke his own world mark of 
64.0 with a 63.88. 

Bill Andberg of Anoka, Minnesota, 
quadrupled with triumphs in the 800, 
1500, 5000 and 10;000. Gordon 
Wallace of Brescott, Arizona, 
notched both walks. Satti took both 
jumps. James York of Modesto, Cal. , 
win the Shot, Discus and Hammer. 

70-74. Ken Carnine of Sacramento 
took the sprints. Mel Shine of 
Lafayette, Cal.. won the 400 and 800. 
Sid Madden Of Santa Monica, Cal. , 
copped the 1500 and 5000. Win 
McFadden of San Diego notched both 
jumps. Carnine also ' won the 
Pentathlon and Discus . 

75-79. Herb Anderson of Bellevue, 
Colorado, won 10 gold medals, 
sweeping the field events and 
hurdles. He was the only competitor 
in each of the ten events. Joe Packard 
of San Francisco took the 100, 200 
and 400 in times just short of his -
world records. Harold Chapson of 
Honolulu. a perennial crowd-pleaser, 
successfully defended his national 
titles in the 800 and 1500. . 

80-84. Paul Spangler of San Luis 
Obispo. California, moved into 
Division 5 this year and kept rolling 
along with "'{ins in the 200. 1500 and 
10,000. ' 

85-89. Oldest competitor in the 
meet was Collie Wheeler. 86, of 
Portland who competed in the long 
jump and discus. 

WOMEN 

The National Masters Track and 
Field Championships never dis­
appoint. 

It's always a pleasant time for 
renewing friendships, making new 
ones and enjoying the highest quality 
of competition. -

Images: 
-Jack Foster's smooth striding ' 

around '25 laps of Mt. Hood 
Community College's good track, 
lapping two and three times some of 
the finest Masters 10.000 runners in 
the world. Even Ray Hatton finally 
succumbed with a few laps to go. 

-Foster will soon , move to 
Beaverton. Oregon, to work for Nike. 
In his New Zealand government job. 
Jack has not had the freedom to 
trave'l and compete as much as he'd 
like . Now he will. and we look 
forward to seeing hfm run in the U.S. 
We also are eager to learn his secrets 
of running and conditioning. 
, - $300 was stolen from the cash 
box of equipment receipts. Moral: 
99 % of Masters participants are 
honest. Maybe 100%. But guard 
against those who hang around . 

-For the first time in memory, a 
Masters meet ran ahead of schedule. 
At 5:15 p.m. Saturday. nine minutes 
ahead of schedule. the 45-49 men's 
800 began. Watching curiously while 
pulling on his spikes was one of the 
favorites. Gaylord Ka1chschmid~ 
"Weldy and Sturak are really 
warming up hard," he m'ust have 
thought. Embarrassed officials let 
Gaylord rurt with · the -50-54's (a 

. tougher group) . His 2: 11.2 placed 
him 2nd in the 45-49 division . Could 
he have beaten John Weldy's 
2: 1O.95? We'll never know, but 
ever)!one seemed satisfied with the 
outcome. 

-Where is everybody? Although 
3Q-34. Janice Henderson of Sacra- ' 413 showed up, it seemed like 
mento won the 100. 200 Javelin, and another 413 stayed home. Where was 

, Shot Put. Ramsey H~seny of San Al Guidet, Dave Jackson, Lloyd 
Francisco took ' the 800. 1500, Long Riddick, Arnold Budd and Dave 

':':..1. ~.t~ I,~U;l~W;; }?t~~~~~s. and Pentathlon. 'n · .J' . ~eg~llt '!C· I~ '.I3J "'\" ev",: ~: 

~here was Bill Gaedke,_ Wendy 
Miller, Mary Czarapata, Jim Carter 
and Art Conro? 

Where was Al _ Henry, Thane 
Baker, Miki Gorman, Dave Pain, Ed 
Phillips, Manny and Toshiko D'Elia, 
Lew Schneider, Ray Adams, Alvis 
Andrews, Cliff Bertrand and BiII 
gookin? 

How about John Brennand, Joe 
Burgasser, Bob Emmerling, Bob 
Packard, Ernie Portillo, John Sand­
ers, Hike Van der Wal, Dan Aldrich 
and Payton Jordan? 

Where were John Damski, Gordon 
Farrell, Ray Gordon, Nat Heard, Bob 
Boal, Joe Caruso, Tony Castro, 
Freitiof Sjostrand, Dick Marlin, Don 
Cheek and Bill Adler? 

What happened to George Ker, 
Dick Stolpe, ' Jack Nobte, Dave Pratt, 
.Jcrry Smartt, Mauro Hernandez, 
Carole Brockman, Dick Marlin and 
Bob Messersmith? 

We could go on. But you get the 
picture. A lot of very competitive 
Masters athletes didn't show up for 
the biggest national meet of the year. 

Why? 
I) Clearly. although Californians 

will travel anywhere for a meet 
Easterners don't go ' to West Coast 
meets, even when it's the national 
championships. Of the 413 entrants, 
only a handful were from east of the 
Mississippi. 

2) Hannover loomed. One trip was 
all the budgets of many could afford. 

.1) Many are injured. In an effort to 
attain peak form. many Masters are 
brcaking down . The ranks thin 
noticeably as you move from the 
40-44 group to the oldest. For many, 
thc body can't take it year after year. 

4) Many refuse to c'ompete unless 
the)!" re iritop form. They pass up the 
track meets and run in the local 10K 
where they can relax 'in the middle of 
the pack. (Yet some show up even if , 
not in peak form olit of a love for the 
sport. and the belief that fun, 
friendship and competition are more 

important ' than winning.) 
5) Others have simply dropped out. 

Why? Boredom? The sameness of it 
all, year after year? Not in shape? 
Too expensive to travel? Looking for 
more out of life? Family commit­
menU;? Career obligations? 

Any opinions? 
. -Stu Thompson's got the right 
Idea. He makes the nationals a 
camping outing for the family. The 
meet is a good excuse, but not the 
main reason, for a family fun trip. 

-Didn't see a single AAU official 
the entire weekend, .but what a 
dedicated, competent crew assembl­
ed by Jim Puckett. Dozens of people 
worked very long hours for three days 
to m~ke the meet the success it was. 
Our thanks for a superb effort. 

-Oregon people are among the 
friendliest in the world. Might be a 
great place to settle down. Weather 
good; overcast and a bit humid, but 
cool. Great running weather. 

-Nike sponsored two seminars. 
Although' we didn't hear all of it, 
what we did was informative. Those 
who attended said ' both were 
valu~ble. At Saturday's session, 
Gregory Heath, D.H.Sc., of the 
Washington University - School of 
Medicine in St.- Louis discussed , I 

results of an ongoing study that 
suggests we don 't necessarily slow 
down as we get older. ArIeast, not so 
much as 'has been believed. 

The Sunday, panel on injury 
prevention and rehabilitation featur­
ed Jerome Bornstein, M.D., a Los 
Angeles orthopedic surgeon v.::ith 
~xtensive sports-mediCine exper­
Ience; Jack Foster, who offered many 
v.aluable insights and conditioning 
tips; .Heath, who talked about applied 
physIOlogy and nutrition, and Gary 
Moran, Ph.D. (Anatomy and Kine­
siology), who works in Research and 
Development for Nike Sportshoes. 

NUMBER OF PARTICIPANTS 

Age f:!illl 
30-34 -50 
35-39 44 
4-0-44- 66 
45-49 46 
50-54 47 
55-59 30 
60-64 22 
65-69 21 
70-74 , 18 
75-79 5 
80-89 ..2 
TOTAL 351 

l,iis c~llaneous 

TOTAL I 413 

V/omen 

7 
6 

10 
7 
6 
5 
') 
'-

1 
0 
0 

-..Q 

44 

- 13 
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TWELFTH ANNUAL NATIONAL 
/\/\ U MASTERS TRACK & FIELD 
OL'TDOOR CHAMPIONSHIPS­
.July 6. 7. 8. 1979, Mt. Hood 
Community College , Gresham. Ore­
gon , 

1.00 meter dash 
30-34 trial ' he.t~ Heat 1 
Hike Marbut 33 WA 11.13 
Hike Jackson DC 11.14 
Glen Johnson 31 CA 11.17 
Paul Dungan 34 O~ 11.33 
Ken Johnson CN 11.78 
Frank Wojtech UT 11.84 
John North - 30 OR 11. 98 
Heat 2 
Hi lliard SUlllner 
Leon Lincoln 
Greg Marshall 
Dan Thiel 
Rod Ferguson 
~ 
Hilliard Sumner 
Hike Marbut 
Leon Lincoln 
Hike Jackson 
Glen Johnson 
Greg Marshall 
Paul Dungan 

35-39 Trial Heats 
Walt Butler 
Doug Smith 
Dan Fitzsillllllons 
Sam Robinson 
Ron Ma tt He 
Heat 2 ' 
T;;;R.andoljlh 
Bobbie Simpson 
Jim Puckett 
Lynn Eves 
Hiauel Ucovich 
PINAL 
Walt Butler 
Doug Smith 
Tom Randallph 
Dan Fitzsimmons 
Bobbie Simpspn 
Jim Puckett 
Sam Robinson 

40-44 FINALS 
Lewis Smith 
Charles Fuller 
Joseph Hoffman 

45-49 Trial heats 
i'ercy Knox 
Tony 'Nasralla 
'James Parks 
Art Afremow 

100 meter dash 

32 CA 10.95 
33 OR 10.96 ' 

11.17 
30 CA 11.47 

11. 61 

32 CA 10.94 
33 WA 10.94 
33 OR 10.95 

DC 11.03 
31 CA 11.04 

CA 11. 26 
34 OR 11.27 

Heat 1 
38 CA 10.93 
39 CA 11.27 

CA 11.38 
CA 11.56 

37 WA 11. 94 

37 toIH 11.53 r 

,CA 11.58 
39 OR 11.67 
37 OR 12.06 
38 CA 12.42 

38 CA 11.16 
39 CA 11.28 
37 MH 11.38 

co.. , 11.56 
. CD 11 . 58 

39 OR 11.62 
CA 11 . 73 

40 CA 11 . 60 
CA 12 .00 

44 OR 12.39 

Heat 1 
46 CA 11. 73 
47 CA 12.09 
45 CA 12.13 
47 OR 12.71 

45-49 Trial heats heat 2 
Nick Newton 46~.67 
Bruce Springbett 47 CA 11.70 
Van Parrish 45 CA 11.87 
Harold Hitt 47 OR 12.36 
Rich Richdrdson IL 12.81 
Jack Coy 48 OR li.97 
Gene Ford oR 14,14 
FINALS 
Percy Knox 
Van Parrish 
Nick Newton 
Bruce Springbett 
Harold Hitt 
Tony Nasralla 
Art Afremow 

46 CA 11.63 
45 CA 11.69 
46 CA 11. 76 
47 CA 11. 79 
47 OR 12.23 
47 CA 12.28 
47 OR 12.88 

50-54 Trial Heats Heat 1 
Robert Watanabe 53 CA 12.58 

' George Weber 50 OR 13.83 
Fremont Strumm OR 14.37 
Emson Grimm 54 CA 16.09 
Heat 2 
Jack Greenwood 
Bob Roemer 
Delaine Wagner 
Ron Newton 
FINALS 
Jack GreenwQOd 
Robert Watanabe 
Bob Roemer: 
George Weber 
Delaine Wagner 
Ronald Newton 
Fremont Sturm 

53 KN 12.43 
54 CA 12.58 
53 CA 13.95 
50 WA 14.28 

53 KN 12.16 
53 CA 12.44 
54 CA 12.54 
50 OR 13.87 
53 CA 13.88 
50 WA 14.51 

OR 14.64 

55-59 Trial 
Bob Cooper 
Jim Upham 
Bob Hunt 
John U1am 
LOil Carline 

Heats Heat 1 
55 CA 12.78 
58 KN 12.93 
59 CA 13.39 
53 PA 13.54 
59 OR 14.32 

*=World Age Record 
+=American Age Record 

Heat 2 
Wilbur Buchanan 
Bob Pruitt 
Don Watt 
Albert Johnson 
FINALS -
Bob Cooper 
Jim Upham 
Wilbur Buchanan 
Bob Hunt 
John Ulam 
Albert Johnson 
Don Watt 

100 Meter dash 
65-69 FINALS 
Harry Koppel 
John Satti 
Gera ld Ward 
Wayne Griffith 
70-74 FINALS 
Ken Carmine 
Lemar Jackson 
A.J. Pug1izevich 
Henry Schumacher 

75-79 FINALS 
Joe packa rd 

* Herb Anders,on 
Sing Lunnn 

200 Meter dash 

55 CA.13.27 ' 
56 OR 13.42 
56 CA 13.64 
57 OR 13.65 

55 CA 12.67 
58 KN 12.86 

CA 13.20 
59 CA 13.33 
55 PA 13.36 
57 OR 13 .63' 
56 CA 13.12 

66 CA 13.26 
65 CA 13.72 

14.58 
67 co 18 . 20 

71 CA 14.98 
74 CA 15.58 
71 CA 15.99 
70 WA 19.40 

76 CA 14.93 
77 CO 15.62 
75 CA 15.76 

jO-34 Trial Heats Heat -l 
Hillia rd Sumner 32 CA 22 . 14 
Glenn Johnson 31 CA 22.64 
Paul Dungan 34 OR 22.68 
Mike Jackson DC 23.03 
Ken Johnson MI 24.50 
Heat 2 
Ruben Whi tney 
Leon Lincoln 
Matt Pruit t 
Dan Theil 

~ 
Ruben Whitney 
Hilliard Sumner 
Leon Linco ln 
Glen Johnson 
Paul Dungan 
Dan Theil 

35-39 FINALS 
Walt Butler 
David Romain 
Doug Smith 
Tom Randolph 
Bobbie Simpson 
Lynn Eves 

49-44 FINALS 
Gary Miller 
Lewis Smith 
Chatles Fuller 
Haig Bohigian 
Joseph Hoffman 
Bernard Babbit 

45-49~ 
Nick Newton 
Percy Knox ' 
Bruce Springbett 
Van Parrish 
HaDold Hitt 
Jack Coy 
50-54 ~ 

*JacK Greenwood 
Ozzie D.wkins 
Bob Sieben 
Robert Watanabe 
Delanine Wagner 
Ronald Newton 
Don Uppendahl 

55-59 ~ 
Bob Cooper 
Jim Upham 
Cal Boyd 
Wilbur Buchanan 
Ray Spencer 
Albert Johnlon 
Bob Hunt 
Bob Watt 

60-64~ 
Bill Bowers 
Carl Oates 

34 TX 21.96 
33 OR 22.15 

CD 22.73 
30 LA 23 . 69 

34 TX 21.80 
32 CA 21.85 
33 OR 22 .04 
31 CA 22.51 
34 OR 22 . 76 
30 LA 24.38 

/ 

38 CA 22 . 76 
OR n. 78 

39 CA 23.19 
37 MI 23.20 

CD 23 .69 
37 OR 24.43 

42 CA 23.56 
40 CA 23.95 

CA 24.68 
43 NY 24.93 
44 OR 25.01 
42 WA 28.83 

46 CA 23.69 
46 CA 23.98 
47 CA 24.12 
45 CA 24.19 
47 OR 24.80 
48 OR 26.27 

53 KN 24.29 
50 CA 24.74 
53 CA 25.33 
53 CA 25.46 
53 CA 27.79 
50 WA 29.74 
50 OR 29.75 

55 CA 24.95 
58 KN 26 . 41 
58 OR 26.81 
$ CA 26.96 
56 CA 27.42 
57 OR 27.46' 
59 CA 27.60 
56 CA NT 

61 ID 28.96 
60 OR 29.88 

Robert Littl~ohn 60 29.89 

Merle Pallller 60 31.10 

65-69 PINALS 
*Harry Koppel 66 CA 27.48 
John Satti 65 CA 29.13 
Gerald Ward CA 30.55 

12.:1!~ 
len Carnine 71 CA 31.36 
Mel Shine 70 CA 32.75 
John Clarke "72 CO 33.04 

75-79 ~ 
*Josiah packard ~6 C~ 31.08 
*Herb Anderson 77 co 33.22 
Harold Chapson 77 HI 33.37 
Sing Lumm 75 CA 33.41 

80-84 FINALS 
*Paul Spitlgler 80 CA 39.50 

'400 Heter Dash 11'ial Heat' 
Hilliard Sumner 32 CA- -SO-;'04 
Ruben Whitney 34 TX 52.13 
Dan Theil 30 LA 54.28 
ChlJck Holt 32 IL 54.46 
Heat 2 
Matt Pruitt CA 50.00 
Glenn Johnson 31 CA 50.69 
Prank Wojtech UT 52.02 
Bill Weller 52.22 
George Jenkins 32 HI 53.56 
FINALS 
Hilliard SUlllner 32 CA 48.07 
Matt Pruitt 31 cD 48.41 
Glenn Johnson 31 CA 50.13 
Dan ThSd 30 LA 51.83 
Bill Weller 52.26 ' 
Chuck Holt 32 IL 54.46 

400 Meter Dash 
35-39 FINALS 

+ David Romain 37 CA 49.66 
Dan Fitzsimmons CA 52.25 
Lyn Eves 37 OR 51.65 
Bryan Westf1e~d 37 HI 53.03 

40-44 FINALS 
Gary Miller 42 CA 52. 28 
J ack Brocksmith 54.38 
Ha ig Bohigian 43 NY 54 . 96 

He r b Blanchard CA 6cr. ZZ 
Bernard Babblt 42 WA 63.98 

45-49 FINALS 
Nick Newton 46 CA 52 . 26 
Harold Hitt 46 OR 54.28 
Hans Brunner 46 CA 55.26 
Tony Nasra lla 47 CA 55.56 
James Parks 45CA57.n 

50-54 FINALS 
* Jack G~od 53 KN 54.24 

+ 

Ozzie Dawkins 50 CA 54.68 
Dean Smith 53 IL 55.77 
Bob Sieben 53 CA 56.129 
Dan Jackson 53 CA 56.69 
George Weber 50 OR 62.74 

55-59 FINALS 
Jim Upham 58 KN 58.73 
Bob Hunt 59 CA 59.62 
Wi 1bur Buch<lnan CA 60.03 
Raymond Spencer 56 CA 61.24 
Don Harrill 57 PA 61.43 
Calvin Boyd 58 OR 61.51 
Hark Henderson 59 CA 67.50 

60-64 FINALS 
Bill Bowers 61 ID 63.96 
Robert Littlejohn60 WA 69.88 
Merle Palmer . 60 WA 71.95 
Prans Pauwels 61 OR 74.36 

65-69 FINALS 
* Harry Koppel 

John Satti 
Chet Beach 
Bud Deacon 
Gerald Ward 

70-74 FINALS 
Hel Shine 
John Clar~e 

75-79 FINALS 
* Josiah Packard 

Sing LUIIIIII 

800 Heter 
30-34 
John Perry 
Hilliard Sumner 
Frank Wojtech 
George Jenkin's 
David Shilling 
Steve Waggener 

66 CA 63.88 
65 CA 65.67 
67 CA 69.34 
67 OR 70.58 

CD 71.44 

70 CA 12.07 
72 CO 12.20 

76 CA 71.13 
75 CA 82.01 

34 CA 1. 56,93 
32 CA 1. 58. 15 

UT 1.58.30 
32 HI 1.59.41 
34 WA 1.59.57 
34 <:A J2.00.26 
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+ Ralph Lee 
+ David Romain 

Jack Petty 
John Prinos 

40-44 
*trnie Billups 

Jack Knebel 
William Hayer 
Pete Richardson 
He1 Elliot 
James Vella 
wal t Schaefer 
Herb Blanchard 
Berna rd Babbi t 

45-49 

38 CA 1.53.76 
37 CD 1.54.78 
35 IX 1.58.35 
37 WA 2.23.83 

42 IL 1.55.96 
40 CA 2.00.16 
42 TX 2.00.87 
44 CA 2.01. 67 
41 CA 2.03.23 
42 OR 2.13.05 

CA 2.14.12 
CA 2.18.42 

42 WA 2. 2:7 • OL 

John Weldy 4~ AZ 2.10.95 
Gaylord Kalchschmid CA 2.11.14 
Tom Sturak 48 CA 2.15.18 
Dic~ Katte 46 IN 2.16.86 
'John Harper 46 CA 2.20.26 
Jack Randolph 46 CA 2.31 . 99 
Sandor Szabo 47 OR 2.41.76 

50-54 *--*Bi11 Fitzgerald · 54 CA 2.04.76 
Dean Smith 53 IL 2.06.06 
Kelsey Brown 52 NJ 2.06 . 80 
Bob Sieben 53 CA 2.09.11 
Don Jackson 53 CA 2.11.84 
Ian Jamison CD 2.12.54 
George Puterbaugh54 OR 2.13.84 
Robert Kuepper 51 OR 2.15.54 
David Stevenson 51 CA 2.16.94 
Robert Poet 54 CA 2.22.44 

12:12 
Avery Bryant 
Jack Rice 
Wilbur Buchanan 

60-64 
Merle Palmer 
Frans Powe1s 

65-69 *--Wil liam Andberg 

Ha rry Kopp e l 
Norm Bright 
70-74 
Mel Shine 
Sid Hadden 
John Clarke 
Ken St. Clair 

-JJ::.1!l 
Harold Chapson 

, L'VV Meters 
30-34 
Steve Waggener 
Del Martin 
Bordon Garlock 
George Jenkins 
David Shilling 
Alan Lichtman 
Frank Woj tech 

, Marty Stitzel 

12.:1.2 
+ Jack Petty 
+ Ralph Lee 

, Victor Wolfe • 
David Bakley 
Gene Timberlake 
John Prinos 
Ira Yawnick 
Ken Wilson 

~ 
+ Ernie Billups 

Jack Knebel 
Thomas Cathcart 
Hel Elliott 
Bernard Babbit 

55 CA 2.17.43 
59 FL 2.21.86 
S5 CA 2.29.22 

60 WA 2.41.53 
61 OR 2.43.67 

68 MN 2.34.36 

6 6 CA 2.44.82 
69 WA 2. 49. 52 

70 CA 2.44.81 
12 CA 2.45.80 
12 CO 2.45.97 
71 MO 3.24.33 

77 HI 2.47.63 

34 WA 4.08.36 
OR 4.09.61 

A30 OR 4.12.56 
32 MI 4.1 \ 01 

VA 4.14.25 
32 MD 4.17.48 

UT 4.18.37 
34 WA 4. 19 • 2 7 

35 TX 4.02.12 
38 CA 4.02.55 
35 OR 4.08.55 

OR 4.15.2'7 
35 TX 4.19.95 
37 WA 4.49.65 
38 CA 4.54.60 
38 OR 5.09.00 

42 IL 4.03.33 
40 CA 4.14.05 
41 CA 4.23.21 
41 CA 4.27.31 
42 WA 4.50.58 

~ 
Jqhn Weldy 45 AZ 4.31.01 
Gaylord Ka1chschmid CA 4.33.32 
Hartin Gurtin PA 4.34.29 
TOIII Sturak 48 CA 4.39.22 
John Harper 46 CA 4.55.78 

50-54 
*Bill Fit~gerald 54 CA 4.21.94 
+Kelsey Brown 52 NJ 4.25.54 
+Dean Smith'53 IL 4.30.12 

lam Jamison CD 4.38.27 
Robert Keupper 51 OR 4.40.09 
Bob Holmes 51 CA 4.34.39 
George Puterbaugh 54 OR 4.48.99 
Leo She¥ry 51 OR 4.49.50 

•• . ' . I • J _ I I • • , , J I f I ~ ~ r I I 

continued on page 12 

, " 

\ 



[ 
( 

page 10 National Masters Newsletter Greshom. Ore .. Sot .. July 7 . 1979 

Press clippings from the Nationals 
Nothing sad about it . 
69-year-old runs blind, but not scared 

. "I get very tense doing that," Bright 
If BAIIT WIIQHT . 
... 0.....,....-

Daylight began to dlm throulh Nen. 
man Bright', eyes 15 years Igo . It blr. 
pellEid slowly, but perceptibly, and hit 
worsened month bv menth ever .. Inee. 

Now Norman B:ight enCOU!1ters 16-
rlous difficulties when he trains for the 
running e,'ents in whIch he competea. 
He Is blind. 

"This Is my mentor," Bright AId 
Friday morning at Mount Hood Com. 
munlty College, placing his hand on the 
shoulder of C.aig Coleman, a college 
student In Seattle. " I try to work Oilt 
ev;;;".,. day. I like to run about 50 miles, 
w~ek, but at my age 1 have to pay more 
a ttention to my body than ~ver before. 
The body's made up of many parts, and 
they all have to be work!ng together. 
Cralg is my eyes." 

Bright Is 69 years old, w ishing h' 
w ere 70, w hich w ould pla".~ him I, 
another age-bracket for competl!ion hI 
t.lOiSters' track me~ts. like the nltlon.aI 
AAU championshi ps he's competin& la ' 
"this weekend at Mount Hoed. : 

Bright a ppears to be in excellent 
pi1yslcal .condition. He wears a tattered 
fI:herman 's cap w ith a narrow brim 
and an elastic strap held together under 
his chin with a safety pit!. He has scruf­
fy white whiskers and sports a red, 
white and blue jogging outil!. He live1 
alone In a Baptist rest home in Seattle. 
b\:t he beams with pride wile!! he te!l!! 
\"Ou sbout his 7-month-old grandson. 
. Fright com;:>eted Friday !li ~!Jt in th(' 
S5-69-vear-old 10,aOO-meter run. HeTI 
r~n the 800 meters Saturday and cioSE' 
out the weekend witt! the I,SOO- inC' 

5.COO-meter runs Sunday. 
"I'm !l~t a loner, but 1 have to be. : 

h~te it," Bright said. "In Seattle, when 1 
don't have somebody to run with, I'm 
alv.'ays bumping Into trees, f~!ling off 
curbs or running Into walls . See my 
legs?" he asked . pulling up a pant leg to . 
CiSjlic)' a series of t>umRs and w e ts. 

", run llound Gre"n Lake a lot, and 

ltaft photo b, _E UOYD 

BIG NIGHT - Norman Bright shows wear of 10,OOO-meter run In National 
AAU Masters track and field meet Friday night at Mount Hood C.C. 

Old friends reunrte as 
- . . 

Masters meet begins 
"y K EN SANDS . 
of The Outlook staff 

"Next year we'll be 60 and 
we' ll give 'em hell," said 
Burl Gist . a competitor in 
this we ekend's AAU National 
Masters Track Champion­
ships at Mt. Hood 
Community College. 

Gist and Bob HlUlt are both 
from San Diego, and at age 
59 they have been competing 
with and against each other 
for several years . Next year 
the two will enter the 60-69 
age category and once again 
will be the yrun~ters . 

" I've always loved 
competition and I'll keep 
going as long as my oid bones 
hold up and as long as it 
doesn' t hurt too much," said 
Gist, who holds the age group 
world record in the high 
jump. 

According to meet director 
Jim Puckett , 413 people are 
entered, and they range in 
age from 30 to 86. "Some 
guys are ex-Olympians and 

. some didn' t start until their 
505. Something different 
motivates each one of them." 

For most of the 
competitors, a cross-country 
trip to Gresham is the 
highlight of a summer 
vacation. "These people 
aren ' t doing it for a school or 
a coach or a COlUltry, they're 
doing it because they like to 
and they like the 

camaraderie . They like to 
come to these meets and see 
their old fr iends," said 
Puckett. 

Gist usually 'beats Hunt in 
the high jump, bu t Hunt 
usually wins the hurdles. 
The irs is a fri e ndl y 
competition, one that has 
developed over the years . 
When you get to tha t age, 
the re aren ' t too many 
different faces . 

That 's why Gist bad to 
come to Gresham, despite 
the fact that he has been on a 
long trip since May and 
hasn't worked out very 
much. But he said he 's still in 
much better shape than when 
he returned to the track eight 
years ago. 

"When 1 was 50 1 quit 
smoking and I started to 
traih aDd jog, aDd my first 
year in the Mas ters 
competition was when I was 
51 ," said Gist, w ho still holds 
the 12(}-yard (42·inch high ) 
hurdles record at Anaheim 
High Schoo' in California. 

His first meet since junior 
college was disastrous -
except that he got second 
place in the "igh jump. In the 
first event, the 100, he 
pulled both of his hamstring 
muscles, and could barely 
walk. The next day he 
loosened up enough to try the 
high jum p, a nd cleared 4-6 on 

the first try . 
" I cleared that thing 

by 3 or 4 inches and the 
people 'oohed a nd aa hed' and 
I was feeling pre tty good," 
he said . Even though his goal 
was to get in the' top six and 
win a medal . Gist wanted to 
win, despite the pain. At !Hl. 
with only one other person 
left, . he pulled a groin 
muscle . That ended his day 
on the track , but it wasn 't 
going to be that easy to 
forget. 

" The next day that thing 
turned black and blue and 
purple and green and my 
shoulder hurt so much 1 
couldn 't eat for a week .. It 
almost killed me, but I 
learned I had to practice a 
little more," he said . 

Hunt 's initiation wasn' t 
nearly as dramatic. " My 
wife gave me a belt for 
Christmas and it was the 
r ight s ize but I couldn ' t fit 
into it. 1 cruldn' t believe 1 
had gained that much 
weight. " 

Mter losing 4Q pounds. 
Hunt has been able to win at 
least two gold medals in the 
national meets each year. 
Last year he won the high 
hurdles and the 400 hurdles, 
and took second in the 100, 
200 and 400. 

Hunt is now attempting 
anothe r com ebac k after 
suffer ing 8 dis located hip 
injury last year. 

Although Ron Hubbell quit 
competi ng in 1927. he still 
had track a nd field in his 
blood when he came out of 
retir ement 15 years ago . " I 
quit in 19Z7 because I ran out 
of schooling. and there 
wasn' t a ny masterg program 
then," he said . 

So after a 37 ·year layoff. 
Hubbe ll began ru nning 
a gain . After five years of 
undi s tingu ished d ista nce 
rurming, he saw a story about 
hammer throwers who were 
over 60 . Hubbell had throw n 
the hamme r a t t h~ 
University of P ittsburgh. and 
thrught "the old men were 
crazy. " 

But after giving it some 
thought. he decided if they 
could do it. he could do it. He 
went out and ' won the 
national meet in his first 
hammer com petition in 42 
years . and he's won ever y 
meet s ince then . 

" I never won anything 
running and I won the 
hammer the fi rst time ' tr ied 
it, so I've been on the fie ld 
ever since," Huhbell said. 

Even at 70 years of age. 
Hubbell has no immediate 
thrughts of quitting . ..It 
helps iny health a lot. and I 
intend to keep it up unti l it 
gets too embarrassing. " 

But Hubbell jus t enter ed 
the 7(}'79 a ge bracket . so he's 

.just another youngster wit h a 
lot of years ahead ~f him . 

said. ''There's one lady who walks 
around there sometimes .. and she'll see 
me coming and say, 'Look out, Nor­
man,' 'Move to your right,' or some­
thing like that." 

When Bright runs through the 
streets of Seattle , he wears a helmet 
and carries a white cane, hut even that 
Is not much of a help, not when young 
punks steal his cane llnd refuse to get 
out of his way. 

But BrIght doesn't dwell on the bad 
experiences. He likes to talk about. the 
day In Toronto a few years ago when he 
set age-group world records in the 800, 
steeplechase and I ,SOO meters, all in the 
same day. He w as the first person over 
60 to run the 1.500 In less than five 
minutes when he clocked a 4:59.8. 

Bright currently is embroiled w ith 
the problems of raising necessary funds 
to send himself and Coleman to Hano­
ver, West Germany, later this month for 
competition in. the World Masters 
ChampionshIps. If they make it, t hey'll 
take pictures, record their experiences 
and try to set up speaking engagements 
when they return. 

. Bright figures it will take as much 
as $5,000 or more for the trip. So far, 
he's raised $917. 

JOY OF RUNNING - Norman Bright , 69, shows elation 
after fi n ish of his age group's 10 ,OOO-meter run Friday 
'nlght In National AAU Maste rs track and field meet at 

Mount 
and USl 

him. 

"Actually, I've taken In $929, but 1 
spent $12 on a new folding walking 
cane to replace the one the kids stole 
from me," he said. "It's hard to get the 
money because the track clubs all say 
their money is going to support the 
Olympics. We seniors demand respect, 
and I'm going to get the money some­
how and get over there, then come back 
and tell my story. 1 think it wHl be a 
good story." . 

Bright wandered off with Coleman 
to do some running. When he left, a 
72-year-old Masters' competitor ap­
proached a reporter. 

"He was a hell of a runner In his 
day " the man said . " The way he is 
no"';, you know, blind and all that, It's 
sort of sad Isn't It?" 

Sad that Norman Bright, blind at 69 
years old, stili manages to run 50 miles 
a week, Is in better shape than most 
people half his age and has somehow 
managed to remain the eternal opti­
mist? 
• There's nothing sad about that. 

Ken Johnson gets set to unleash javelin throw daring 
Friday actiOlI at National Masten Track and Field 
Championships at Mt. Hood Community College. 
Johnson, who lives In ConnectiCUt, .competed In tbe:le-

34 ag\ 
Final, 
Sund. · 

Masters must win 
against friends 

B)' DA VID HAMBURG 
Journal Sports Writer 

GRESHAM - "Competition" is not a four-letter word 
Only if "winning" can ~. construed as a diny word 

can "competition " be si milarly labeled. 
This holds true for the old. as well as the you ng. 

atblete. 
So don't believe for a moment that the panici pants in 

the 10th annual AAU Masters and Sub-Masters Nation.: 
Track and Field championships which ended bere SundO" 
are just a bunch of hyperactive senior citizens. enjoying a 
week ~nd get-together. 

"Sure. there's ' a lot of fu n and a lot of fellowship out 

• I I " 

here." 44-year-old Ha: Smith said as he peeled 0 

sweat sock in the almost·empt\· Mt Hood Comm Ul 
College locker room "Bul everybod~; tries t(. win. 

"If you lose. you can understand and accept it. beCI 
you're friends. We're mature people. We can forget 
lost and go out. ha v~ a beer and relax . 

" But you 'd rather dir than let them beat you ." 
Smith . a tall, husky. yet flee l-of·foot pentathlon III 

probably should understand this "win or di~" compuls 
more readily than anyone else . He played defensive I 

in the 19605 for one of the wi nningest teams in Natio 
Football League history. the Oak land Raiders. 

Smith . American ~g~· grou p record·holder (43) in I 

pentathlon . agreed that "certainly. any ti me you ad( 
record. you feel good about it. 

"But it's not like the younger athletes who feel the;' 
g~tta go out and kill the other guy. We don't have to 
macho anymo~e . We like to go out and have a good tim 

"Sti ll. when we get in the blocks. it's the sam~ ( 
thing. Ti me to start over again ." 
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od Community College. Bright is legally blind 
friend Craig Coleman, background, to pace 

Records faJ I for 
Master's spikers 

byJIM IIAYS 
01 The Oullo" starr 

It was raining lightly OIl 

the Mt. Hood Community 
College t rack Sunday night 
with lightning visible to the 
east and thunder rolling 
across the darkened skies. 

The threat 01 a sudden 
cloudburst, however, 
couldn't put a damper on the 
spirits of more than 400 
athletes from all over the 
United States and several 
foreign countries who made 
the trek to Gresham for the 
AAU Masters National Track 
and Field Championships. 

World records were 
shattered in 17 events and 
new American marks were 
recorded in another nine as 
athletes ranging in age from 
30 to 86 toiled through three 
humid days of competition. 

Stars of the show? How 
about Irene Obera? A 4S­
year-old high school 
Drincijal _CrOill .O.aJalid, 
r.._ , ~ , ...... _.!!~ ~ .-: _ ~_-:~-:_ .. _ ... 

Ihl.' Spllflllllg t ' \'enb III t.'vt:,,) 

a!,!c group sll" has competed 
in. She OWI\S world age-group 
records in four events that 
she sct in 1\l76 when she 
compded in Division I·A (40-
44J. Now running in Division 
I ·B 145·49 ) , Obera set 
stand .. rds earlier this year in 
the 100, 200 and 400 meters . 
DlU'ing this weekend's meet 
she lowered her marks in all 
three events 

mark she set May 12 by .m 
seconds. 

The next day she came 
back a nd captured the 200 
and 400, again in record 
times. She eclipsed her old 
mark in the 200 by covering 
the distance iJl 26.S7, then 
shaved three seconds off her 
400 record by winning that 
race in 1:01.73. 

Then there was Harry 
Koppel. Competin& in 
di vision 3-B (65-«1), Koppel 
picked up three gold medals 
and set two world records in 
the process . His 1 :03.88 

clocking in the- 400 [Jleters 
was .12 second better 
the rna rk he set less than a 
month ago. Koppel then 
came back in the 200 to set 
anotl!er world mark with a 
time of 27.48. He also won the 
100 meters in his age group 
and finished third in the 800, 
an event he hadn't competed 
in since his Iugh school days 

·.balf~.\l. "".~ ." 

uld weight man f ro il'l 
Alhambra, Ca lil. , shattered 
the world age·group mark in 
the hammer throw . His 
heave of 124-3 bettered the 
three-year·old world mark 
by nearly II feet. 

turned in a 1,500 time of 
4: 03.33 to easily. wtdista nce 
the field and carve 2.6 
seconds off the record set by 
Wilbur Williams in 1973. 

The sentimental favorite 01 
the crowd throughout the 
meet, however, was Norman 
Bright, a bli.nd, 69-year-old 
Seattle resident Who puts in 
14 miles 01 roadwork daily . 

Assisted by his 'guide, 
college student Craig 
Coleman, Bright competed in 
the 10,000 meters on Friday, 
ran the 8OO 'on Saturday (an 
event he holds an age-group 
world record in), then came 
back to double in the 1,500 
and 5,000 on Sunday. 

He . finisl\ed out of the 
money in the 10,000 and was 
fourth in U1e 800 but came 
back Sunday to take silver 
medals in both the 1,500 and 
5,000, receiving cheers and 
encouragement from the 
sizable audience each time 
he paued , in front of llIe 
n ,1 "·" ' . t llll 

In addilion to hiS ('xploits 
on III~ track . Bright was also 
able to raise a substantial 
amount of money to help 
finance a trip to Ihe 
Inl e rnati onal Masters 
championships in Hanover, 
Germa ny, la ter this year . 
Making that trip has been 
one of Bright's goals this 
year . 

"==--
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StaIr p/lolO by Kim Smllh . 

In Sa turday 's women 's 100-
meter fina l, Ober!l not only 
outraced the competition in 
her own division but turned 
in the fastest time of 
everyone. Her world record 
time of 12.1>3 was .57 seconds 
faster than her nearest rival. 
The clocking also t5eat the 

New American age-group 
records in the men's 800 and 
1,500 were set by Ernie 
Billups, competing for the 
University of ~hicago Track 
Club. The 42-year-old 
Billups , who set the 
American 800 mark exactly a 
year earlier al 1:57.5, this 
time covered the distance in 
I :55.96, displaying a strong 
fi nishing kick that enabled 
him to win by five secunds. 

Then on Sunday Billups 

This year's meet marked 
the third time the AAU 
Nationa l Masters has come 
to Gresham and MHCC. The 
college becomes eligible to 
host the meet again in 1981. 
AAU regulations prohibit 
holding the competition at 
the same site two years in a 
row. 

Kent Gulhl'ie of Lafayelte, Calif. hi ts the water Jump during Saturday's steeplechu" 
finats In the Natlunal Masters Track MeeL Guthrie finished sKoRd in his age group 
(40-44), completing the C9urse In 10:38.10. 

Sprinter outraces cancer, snakebite 
byJIMHAYS mark twice. 
of The Outlook slarr 

Just call Harry Koppel the Comeback Kid . 

An excellent swimmer, Koppel alao owns the 
American age -group record in the 50-meter 

Staff photo by K im Sm !l/ l 

roup and won the event with a toss of 192-5. 
I most events are scheduled for Saturday and 

Koppel gave up track and field in 1929 when he was 
still in high school. 

Now , at age 66, he holds world age-group records in 
twu events, an American mark in a third, and almost 
incidentally also holds a national age-group swimming 
record. 

Not bad , especially when yw consider he returned to 
competition only three years ago and has overcome 

. cancel' and a pa'ralYiting snake bite . 
A retired maintenance man for United AirllDes in 

Belmont, Ca lif., Koppel came back to athletics on the 
ad vice of his doctor. . 

"I had to lose 30 pounds and some high blood 
pressW'e ," he said. 

He started running, lost the weight and lowered his 
blood pressure. But rather than stop there, or just 
maintain .the status quo, Koppel went a step further . 
Several steps fW'ther , in fact . 

He began running competitively in Masters meets . 
and made it to his first nat.ional meet in 1m. He was 
less than completery successful, but the next year he 
was back like gallgbuslers , setting world age-group 
records in the :.lOO and 400 meters and lowering each Harry Koppel 

Bevilaqua resigns 
Jack Greenwood. a world record-holder in a myriad c . 

events, showed his flair for making friends . 

A 53-year-old savings and loan manager, he traveled 
all the way from tiny Medicine Lodge, Kan ., to run in 
seven events here because "it makes you feel clean. like 
you had a complete shower. 

"Bssically. llike to run for the fun of it. It 's mv wav of 
unwinding. Instead of going out for a cocktaii after a 
long day, 1 run ." 

Greenwood ingratiated himself at this Masters meet by 
stopping by to renew old acquaintances and enjoy cama· 
raderie. 

Then he pulled a fast one and walked off with five 
gold medals, including a world age-group record of 54.24 
in the 400 meters. 

Who says you can 't beat old friends? 

John Bevilaqua has resigned as 
Director of Marketing for Financial 
Fitness. Inc. . 

(Financial Fitness is the arm of the 
Occidental Life Insu r-a nce Co. of 
North Carolina which is providing 
$35.000 tn support Masters track . 
field and long distance running in. 
1479. ) 

" A 
. tnel 

sc nior management change 
reassignment of personnel." 

Bevilaqua states, "has prompted me 
In ask to be freed from my current 
ll bligations. I will continue to 
"oordinate AAU actiVities with 
Occidental ilT my role as ' National 
\A U Masters Treasurer." 

.'>\d Have ly of Financia.l Fitness 
a~~ lirc " that " I talked with Tom 
Smith ahout the contraetural t.gree­
Illl' nt \\'ith Occidental / FFI concerrring 
the National Masters Newsletter. 

breaststroke and will be on hand next month when the 
national Masters championships are decided in 
Detroit. 

It hasn't been an easy road for him: however. 

"I was bitten by I' seasnake while swimming off the 
California coast," he said. The venom from the bite left 
him paralyzed for weeks and when he was finally able 
to get around again he was struck down by throat 
cancer. 

". was finally cured by cobalt and radiation 
treatments," he said, pointing to tiny black marks on 
both sides of his neck, marks left by tbe treatment he 
had to undergo. 

At this year's National Master's, Koppel again 
lowered his world records in the 200 and 400. His 1:03.88 
clocking in the 400 clipped .12 seconds off his previ0U8 
best time and he took the same number 01 ticks off the 
world mark in the 200. The latter record' was especially 
satisfying to Koppel, who had lost the mark last 
summer to Yngue Brange of Sweden. 

". ran a 27.4 last summer and • thought I had the 
record again, " he said. "But they said the time was 
wind-aided and wouldn't allow it as a 1record. Tbe 
Brange did his 27.6 and they let that stand. So I had 
personal r€asons for wanting this record back." 

Spoken like a true competitor. 

Tom has asked that I reaffirm all the 
clements of the agreement and 
l' lllphasize to you that John 
Be\' il aq ua 's leaving in no- way alters 
anything in that regard. 

"I hope that in the next few 
lilOnths we will be able to make our 
products more widely known __ _ Re-
cc ntly, we have enjoyed an increase 
in the number of policy applications 
a nd a great deal of favorable press 
coverage , 

,-
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there sometimes,. and sbe' ll see 
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Records faJ I for 
Master's spikers 

byJIMlIAYS 
01 The Outlook starr 

It was raining lightly on 
the Mt. Hood Community 
College t rack Sunday night 
with lightning visible to the 
east and thunder rolling 
across the darkened skies. 

The threat of a sudden 
clo udburs t , ho w ev e r , 
couldn't put a damper on the 
s pirits of more than 400 
athletes from all over the 
United Sta tes a nd severa l 
foreign countries who made 
the trek to Gresham for the 
AAU Masters National Track 
and Field Cham pionships. 

Wo r ld reco r ds were 
shattered in 17 events a nd 
new American marks were 
recorded in another nine as 
athletes ranging in age from 
30 to 86 toiled through three 
humid days of competition. 

Stars of the show? How 
a bout Irene Obera? A 45-
yea r -old high school 

mark s he set' May 12 by .1!1 
seconds. 

The next day she came 
back and captured the 200 
and 400, again in r ecord 
times . She eclipo;ed her old 
mark in the 200 by covering 
the distance in 28.57, then 
shaved three seconds off her 
400 record by winning that 
race in 1:01.73. 

turned in a 1,500 time 0 ' 

4:03.33 to easily, outdistancl 
the field and carve 2.1 
seconds off the record set b) 
Wilbur Willia ms in 1973 . . 

The sentimental fa vorite Ii 
the crowd throughout thl 
meet , however , was Norman 
Bright, a blind, 69-year-old 
Sea ttle resident who puts in 
14 miles of roadwork daily . 

Assisted by. his 'guide, 
college s tude nt Craig 
Coleman, Br ight competed in 
the 10,000 meters on Friday , 
r an the 8OO 'on Sa turday (an 
event he holds a n age-group 
world record in), then came 
back to double in the 1,500 
and 5,000 on Sunday. 

st Germany, later this month for 
ltion lD. tbe World Masters 
onshlps. If they make it, they'll 
;tures, record their experiences 
to set up speaking engagements 
ley return. 
ht figures it will take as much 
)0 or more for the trip. So far , 
led $917. 

JOY OF RUNNING - Norman Bright, 69, shows elation 
after finish of his age group's 10,OOO-meter run Friday 
night In National AAU Masters track and field meet at 
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Mount Hood Community College. Bright is legally blind 
and uses friend Craig Coleman, background, to pace 
him. 

p'~i,~~~~ _;tf~ ;~~~~~ 
ttit., s pnnt lllg ,,'V l ' Ut::, 111 ever ) 
al4e !\ rullp slit! has competed 
in . She owns world age-group 
records in four events that 
s he set in tY76 when she 
compt'led in Division I ·A (40-
441. Now running in Division 
I · B 145 ·49 ), Obera set 
sta ndards earlie r this year in 
the 100, 200 and 400 meters . 
During this weekend's meet 
s he lowe red her mar ks in all 
three events . 

Then there was Harry 
Koppel. Competini in 
division 3-B ( 65~ ) , Koppel 
picked up three gold medals 
a nd set two world records in 
the process. His 1: 03.88 

clocking in the- 400 meters 
was .12 second better 
the mark he set less than a 
month ago. Koppel then 
came back in the 200 to set 
anotl)er world mark with a 
time of 27.48. He also won the 
100 meters in his age' group 
and finished third in the 800, 
an event he hadn't competed 
in since his lugh school days 
.balf~ *- .;;:~!. , 

h . " I' ; ) 1 1, ,, 11 ... , .,." 

old we ight man f r t,m 
Alha m bra, Ca li!. , sha tte red 
the world age-group ma rk in 
t he ha m mer throw . His 
heave of ·124·3 bettered the 
three·year·old world mark 
by nearly 11 feet . 

He . finisl\ed out of the 
money in th~ 10,000 and was 
fourth in tlIe 800 but came 
back Sunday to take silver 
medals in both the 1,500 and 
5,000, receiving cheers and 
encou ragement from the 
sizable audience each time 
he paned , in front of Il\e 
I"> ,' • • · ' ... ·.1 ... ' 

III additioll to hiS "xpluits 
on tht' track. Bright was a lso 
able to raise a substant ial 
amount of money to he lp 
fina nce a tri p to the 
(nt'e rn a ti o na l Mas t e r s 
championshi ps in Ha nover , 
Germa ny, late r this year . 
Making that trip has been 
one of Bright's goals this 
year. 

lually , I've taken In $929, but I 
·12 . on a new folding w alking 

replace the one the kids stole 
e," be said. "It's hard to get the 
because the track clubs all say 
loney is going to support the 
:s. We seniors demand respect, 
. going to get the money somt­
i get over t here, then come back 

my story. I think It will be a 
)ry." 
ht wandered off with Coleman 
orne running . When he left, a 
'-old Masters' competi tor ap­
d a reporter. 

was a hell of a runner In his 
he man said. "The way he is 
)u know, bUnd and all that, It's 
;ad isn't It?" 
that Norman Bright, blind at 69 
Id, still manages to run 50 miles 
, Is in better shape than most 
balf his age and bas somehow 
d to remain t be eternal opti-

:e's nothing sad about t hat . 

····Jf 
' y . 

'i>. 

(n Saturday'S women's 100-
meter fin a l, Ober!! not only 
outraced the com petition in 
her own di vision but turned 
in the fastes t ti me of 
everyone. Her world record 
time of 12.63 was .57 seconds 
fas ter than her nearest rivai. 
The clock ing a lso beat the 

New Ame rican age ·group 
records in the men's 800 a nd 
1,500 were set by E rnie 
Billups, com peti ng for the 
University of ~hicago Track 
Clu b . The 42-yea r- old 
Billups , w ho set the 
America n BOO ma rk exactly a 
year earl ier at 1 :57.5 , this 
time covered the distance in 
1 :55 .96. displaying a strong 
finishing kick that enabled 
him to win by five seconds . 

Then on Sunday Billups 

This year's meet ma rked 
the third time the AAU 
Na tiona I Masters has com e 
to Gresham and MHCC . The 
co llege becomes eli gible to 
bost the meet again in 1981. 
AAU regula tions prohibit 
holding the competition at 
the same site two years in a 
row . 

Sprinter outroces ~ 
byJIMHAYS 
of The Outlook staff 

Just ca ll Harry Koppel the Comeback Kid . 
Koppel ga ve up tra ck and field In 1929 when he was 

s till in high school. 
Now , a t age 66, he holds world age-group records in 

two events, an American mark in a third, a nd almost 
incidentally also holds a national age-group swimming 
record. 

No t bad , especially when you consider he returned to 
competition only three year s a go and has overcome 

. ca ncer and a paralYii'ing s nake bite . 
A retired maintenance man for United Airlines in 

Belmont , Ca lif ., Koppel came back to athletics on the 
adv ice of his doctor . 

" I had to lose 30 pounds and some high blood 
pressure, " he said. 

He sta rted running , lost the weight and lowered his 
blood pressure. But rather than stop there, or just 
maintain .the status quo, Koppel went a step further . 
Severa l steps further , in fact. 

mark twice . 
An excellent swimmer, 

Amer ica n age·group rec i 

Ken Johnson gets set to unleash javelin throw clurlng 
Friday a ction at National Masten Track and Field 
Champlonshlpo; at Mt. Hood Community Conege, 
J ohnson , who lives In ConnecUcut, competed In the:lt-

34 age group and won the event with a toss or 192-5. 
Finals In most events are scheduled ror Saturday and 
Sunday. 

He began running competitively in Masters meets . 
and ma de it to his fi rst national meet in 1977 . He was 
less t ha n com pletery successful , but t he next year he 
was back like gangbusters, setting world age-group 
records in the ZOO and 400 meters and lowering each Har r y KOI 

lasters must win 
against friends 

By DA VID HAMBURG 
Journal Sports Writer 

RESHAM - :'Competition" is not a fo ur- letter word 
nly if "winning" can be· construed as a dirty word 
"competition" be similarl\" labeled . 
, is holds true for th e old , as well as the young . 
~te . 

I don't believe for a moment that the participants in 
10th annual AAU Masters and Sub-Masters Nationai 
k and Field championships wh ich ended bere Su nda\' 
ust a bunch of hyperactive senior cit izens. enjoying a 
(end get-together. 
ure. there's ' a lot of fun and a lot of fellowship out 

•• I ,', 

here ." 44-year-old Hal Smith said as he peeled off a 
sweat sock in the almost·empt\· Mt Hood Communit\' 
CoUege locker room "But everv boov tri es t<, win . 

" If you lose, you can understand and accept it. 'because 
you 're friends. We 're mat ure people. We can forge t we 
lost and go out . have a beer and relax . 

"But you'd ra ther die than let them beat you ." 
Smi th. a tall , husky. yet flee t-of· foot pentathlon man. 

probably should understand this "win or die" compU lsion 
more readi ly than anyone else . He played defensive end 
ID the 1960s for one of the wi nningest teams in National 
Football League history. the Oakland Raiders. 

Smith. American ~ge·group record·holder (43 ) in the 
pentathlon . agreed that "certai nly, any time you add a 
record, you feel good about it. 

"But it's not like the younger athletes who fee l thev'"e 
gotta go out and kill the other guy. We don't have to be 
macho aDymo~e . We like to go out and have a good tim~ . 

"Stil l. when we get in the blocks . it's the same old 
thing . Time to start over again." 

Jack Greenwood, a world record-holder in a myriad c . 

events, showed his flair for making friends. 

A 53-year-old savings and loan manager, he traveled 
all t he way from tiny Medicine Lodge, Kan ., to run in 
seven event~ here because "it makes you feel clean, like 
you had a complete shower. 

"Basically. ( like to run for the fu ri of it . It 's my way of 
unwinding . (nstead of going out for a cocktail after a 
long day, I run ." 

Green wood ingratiated himself at t his Masters meet by 
stopping by to renew old acquaintances and enjoy cama· 
raderie. 

Then he pulled a fast one and walked off with five 
gold medals, including a world age-group record of 54 .24 
in the 400 meters. 

Who says you can' t beat old friends? 

Bevilaqua 

John Bev il aqua has res ig ned as 
Director of Marketing for Financial 
Fitness. in c. 

(Financial Fitness is the arm of the 
Occide ntal Life Insur-ance Co, of 
North Carolin a which is provid ing 
$35.000 to suppor t Maste rs track , 
fie ld and long d istance run ning in 
)979. ) 

" A 
:tncl 

sen ior manage ment change 
reassig nment of pe rsonnel." 

Be vil aq ua sta tes, 
to ask to be frec 
lIb lig ations. I 
,'llordin ate A.A l 
Occide nta l itT m 
\ AU Masters Tt 

'I , d Havely oj 
, t~ ~tirc !-' that " I 
Smi th aho ut the 
l11 l' nt " 'ith Occidel 
the Nationa l M 
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55-59 
Avery Bryant 
Jack Rice 

60-64 
*"Cl1ve Davies 

Robert Lehman 
Alan Wa terman 
Frans Pauwels 

65-69 
* William Andberg 

Norm Bright 
Fred Bierlein 

70-74 • --. Sid Hadden , 
len St. Clair 

75-79 
"i.Harold Chapson 

80-84 
*Paul Spangler 

5000 Meters 
30-34 
Steve Waggener 
Jacques Pittet 
Gordon Garlock 

35-39 
Hat'vey Franklin 
George Conefrey 
David Hambly 
Jack Petty 
Vic tor Wolfe 
David Bakley 
Neal Weber 

40-44 
Earl Ellia 
Robert WeIck 
Truman Clark 
J1m Davis 
Bob Langenbach 
Walt Schaefer 
David Page 
Thomas Cathcart 
Berna rd Babbit 

45-49 
+Ray Ha tton 
-tHa I Higdon 

Derek Mahaffey 
John Weldy 
Fie ld Ryan 
Sandor Szabo 

Jim O'Neil 
David Stevenson 
Roland Anspach 
Don Pickett 
Leo Sherry 
Robert Keupper 
Bill McChesney 
Ray Gill 

55-59 
Avery Bryant 
Joe Hallon 
Jack Rice 
James Stephenson 
Tom Holmer 

60-64 
'*Clive Davies 
James Oleson 
Frans f Pau'Wels 
Ro!>ert Lehman 

5000 Meters 
65-69 
William Andberg 
Norm Bright 

70-74 

55 CA 4.42.26 
59 FL 5.19.52 

64 OR 4.54.19 
60 CA 5. 19. 78 
61 CA 5.21. 79 
61 OR 5.27.49 

68 HN 5;11. 77 
69 WA 5.50.62 
69 CA 5.52.90 

n CA 5.45.07 
71 MO 6. 53 • 00 

77 III 5.46.36 

80 CA 7.01. 20 

34 CA 16.26.4 
33 WA 16.33.7 
30 OR 17.47.4 

CD 15.20.5 
37 OR 15.31.8 ' 
39 WA 15.38.9 
35 TX 15.48.3 
35 OR 15.53.9 

OR 17.21. 5 
OR 17.36.2 

43 WA 15.34.9 
CA 16.04.3 

44 CA 16.07.1 
OR 16.1"13.7 

42 WA 16.29.5 
WA 16.39.3 

40 WA 16.40.6 
41 CA 17.20.8 
42 WA 18.11.2 

47 OR 15.35.5 
48 IN 15.41.5 
45 WA 16.16.5 
45 AZ 16.49.9 

WA 18.31.5 
47 OR 19.17.9 

52 CA 16.41.6 
51 CA 16.58.0 
53 OH 17.08.4 
51 CA 17.51.9 
51 OR 18.11.4 
51 OR 18.15.7 

OR 18.27.8 
CA 18.34.7 

55 CA 17.50.4 
58 OR 19.09.5 
59 FL 19.58.0 
59 CA 23.43.3 
55 OR 25.18.5 

64 OR 17.27.5 
62 CA 18.31.3 
61 OR 19;06.5 
60 CA 20.36.1 

68 MN 19. 11. 7 
69 WA 23.03.7 

Sid Madden 72 CA 22.03.3 
Ken St.Clair 71 MO 24.48.1 
Paul Carmichael 71 CA 28.39.0 

10000 Meters 

30-34 
Del Martin 
Jacques Pittet 
Doug Stur.m 

35-39 

OR 33:43.8 
'30 lolA 34: ~ 1 . 9 

lolA 36:54.8' 

George Conefrey 37 Of{ 32: 04.5 
• David Hambly 39 lolA 32:22.7 

Ron Gayer 
Va 1 Schul tz 
John Prinos 

40-44. 

, '7 OR 35:08.7 
OR 35 : 24.~ 

rr lolA 35:39.2 

Earl Ell i s 43 
David Pitk'ethly 43 
Truman Cl ark 44 
Bob Langenbach ,42 

lilA 33:00.13 
lolA 33:~1.6 
CA 33:52.1 
lolA 33::i4,4 

Jim Davis 
Guy McFarland 

45-49 

34:41.3 
43 IA 35:30.9 

Jac::k Foster 47 NZ 30:41l . 5 
Ray Hatton 47 OR 32:17.4 
Derek t~ahaffey 45 lolA 34:41 . 3 
Joe Livesay 4S AZ 35:03.9 
Ed Rockwell ~~ 35:11.2 
Allyn Schwinkendorf WA 36:51.5 

50-54 
Jim O'Neil 
Pete Mundle 
Roland Anspach 

WOMEN 45-59 
Ruth Anderson 
Susan Means 
Gladys Lehman 

60-64 
James Oleson 
Frans Pauwels 
Robert Lehman 
65-69 

+ William Andberg 
Norm Bright 
70-74 
Ken St. Clair 
Pau 1 Carmichae 1 
80-84 

5'( CA 34: 03.6 
51 CA 34:03.7 
51 OH 35:33.5 

49 CA 40: 57 . 9 
4~ OR 51 :35.4 

' 51 CA 56: 58 .4 

62 CA 38.38.9 
61 OR 40.08.7 
60 CA 42.07.9 

68 MN 40. 26. 5 
69 WA 44.41. 9 

71 CA 55.37.2 
71 MO 56.53.5 

+ Paul Spangler 80 CA 49.22.7 

110 Meters Hiah tlurd1es 
30-34 
Chuck Holt 
Frederick Johnston 

32 IL 16.29 
CA18.42 

35-39 
+Walt Butler 38 CA 14.71 
Cornelium McCormack CA 15 . 38 
Jim McAbee 37 OR 15.46 
Bryan Westfield 37 MI 16.11 

40-44 
Lew Thorne 
Charles Fuller 
Hal Smith 
Bruce Mills 

45-49 
Van Parrish 
Tony Nasra11e 
Dave Douglas. 

50-54 

41 OR 16.23 
CA 16.23 

44 CA 16.50 
40 IL 18.38 

45 CA 17.08 
47 CA 18.84 
48 NM 21.08 

*Jack Greenwood 55 KN 15.57 
Robert Higginbotham CA 19.96 
Don Donnelly 51 CA 20.33 

55-59 
Bob Hunt 
Burl Girt 
Albert Johnson 

60-64 

59 CA 17.48 
59 CA 18.46 
57 OR 19.98 

~Mora1.. t3 GA 20.33 
Robert Littlejohn 60 QA 20.99 

65-69 
Che"tBeach 
Bud Deacon 

70-74 
A.J .Puglizevich 
Louis Pet'fsenyi 

75-79 
* Herb Anderson 

400 Meter Hurdles 
30-34 
Matt Pruitt 
Chuck Holt 
Roaer Carlon 
Wa rren Cuuaning. 

35-39 

67 CA 19.37 
67 OR 21.86 

71 CA '29.12 
71 CA 47.00 

77 CO 27.36 

CD 55.85 
32 IL 57.86 
33 CA 60.12 

.30 CA 65.70 

Bryan wa.tUeld ' 37 HI 57.92 
Cornelius McCormaCK CA 57.99 

40-44 
+ Gary Mi ller 

Edward 01eata 
James Thomas 

42 CA 57.74 
CA 58.76 
CA 58.84 

John Brocksmith 
Lewis Thorne 
Bruce Mills 
Raymond Fitzhugh 

GA 60.13 
41 OR 60.99 
40 IL 66.27 
44 CA 76.70 

45-49 
Van Parrish 
Tony Na sra 11s 
Al Sheahen 

50-54 
* Jack Greenwood 

Dean Smith 
+ Ed Dowell 

Bob Holmes 

45 CA 63\82 
47 CA 64.71 
47 CA 65.00 

Bob McGui['e 
David Stevenson , 

53 KN 60.08 
53 IL, 63.66 
52 CA 64.88 
51 CA 67.07 ' 
52 CA 68.88 
51 CA 69.00 

55- 59 
Bob Hunt 
Bob Pruitt 
Avery Bryant 

60-64 
* Alan Waterman 

65-69 
* John Satti 

Bud Deacon 
, * Fred BierLein 

75-79 
* Herb Anderson 

59 CA 67.96 
56 OR 69.j:8 
55 CA 74.95 

61 CA 76.06 

65 CA 76.99 
67 OR 78.26 
69 CA108.42 

77 COl03.99 

3000 Meter Steeplechase 
30-34 
Allan Lichtman 32 MD 11.06.1 

35-39 
Valdemar Schul 
Gary Timms 
Yawnick Ira' 
Lew Sthoenberg 

40-44 
Bob Langenbach­
Kent Guthrie 

45-49 
+ Hal Higdon' 

Dan Halvorson 
Gerald Warrock 

50- 54 
+ David Stevenson 
+ Roland Anspach 

Bob Holmes 
Jim waste 

55-59 
+ Avery Bryant 

60-64 
* Alan Waterman 

65-69 
* ~cTarnahan 

70-74 
* Paul Carmichael 

Kelly Bagby 

5000 Meter W .. 1k 
30-34 

OR 10.59.5 
37 OR 11.11.3 
38 CA 11.17.3 
38 OR 11.27.9 

42 WA 10.37.9 
' 43 CA 10.38.1 

48 IN 10.20.4 
46 CA 11 . 11.4 
45 OR 11.32.1' 

51 
53 OH 
51 
50 

10.53.7 
11.17.4 
12.51.5 
13.57.9 

5S' CA 11.41 . 0 

61 CA 12.53.6 

67 OR 15.33.6 

71 CA 18.36.5 
OR 21.11.8 

David Himmelberger CA 22.26.9 
Marty Stitzel 34 WA 26.03.3 

40-44 
+ Ron Laird 41 CA 22.26.9 

Raymond Fitzhugh 44 CA 31.41. 7 
Jim Cullen ' 32.29.9 

45-49 
Bob Fine 
Dick Vanderhoff 
Paul Kaa1d 

50-54 
Robert Mimm 
John Friesen 
Bob l'IcGuire 

~ 
Don Johnson 
Don Jacobs 

65-69 

48 NY 26.05.1 
47 WA 26.27.6 
46 WA 27.31.6 

54 NJ 25.26.0 
52 CA 29.54.5 
52 CA 30.05.5 

62 NJ 28.08.5 
60 OR 35.53.6 

Gordon Wallace 69 AZ 29.29.6 

70-74 
Chesley Unruh 73 CA 31.53.3 

20 Kilometer Walk ' 
30-34 
Dave Himmelberg~r 33 CA 1.39.59 

40-44 
Ron Laird 
Ray Fit zhugh 

45-49 
Bob Fine ' 
Dick Vanderhoff 
Paul Kaalb 

50-54 
+Robert M1111111 

John Friesen 

60-64 
Don Johnson 

65-69 
+~n wallace 

Javelin 
30-34 

41 CA 1.51. 50 
44 CA 2.29.15 

48 NY 1.55.49 
47 WA 1.57.57 
46 WA 1.59.23 

54 NJ 1.52.53 
52 CA 2.23.34 

62 NJ 2.04.20 

69 AZ 2.12.45 

Ken John.on 
Frederick John,on 
Jim Truj illo 
Richard Stepp 

CN 192'5 
33 CA 174' 9 
32 OR 173' 4 
34 CA 143'1 

35-39 
' Doug Well. 35 CA 200'10 
Cornelius McCormack CA 165'11 

40-44 
Larry , Stuart 
Phil Conley 
Robert Darling 

45-49 
+Spencer Letcher 

Ralph Sutton 
Robert lionneman 

50-54 
Harn Hawke' 
Harold Wallace 
Phil walden 
Emson Grimm 

55-59 
John Ulam 
Bob Stone 
Don Harris 
Jim Holland 

60-64 
* 'iiii:'l Moralel 

65-69 
Phillip' Henn 

70-74 

CA 212'2 
44 CA 192'0 
.4.4 OR 173 1 11 

47 CA 181'0 
48 CA 170'0 
48 I,L-: 126' 7 

'50 CA 133'0 
52 CA 109'4 
52 OR 96'2 
54 CA 49'4 

55 PA 124' 8 
59 CA 115' 11 
59 PA 105' 3 
55 OR 91'6 

63 CA 163'0 

66 10 71'10 

* Winfield McFadden 74 CA 108' 9 

75- 79 
*Herb Anderson 

Shot Put 
30-34 

77 CO 92' ~ 

Fred Johnston 33 CA 39'0 
Warren Cummings 30 CA 36'3 3/4 
William Henderson3) CA 35'9 

35-39 
Doug Wells 
Edward Hill 

35 CA 49'9 1/2 
37 CA ' 4648 

Cornelius McCormick CA 38'3 

40-44 
Doug Smart 
James Hart 
Hal Smith 
Richard Folt 
Carl Klehm 

45-49 
Phil Brady 
Stewart Thompson 
Spencer Letcher 
Dave Douglass 

50-54 
Harry Hawke 
Harold \.Iallace 
Phil Walden 

11:2.2 

43 WA 46'6 
43 HI 44'2 
44 CA 42'2 
41 CA 38' 7 1/2 
41 IL 36'4 1/4 

45 CO 45'0 
46 CA 41'10 
46 CA 33' 11 
48 NM 28 ',.0 

1/4 
1/ 2 
1/4 

50 CA 43'0 1/2 
52CA37'1 
52 OR 35'3 

William Walmroth 56 HI 46'8 1/4 
James Hot land 55 OR 39'2 
David Batchelor 59 PA 35'4 

60-64 
Jack Thatcher 
Mike Castaneda 
Wi Uiam Coleman 

65-69 
James York 
Ross Carter 
Phill1p Henn 

63 CA 45'11 3/4 
60 MN 45'11 1/2 
61 VI 44'11 1/2 

66 CA 43'4 
65 OR 41' 11 
66 10 33'4 

continued 
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70'-74 
Louis Perfsenyi 
A.J.Puglizevich 
Bob HacCongly 

75-79 
Herb Anderson 

Hammer Throw 

~ 

71 CA 37'4 3/4 
71 CA 35'9 1/4 
71 CA 34'10' 

77 cO' 29'6 1/2 

Bill Henderson 33 CA 75'S 

35-39 
~d Hill 37 GA 112 ' 0' . 

40'-44 
Gordon Bobbe 11 
James Hart 
Carl Klehm 
Hal Smith 
Dick Fox 

45-49 
Stewart Thomson 
Frank Hiller 
Dave Dougiass 
Gerald Wojeck 

55-59 
David Batchelor 
Ra Iph Hassm"an 
R.K.Stone 
James Holland 

50'-54 
Phil Walden 
Emson Grimm 

60'-64 

43 CA 149' 8 
43 HI 124' 0 
41 IL 114' 2 
44 CA 10'1'7 
41 CA 75' 2 

46 CA 159'5 
45 O'R 112'2 
48 NM 96'7 
49 CA 93'1 

59 PA 
55 CA 
59 CA 
55 O'R 

lU'l 
99'4 
83'4 
63' 5 

52 O'R 5B'O' 
54 CA 48' 9 

C.R.ColUns CR 117' 3 
Hike Casteneda 60' WA 10'3'1 

65-69 
+ J ames York 

Phillip Henn 
B.J.LaBorde 

70'-74 
*Randolph Hubbell 

Louis Perfsenyi 
Jack Carson 

75-79 
Herb Anderson 

High Jump 
30'-34 
Dennis O'lafson 
Ken Johnson 
Warren Cummings 

35-39 

66 CA 123'6 
66 10' B3'l 
69 OR 80"4 

70' CA 124 ' 3 
71 CA 99'10' 
70' HI 73'9 

77 CO' 64'3 

32 O'R 6'1 
CO' 5 '8 

30' CA 5'4 

Alonzo . Littlejohn37 HI 6'0' 
Mike Atterman 38 HI 5'6 

40'-44 
Tom Langenfie ld 
Robert Darling 
Floyd Smith 

45-49 

42 liN 5'10' 
44 O'R 5'8 
44 10' 5'7 

~ Richa rd Richardson lL 6'0' 
'-'*Nick Newton 46 CA 5'10' 
* Ed Austin . 49 CA 5' 6 

50-54 
'HalBuck 
Phil Walden 
!a rold Wallace 

:> 5-59 
Burl Gist 
Dave Brown 
Bob- Pruitt 

60'-64 
Orval Gillett 
James Vernon 

65-69 
J ames McCarthy 
Chet Beach 
3ud Deacon 

70'-74 

54 O'R 4'10 1/ 8 
52 OR 4' 6 1/ 8 
52 CA 4' 4 1/ 8 

59 CA 5 ' 3/ 4 
57 CA 4' 8 1/8 
56 CA 4' 6 1/ 8 

60' CA 4'7 3/4 
63 CA 4'4 1/ 8 

65 NV 4'4 1/8 
67 CA 4 ' 2 1/8 
67 OR 4' 1/8 

·Loui. Perfaenyi 71 CA 3'10 
Homer Van Gelder 74 CA 3'10' 
Winfield McFadden 74 CA 2 ' 8 1/2 

75-79 
Herb Ander80n 77 CO' 4' 2 1/8 

Dhcu. 
30-34 
Frederfck John8ton33 CA 118'1 
Warren Cummings 30' CA 110"2 
William Henderson 33 CA 92'6 

.ll:1! . 
Doug wella 35 CA 148' i 
Edward Hill 37 CA 144'9 
Corneliu. McCormack CA 123'9 

40-44 
~UlQphreY8 
James Hart 
Hal Smith 
Doug S~rt 
Richard Fox ' 
Carl Klehm 
Sam Fott 

45-49 
Phil Brady_ 
Stewart Thom80n 
Spencer Letcher 
Robert S6nneman 
Dave Douglas8 

~ 
Byrl Thomp.on 
Harry Hawke 
Richard Straub 
Harold Wallace 
H'aro1.d Buck 
Em80n Grimm-

55-59 
William Wa lmroth 
R.K.Stone 
Ralph Hassman 
Hark Henderson 
James Holland 

60-64 (meters) 
*'Mike Casteneda 

I< Jack Thatcher 
*Paul F:lnning 

William Coleman 
Hurray O'guss 

65-69 (meters) 

43 CA 14B'3 1/2 
43 HI 138'8 3/4 
44 CA 122'2 
43 WA 121'1 
41 CA 115' 10' 1/ 
41 lL 10'5'2 1/2 
40 O'R 91' 3 1/4 

4:1 CO 14B'4 3/4 
46 CA 141'6 1/21 
47 CA 112'1 1/2 
48IL 93'103/4 
48 NM B1'53/4 

· : ;~ .; t. 147'3 
50' CA 136' 1 3/8 
51 CA 119'B 1/2 
52 CA 115' 5 3/4 
54 O'R 89'6 
54 . 55'8 1/4 , 

56 MI 130'1 
59 CA 110" 5 
55 CA 10'8'4 1/2 
59 CA 90" 11 
55 'CR 90" 1/2 

60 MN 43.67 
63 CA 40' . 95 
64 CA 4O'!30 
61 VI 39.26 , 
62 NY 32.29 

60-64 
Bill Mora les 
Robert Littlejohn 

65-69 
* John Satti 

70-74 
*Winfield McFadden 

Homer VanGelder 
Jack Carson 
Henry Sc~umacher 

75-79 
Herb Anderson 

85-89 
*~e Whee)er 

TRIPLE JUMP 
30-34 
Carl Flowers 
Paul Roberts 
Ken Johnson 

35-39 
Higuel Ucovich 
Alonzo Littlejohn 

40'-44 . 
Melvin' Ramey 
Kermit Walker 
Haig Bohigian 
Tom Langenfeld 

45-49 
Shirley Davisson 
Tony Nasralla 

50'-54 
Albert Brenda 
Donald Donnelly 
Phil Walden 
Freeman Marr. 
John Friesen 

I 
. 55-59 

,r' ../Raymond Spencer 
J Dave .Brown 

James Johnson 

60-64 

63 CA 15 ' 4 1:" 
60WA14'7 

65 CA 15'8 JIt 

74 CA 
74 CA 
70' HI 
70 10 

13' 1 /~ 
11'3 n 
9'5 l ··t 
9' 3 3/4 

77 CO' 10'2 1 j 

86 CR 8'3 3 /~ 

32 CA 42'lO'Y, ' 
3-3 WA 42' 1 

CO' 38' 11 , 

38 CA 38'1 
37 HI 35'4 

41 CA 42'9 
43 CA 40"10'4 
43 NY 35'4'/11 ' 
42 MN 34' 5 '! l " 

49 CA 37' 7 'J; 
47 CA 36'4 

51 CA 34'2 'j. " 
51 CA 33'8 
52 CR 30~10'j, 

54 TN 29' 2 'It '· 
52 CA 26'lO" i 

56 CA 34' 2 'il . 

57 CA 33'10" :-' 
5 7 CA 32' 9 " f '. +James York 

James McCarthy 
Phillip Henn 
Wayne Griffith 
H.J.LaBorde 
Ray Moe 

66 CA 34.57 
65 NV 31.99 
66 CA 30' . 31 
67 CA 25.95 
69 O'R 23.94 
69 O'R 20.22 

Robert Littlejohn 60' WA 27'l'/~ 

70'-74 (meters) 
*Ken Carnine 71 CA/ 38.27 

Louis Perfyni 71 CA 32 . 56 
Bob HacCongly 71 CA 28,.40' 

*Winfield McFadden74 CA 26 . 0'7 
Randolph Hubbell 70' CA 24.54 
Jack .Carson 70' HI 23.85 

75-79 (meters) 
*Herb Anderson 77 CO' 23.30' 

85-89 (meters) 
*~e ~heeler 86 O'R 19.69 

LCNG JUMP 30-34 
Carl F10wers-,-32 CA 22 ', 7 1/4 
Luther Goin 31 CR 20'6 
ai11 Henderson 33 CA 15' Q 1/4 

35· 39 
Sam Robinson 
Robert Gent 
Miguel Ucovich 

40·44 
Ketmit Walker 
Sam Taylor 
Cha rles Fuller 
Phil Conley 
Haig Bohigian 

45-49 

CA 19'11 3/4 
38 CR 19' 1/2 
38 CA 19' 1/2 

43 CA 20'4 1/2 
OR 19'1 1/4 
CA 18'8 1/4 

44 CA 17'10 1/ 2 
43 NY 16'8 3/4 

* Shirley'Davisson49 CA 20'1 3/4 
Tony Nasral1a 47 CA 19'1 1/ 4 
Philip Schlegel 49 CA 18'2 
Jerry Donley 49 CO' 17'7 1/2 

50-54 
Albert llrenda 
DWl Donnelly 
Pb'U Walden 

55-59 
Ra ymond Spencer 
Jame s Johnson 
Dave Brown 
Lou Carl i ne 
Bob Pruitt 
Don Harris 

51 CA 17'9 3/4 
51 CA 16'3 3/4 
52 OR i3'4 

56 CA 1 7' 6 3 Ii 
57 CA 1 7 ' 1/2, 
57 CA 16'9 J / 4 
59O'R16' 2 1 i 
56 PR15'3 i; ~ 
57 PA 14'9 I " 

~ 
John Satti 
Bud Deacon 

70-74 
*Wi nfield ~Fadden 

Homer VanGelder 
Jack Carson 
Henry Schumacher 

75-79 
~Anderson 

POLE VAULT 
30'-34 
Warren CUDIII1ngi 
Richard Stepp 
Tim Sills 

~ 
Brian Bers-nan 
Gary Isham 

40-44 
'Ge'rud Purma. 
Ron Fleming 
Lealie weed 
Hal SiDi th 

45-49 
* Vic"COOK 

Jerry Donley 
Jim Holmeil 
Dave Douglall 

~O-54 
Don Grosh 
Harold Wallace 
Albert Brenda 

55-59 
o;w;-BcI8wn 
James Johnson 
Lowdl Donnelly ' 

60-64 
Jim Vernon . 
O'rval Gtl.1ett 

65-69 
Bud Deacon 

65 CA 29'S 1/4 
67 O'R 28'9 3/ 4 

74 CA 27 ' 4 
74 CA 24 ' 3 
70' HI 20"11 . 
70 WA 19'7 3/4 

77 CO' 24' 1/2 

30' CA 14'0' 
34 CA 12'6 
31 O'R 12 ' 6 

' O'R 12'6 
WA 10'0' 

44 CN 12'0' 
42 CA ll'6 

CA 11' 0' 
44 CA 1.0" 0' 

44 CA 13' 9 
49 CO' 12'6 

·48 O'R 11' 0 
48 MN 9'6 

54 CA 10' 5 
52 CA 10"6 
51 CA 10"6 

57 CA 11 '0' 
57 CA 9' 6 
59 C~ 8' 6 

63 CA 11'6 
' 60' CA 9'6 

67 O'R '9'0' 
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lQ.:J.!! 
* Bob Mc:C onll Y 

'Loulll Perfenyi 
A.J. PuI1izevich 

WOMEN 
li50Meters 
30-34 
Janice Henderson 
35-39 
Miriam Gerard 
40-44 
Cherrie Sherrard 
Almeta Parish 
Christa MUler 
Grace Vanderhoff 
Connie Wilson 
45-49 

* ~ Obera -
Gretchen Snyder 
50'-54 
Shirley Kinsey 
55-59 
Edith Leiby 
Maggie_King 
Dorothy Donnelly 
60'-64 

,Josephine Ko1da 
Marjorie Hunt ' 
65- 69 

* Polly Clarke 

200 meters 
30'-34 
Janice Henderson 
35-39 
Hiki Hervey 
40'-44 
A1meta Parish 
45-49 

* Irene Obera 
* Gretchen Snyder 

50-54 
Shirley Kinsey 
Mary Cooper 
55-59 
Edith Leiby 
60-64 

* Josephine Ko1da 
65-69 

* Polly Clarke 

400 Meters 

1B.2 
Miki Hervey 
Miriam GerarA 
40'-44 
Almeta .Pariah 
Grace Vanderhoff 

·45-49 
* Irene Obera 
* Gretchen Snyder 

50-54 
* Rllen Rose 

55-59 

71 CA 8'0 
71 CA 6'1) 
71 CA 6'0 

32 CA 15.2 

38 CA 13.7< 

41 CA 13.20 
43 CA 13.:65 

CA 13.94 
41 WA 15.27 
44 0'& . 16.i>O 

- 46 CA 12.63 
45 CA 15.07 

50 CA '15.93 

56 HI . 18.06 
WA 18,82 

56 CA 19.64 

61 CA 17.08 
CA 20.~ 

68 COl l6.72 

32 CA 31.78 

37 TX 29.11l 

43 CA 28.71 

46 CA 26.57 
45 CA 30.81 

50' CA 32.82 
CA 40.00 

56 HI 40.85 

61 CA 38,08 

68 CO 35.56 

37 TX 64',0'1 
38 CA 64.79 

43 CA 64.411 
41 WA 70.42 

46 CA 61. 73 
45 CA 68.31i 

51 CA 74 . 81 

1.' Ed! th Leiby 
60'-64 

56 HI 88.13 

*Josephi ne Ko1da 
65-69 

'*Polly Clarke 

80'0 Meteu 
30'-34 
Remzy Huseny 
35-39 

61 CA 92.25 

68 CO' 84.60 

33 CA 3.40'.22 

~icki Hervey 37 TX 2.29.78 
Miriam Gerard 38 CA 2. 33.82 

*Judy Groombridge '39 WA 2 .• 39.68 
40'-44 

*Noel Murchie 44 HI 2 . 39.49 
45-49 

*Ruth Anderson 49 CA 2.45 . 92 

~ 
*Edith Leiby 56 HI 3.33.12 

65-68 
<Polly Clarke 68 .CC 3 . 38.02 

150'0' Heters 
30'-34 
Ramsey Husney 
35-39 

I<Judy Groombridge 
Hi riam Gerard 
40-44 
Sandra Knott 

*Noel Murchie 
50'-54 

*Ellen Rose 
~ggie King 
55-59 
Edith Leiby --

33 CA 7.22.5 

39 WA 5.23.52 
38 CA 5.44.38 

42 CH 4.58.42 
44 HI 5.32.65 

51 CA 6.20.17 
_, 7.37.80 

56 .HJ 7 .• 14.47 
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5000 Meters 
30-34 
Vicki Tino 30 OR 18.20.2. 
35-39 

*Judy Coroombridge39 WA 19.24.4 
40-44 

*Sandra Knott 42 OH 18.22.5 
Noel Murchie 44 HI 20.55.1 
45-49 
Marsha McChesney 
Susan Means 
Delores Orth 
55-59 
Gladys Lehman 

10000 Metera 
30-34 
Vicki Tino 

_ 40-44 
Sandra Knott 
Noel Murchie 
Shirley Milliman 

OR 23.41.8 
46 OR 24.16.7 
47 OR 28.20.2 

CA 27.02.8 

.30 OR 38.04.2 

42 .OH 38.05.5 
44 HI 42.08.6 

47.05.9 

~ FIELD EVENTS 
LONG JUMP. 
30-34 
Ramsey Husney 
40-44 
C"ililita Miller · 

JAVELIN 
30-34 
~e. Henderson 
Ramsey Huseny 
Susan Sherke 
40-44 
C"hrtsta Miller 
45-49 

* Marjorie Fox 
SO-54 

* Shirley Kinsey 

TRI PLE JUMP 
45-49 
Christa Hiller 

HIGH JUMP 
40-44 

33 CA 9'0 

CA- 13'10 3/4 

32 CA 71 '6 
33 CA 60'4 
34 IL 57'2 

CA 102'0 

46 CA 51'10 

50 CA 66'7 

27' 1/ 4 

* Cl:lerrie Sherl'ard 41 CA 4' 6 
Chriata Hiller CA 4" 6 

,HOI' PUT ' 
JO-34 
Janic.e Hl!nderson 
Susan Sherke 
Ramsey Huseney 
~ 

* Cherrie Sherrard 
* Connie Wll son 

Almeta Parish 
Ursula Schrieber 
.!!1:!!l 
Marjorie Fox 
50-54 

* Shirley Kinsey 
* Cor a Ger ber 

55- 59 .. 
~hy Donnel l y 

~ (metel'S') 
~ 
Ramsey HUlleny 
Susan Sharke 
40-44 
~ie Sherl'ard 
Connie Wilson 
Ursula Schrieber 
50-54 

'*Si\iriey Kinsey 
* Cora Gerbel' 

45-49 
* Marjorie Fox 

HEN's PENTATHLON 
30-34 
Douglas Shaw· 
Greg M rshall 
Jamt!s Trujillo 
B111 Henderson 
35-39 ' 
Robert Gent 
Miguel Ucovith ' 
JOM Bruington 
40-44 
Sam White 

32 CA 24' 11 1/4 
34 IL 24' 5 
33 CA 20'3 1/2 

41 CA 36'7 
44 OR 28'8 
43 CA 26' 10 
41 CA 24'0 

46 CA 15' 8 1/2 

50 CA 24 ' 4 
52 OR 19' 2 

56 CA 19 ' 10 1/2 

33 CA 20'65 
34IL 19.88 

41 CA 27.68 
44 OR 24.68 
41 CA 22.44 

50 CA 22.77 
52 OR 16.88 

46 CA 14.34 

34 CA 2890.5 
.2n8.5 

32 OR 2246.5 
33 CA 1680 

38 OR 2157.5 
38CA 1619.5 

1507.·5 

Hal Smith 
Leslie Weed 
Ray Fitzhugh ' 
Don Greg 
45-49 

44 CA 2481.32 
CO 2291.76 

44 CA 1558 : 48 
772.60 

Richard Richard.on ~ 2606.67 
Robert Sonneman 48 IL 2454.65 
Philip Schlegel 49 CA 2243.65 
Tony Nasra11a 47 CA 2174.28 
Dave Douglas 48 NM 1965.63 
Gerald Wojeck 49 CA ;758.55 
Randall Lindsey 45 OK 1019.84 
Gene Ford 876.26 
50-54 
Harry Hawke 
Bob Roemer 
Hal Wallace 
Bob Chado 
Richard Nordquist 
Al Brepda 
Dick Staub 
William Fix 
55-59 
Ray Spencer 
Dan Harris 
Joe Mallon 
70-74 
Ken Carnine 
Jack Carson 
Henry Schumacher 
75-79 
Herb Anderson 

WOMEN'S PENTATHLON 
30-34 
Ramsey HussilY 

50 CA 3296.0 
54 CA 3127.26 
52 CA 2722.4 
5-2 CO 2216.0 
54 OR 2015.1 
51 CA 2006.9 
51 CA 1807.3 
53 WA 1598.24 

56 CA 2968.68 
57 PA 2682.89 
58 OR 1587.63 

71 CA 3761.7 
70 HI 641.4 
70 WA 545.4 

77 CO 2793.75 

33 CA 436.2 

40-44 
Cherrie Sherrard 41 CA 2834.84 
Christel Miller 2305.3 

CODE OF STATES 
AZ ARIZONA 
CA CALIFORNIA 
CD CANADA · 
CN CONNeticutt 
eo COLORADO 
DC DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA 
FL FLORIDA 
GA GEO~IA 
HI HAWAII 
ID IDAHO 
IL ILLINOIS 
IN INDIANA 
KN KANSAS 
LA LOUISIANA 
HI HICHIGAN 
MN MINNESOTA 
MO MISSOURI 
10 IOWA 
NV NEVADA 
NJ NEW JERSEY 
NM NEW . MEXICO 
NY NEW YORK 
OR OREGON 
PA PENNSYLVANIA 
TN TENNESSEE 
TX TEXAS 
UT UTAH 
VI VIRGINIA 
WA WASHINQ;TON 

Philadalphia Masters capture 
Eastern Regi-onal team ti-tles 

PHILADELPHIA, Pa. J une 23. The 
Philadelphia Masters Club won 3 of 
the 4 team titles to highlight action in 
the Eastern Regional Outdoor 
Masters Track and Field Champion­
ships at Franklin Field. 

The host squad took the age 30-39, 
SO-59 and 60-69 team championships. 
The New York Masters won the 40-49 
crown. 

Among the highlights: 
-Lloyd Riddick's 22.9 in the 40-44 

200. ' 
-B. Lancaster's 24.1 in the SO-54 

200. 
-John Sanders' 52.6 in the 40-44 

400. 
- E. Hothar's 4:23.3 in the 40-44 

1500. ' 
- Ke lsey Brown's . 4:33.2 in the 

SO-54 1500 and 2: 14.0 in the 800. 
-Bob Fine's 25:49 in the 45-49 

5000 walk. 
-R. Jackson 's 19'4" long jump, 

16.7 llOH and 107'2" Discus wins in 
the 40-44 group. 

-So Hagey's 208'6" javelin toss in 
the 30-34 category. 

·-B. Detweiler's 122'7" in the 
65-69 Hammer. 

Eastern Regional AA U Outdoor 
Championships-Track & Field­
June 23, 1979,Franklin Field Phila 
Pa., 80 degree's and clear.' . ., 
*meet record 
+world age-group record 
F Female . 
,t Tie 

100 meters. 
30-34 
K. Johnson ~ , .... ' 

.' A. Wrig·ht 
'. ' J. Lafferty 

32 UN 10.8 '·, 
'-32 Pl-l 11. 5 

30 PM 11. 7 " 

B. Hill 
A. Hill 
40-44 

* J. Moon 
L. Riddick 
A. Budd 
R. Barnes 
45-49 

t* M. Brown 
S. Derry 
R. Enders 
50-54 

* B. Lancaster 
E. Schule.r 
L. Trudey 
M. Lentzer 
H. Colen 
55- 59 
J. Manno 
O. Harr i s 
flO- 64 

* M. Neuhof 
M. Pirkl 
L. Rothbart 
70- 74 

- * M:J5'El1a 
Women _ 
30-34 
A. Mapps 
D. Shippen 
N .. Ransom 
40-44 
!CTohnBon 
A. Ciru1nick 
45-49 
C. McKenzie 

200 meters 
30-34 
A. Wright 
K. Johnson 
C. Grossman 
P. Lane 
35-39 
J. Burnett ..: 

, B. Stanford 
B. Hill 

. E. King 
R. A1exande'r 
G. Majors 
H. Cohen 

37 EO U . 7 
37 PM 11.8 

41 NY -11.3 
44 NY 11.4 
43 NY 11. 7 
42 PC 12.0 

45 SH 11. 9 
45 PM 12.0 
47 PV 12.4 

51 PP Ii. 9 
52 UN 11. 9 
50 UN 13.3 
53 NY 13.5 
57 NY 13.6 

~8 NJ 13 .2 
55 PM 13. 4 

63 NY 13 . 9 
61 PM 13.9 
~4 tlY 14.4 

71 NJ 15.2 

31 FK 14.2 
30 FK 14.5 
33 FK 14.5 

42 Fk 15.2 
44 NT 15.8 

47 NY 14.6 

32 PH 23.0 
32 UN 24.7 
32 PM 24.8 
30 7 26.0 

39 PI' 22.4 
38 PM 22.7 -
37 EO 23.1 
37 GS 24.2 
35 NY 24.3 
35 1>H ,24.9 
36PM 27.8 Ed Oleata 

Larn Means 
Haig Bohigian 
I'h11 Conley 

42 GA 3135.42 
.CM 3018.08. 

. .44 CO 2711. 04 
1'+3~Y. 258'5.,24 

CA 2520.48 
' :., C. Grossman . 32 PM 12.3 

40-44 
~';" i .~ ~:.\, .~.,~ 

35-39 .;," 
B. Stanfo-rd ~ ; 
J. ' Burdett 

38 PM . .u '. 4 .~;' >., 
39 PP 11.6 

L. Riddic:k-­
J. Moon 

, 44 In' 22.9 
t 41 NY 23.0 

A. 
D. 
R. 
M. 
H. 
J. 

BUdd 
Pratt 
Barnes 
0lNea1 
Bohigian 
Snell 

43 NY 23.1 
43 PM 23.8 
42 PC 24.1 
41 PC 24.4 
43 NY 24.8 
44 PM 24.9 

L. Trout . 44 GS 25.0 
T. Lingenfe1ter40 'I 25.6 
45-49 . 
M. Brown 
S. Derry 
R. Parker 
C. Summers ' 
50-54 

*B. Lancaster 
E. Schuler 
L. Trubey 
~. Lentzer 
H. Colen 
55-59 
J. Manno 
60-64 

*M. Neuhof 
H. Pick1 
}{. Mulliken 
70-74 

*M. D'El.1a 
Women 
30-34 
'A. Mapps 
N. Ranson 
D. Shipper 
35-39 
S. Paskin 
~ 
L. Black 
Ik JOMson 
45-49 

+C. McKenzie 

400' meter run 
30-34 
B. Whitehead 
G. Jenkins 
J. OIDe11 
C. Grossman 
35-39 
J . Burnett 
B. Hill . 
E. King 

Women 
40-44 
L. Black 

J. Sanders 
M. O'Neal 
D. Pratt 
H. Bohigian 
J. Bradley 
R. Barnes 
R. McC lintock 
C. Pauling . 
45-49 

*R. Enders 
H. Scott 
50- 54 
R. Willis 
L. Trubey 
B. Parsons' 
55-')9 
D. Ha rr i s 
A . Mess i n8er 
60- 64 

*M. Pi ck1 
R. Mulliken 
65-69 
C. Witkowski 
S. Honastero 

800 meter run 
30.-34 
A. Jentlings 
A. Lichtman 
G. Jenkins 
J. o.'Dell 
R. Plemons 
P. Taylor 
35-39 
J. Demma 
M. Canoyer 
J. Verdier 
T. Strah \ 
~ 
L. Harvey 
E. Hotham 
C. Pauling 
B. Kte,bs 
F. Bove 
S. Young 
45-49 
R. Enders 
R. Glatz 
M. Geut'tin 
G. Jackson 

45 SH 24.6 
45 PM 25.6 
45 '" 26.9 
49 TR 27.5 

51 1>M 24.1 
52 UN 25.2 
50 UN 28.4 
53 NY 28.6 
51 NY 29.0. 

58 NJ 27.8 

&3 NY 29.3 
61 PM 28.5 
63 FA 30.5 

71 NJ 31. 5 

31 FK 29.4 
33 FK 31. 7 
3D FK 31. 7 

. 35 FK 29.5 

40 NY 30.2 
42 FK 32.3 

47 NY 30.7 

3D UN 51. 5 
32 UN 52.0. 
3D PO 54.7 
32 PM 55.1 

39 PP 50.5 
37 EO. 51.4 
37 GS 52.3 

40 NY 67. i 

42 pM 52.1 
41 Pc 52. S 
43 PM 54.3 
43 NY 55.6 
43 PV 55.7 
42 PC 56.0. 
44· PM 56.3 
44 NY 62.3 

4 7 PV 54.7 
47 UN 59.9 

'50 UN '8.4 
. 50 UN fl2.4 

53 PM 6!.i 

55 PM 61. 5 
56 NY 62 . 4 

61. PM 71. 6 
63 FA 71. ~ 

66 JS fl9.7 
67 PM 74.7 

j3 PH 2.04.6 
3£ PV 2.05.4 
33 UN 2.06.3 
30 HI' 2.06.4 
32 UN 2.10..3 
34 UN 2.28.' 

39 PV 2,01.6 
~, UN 2.06.6 
37 PV 2.10.9 
19 UN 2 ~14.2 ., 
40. PM 2.0.8.2 
42 PM 2.0.8.2 
44 NY 2.09.0. 
44 NY 2.12.0 
41 PH 2.14.8 
40 PH 2.14.9 

47 PV 2.13.9 
49 JS 2.16.9-
45 WP . 2.18.4 
4fl PH 2.19 . 7 

continued 
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J. Kernan 
J. llarnes 

. 50- 54 
*1<. Brown 
55-59 
A. Messinger 
D. Geer 

60-64 
*A . Newman 
65- 69 
C. Wi tkowsk i 
S. Monastero 
F -C. McKenzie 
1500 meter run 
30- 34 
A. J enn ings 
J. Wat e rs 
E. Andrews 

49 NY 2.22.0 
46 PM 2.52.8 

51 Js 2.14.0 

56 NY 2.20.6 
59 CA 2 . 39. 5 

63 JM 2 .32.8 

· 66 JS 2.43 .3 
67 PM 2.52 .0 

47 NY ~ .40. 6 

33 PM 4. 03 . 9 
30 SJ 4 .04 . 6 
32 PH 4.06.3 
33 SJ 4.08 . 7 R. Mye rs 

J . Grube 
R. Clemons 
35- 39 

_ 30 UN 4 .14.3 
3Z UN 4.15 . 0 

J. Verdie r 
D. Gerridge 
T. Strab 
T. Clauser 
V. Russ ell 
40-44 
E. Hotha r 
C. Pauling 
W. Pres ton 

·P . Steel 
F. Wasterson 
B. Bosworth 
45-49 
M. Gurtin 

- R. Glatz 
G. Jackson 
J. Kernan 
A. Williams 
50- 5~ 

* Ie. BDown 
5:'-59 

* H. Greenberg 
D. Geer 
6Q-64 

k A. Newman 
J. Sponseller 
65-69 

. S. Mon.:: stero 
Women 
S. Pa shkin 
45-49 
E. Henn 

5000 meter rl.ln 
30-34 
A. Cortez 
J. Mannis 
t. Rodgers 
35-39 
T. Cla.ser 
G. Sickels 
40- 44 
T. Fort 
P. Stee l 
!!5-4 9 
A. Will i ams 
B. Heany 

50- 54 
E. Smith 
G. Schiavi 
55- 59 
H. Greenberg 
WOlnen 
E. Henn 

37 PV 4. 27.6 
39 UN 4.28 .5 
39 DL 4.38 . 9 
35 UN 4. 40 .2 
37 GS 4 .5 7.4 

42 PM 4. 23.3 
44 NY 4.29 . 8 
41 tJN .30 . 7 
44 PM 4 .3 1. 0 
40 UN 4·. 34.2 
44 PM 5.06. 8 

1+ 5 UN 4 .34.3 
47 JS 4.-:38 .4 ___ 

· 46 PM 4 . 49 . 2 -~-
49 NY 4.55.4 
4..6 RA 5. 10.5 

51 uS 4.33.2 . 

59 as 5 . 06 . 8 
59 CA 5.30.3 

63 JM 5.01.9 
61 UN 5.46.0 

67 P}1 

36 FK 

45 UN 

31 PV 19.52 . ! 
33 UN 20 . 11.1 
33 kA 20.43 . 6 

35 UN 17.24.8 
35 PV 18.26.6 

43 DL 17.24. 2 
44 PM 20.19 . 4 

46 RI\ 1-9 . 39.8 
48 UN 21.07.8 

50 R... 1 9 . 59 .·.6 
52 DL 2 0~.10. 3 

59 GS 20. 23 .2 

45 UN 24.32. 5 

10000 Me t er run 
35-39 
G."Sickels 35 PV 38.49.5 

35 PM 40.02. 0 P. McGrath 
45-49 
T."Blood 
N. Ciru1nick 
50-54 
J. Maloney 
D. Webster 
55- 59 
D. Geer 

High hurd1ea 
30-34 39" 
J. Ackroyd 
J. Vogler 
R. Sal1ro 
35-39 39" 
B. Ayton 
40-49 36" 

*R. Jackson 
L. Judd 
N. Byrd 
45-49 36" 

* R.'Enders 
W. Clark 

48 PM 41. 34 
48 NY 46. 41 

50 PM 42.17 
51 PM 42 .37 

59 CA 42.49.2 

34 GS 15 . 5 
31 GS 18.0 
30 SH 20.6 

35 PM 17.3 

40tJN·16.7 
41 NY 16.7 
40 PN 17.Z 

47 PV 18.3 
47 PM 19.6 

G. taylor 
50-54 33" 
H:"Colen 
60-64 30" 

'It M. Neuhof 
M. Pickl 

48 PM 22.3 

52 NY 20.3 

63 NY 20.2 
61 PM 20.6 

400 me t er Intermedi ate 
30-34 
:r:--Ackroyd 
J. Vogler 
R. Salvio 
35-39 
B. Westfield 
D. VanDu8en 
40-44 
L. TDout 
J. Bradley 
45-49 

* R. Enders 
W. Clark 
J. Barris 
G. Taylor 
50- 54 

'It R. Willis 
60-64 

* M. Pick l 

~ . 65- 69 
* G. Brace l and 

5000 mete r walk 
30- 34 
R. Sa lv i o 
J . Barbe r 
K. Beely 
40-44 

* w.Preston 
J. Stefanowicz 

_ B. Kaufma n 
45-M 
R. Fin e 

.~ Walk';vi c 
55- 5 9--~ 

* T; 9yas 

Long Jump 
30-34 
C~ntiago 
C. Austin 
J. Vogl er 
t. Hai der 
R. Salvio 
35- 39 
B. "'yt on 
G. Krow 
40- 44 
R. J ackson 
N. Byrd 
G. Mc':;urdy 
L. Judd 
H. Bohigian 
45-4..2 

* R. Enders 
W. Clark 
P. Carstensen 
50-54 

* E. Schuler 
R. Willis 
H. Colen 
55- 59 

'It O. Harris 
D. HarriS 
60-64 
M. Pickl 
Women 
30-34 
A. · Mapps 
D. Shippen 

Pole Vallit 
35-39 
B. Ayton "­
S. Virgilio 
40-44 
E. Zura\~ 

KJ DeCarlo 
45-49 
J:"lrankert 
G. Taylor 

50-54 
D. Andenon 

Discus 
30-34 
J. Ackroyd 
J. Vogler 
J. Barber 
}5-39 

. k. MacKenzie 
J. Yacka 
H. Frledllllln 
40-44 
R:""Tacks~m 
L. Trout 
L. Judd 

34 GS 59.4 
3lGS 62.4 
30 SH 66.7 

36AA 59 . 9 
35PM62.B 

44 GS 61. 7 
43 PV 64.1 

47 PV 63.0 
47 PM 13.6 
46PM 80.2 
4B PM 82.0 

50 UN 67.1 

61 PM 68.7 

65 PM 74.6 

30 SH 27.39 
31 NY 33.19 
32 8H 36.Z9 

4i UN 26 . 04 
41 PN 26 . 57 
40 IS 33 . 19 

48 NY 25.49 
45 PN 35 . 48 

'9 NJ 29.13 

~ 

J2 PM 18' 9 1/2 
31 PV 11' 1 
31 GS 16' 2 1/2 
30 SJ 15' 9 
30 SH IS' 4 

35 PM 1B' 2 
37 UN 16' 2 

40 UN 19' 4 
40 PM 17'10 
40 PM 17' 9 
41 NY l7 i 6 
43 NY 16' B 1/2 

41 PV 18' 6 1/2 
47 PM 18' 2 
47 NY 15'10 1/Z 

52 UN 17' 4 
50 UN 15' 2 
33 NY 14' 11 1/2 

55 PM 15'10 
56 PM 15' 1 1/2 

61 PM 14' 1 1/2 

31 FK 14' 8 
30 FK 9'10 1/2 

35 pM iZ'6 
38 H' 0 

40 PV 12'6 
40 PM 10 ' 6 

45 M 6'6 
48 PM 6'0 

50 PM 9' 

34 GS 104' 5 
31 GS 95' 8 

-31 NY 87' 10 

19 PM 106' 9 
35 PH 106' 1 
37 as 95' 5 

40 UN 107' 2 
44 GS 102'11 
41 NY 98' 3 

45-49 
C. Fraundorfer 
P. Carstenllen 
50-54 
L. Trubey 
A. Harri. 
55-59 

47 UN 126' 3 
47NY 85' , 

50 UN 90' 4 
UN 17; 9 

k. Peters 55 wp 93' 5 
87' 1 

4 
7 

J. Selig 57RA 
J!. Eberhardinger 59 PM 
P. Flournoy 56 PM 

71' 
64' 

&0-64 
H. Hand 
65-69 
C. Hills 
B. Detweiler 
W. Eipel 
Women 
30-34 
A. Mapps 
40-44 
A, Cirulnick 

Weight Throw 
30-34 
J. Ackroyd 
J. Vogler 
J. Barber 
)5-~ 9 
K. MacKenzie 
H. Friedman 
40-44 
R. Dee re 
45-49 
H. llusstnan 
G. Fraundorfer 

55- 59 
I.Mandachein 
R. Peters 
T. DeVaughn 

62p!o\ 85 ' 3 

67PM 104' 4 
65 I'M 103' 0 
66 AC 87'10 

31 FK 51' 5 

44 NY 70' 8 

34GS 37'8 
3lGS 37'8 

31 NY 26 ' 6 

39 l'M 29 ' 0 
37 CIS 24' 2 

4,1 NY 30 ' 3 

RA 41' 7 
47 UN 39'0 

PM 
55 WI? 
56 CD 

R. Eberhardinge r PM 

33'8 
27' 0 
26 ' 5 
22'1 

69-64 
H. Hand _ 
M. Pickl 
65-69 
B":""I>e twe ile r 
W. Ripe1 
C. Hills 

Javelin Throw 
30-34 
S. Hagey 
J • . Vogler 
J. Ackroyd 
35-39 
K. MacKenzie 
45-49 

II:J. Reider 
G. Taylor 
50-54 
A. Harth 
55-59 
A. Se~ig 
T. DeVaugh 

62 PM 24' 8 
61 PM Z4'l 

65 PM 32'0 
66 AC 28'10 
67 PM 20'6 

liP 208' 6 
31 GS 146 ' 6 
34 GS 1<'5' 5 

39 PH 125' 0 

45 RA 165' 2 
48 PM 80' 0 

UN 92' 6 

P. Everhardinger 
60-64 

57 RA 100' 5 
56 CD 81' 0 
59 PM 79' 11 

H. Hand 
65-69 

*W. Eipel 
C. Hills 
B. Detweiler 

Shot Put 
~ 
S. Hagey 
D. Shechtman 
J. Vogl er 
J. Ackroyd 
35-39 
K:'MacKenzie 
J. Yacka 
H. Friedman 
40-44 
E,St;;ith-
R. Deere 
H. Bohigi ah 
45-49 
C. Fraudnorfer 
J. keider 
P. Carstensen 
50-54 

* J. Kahnert 
H. Arthur 
.ll:21 

* R. Peters 
J. Selig 
P. Flournoy 
60-64 
H. Hand 

· 65-69 
* v.Eipe1 

B. Detweiler 
C. Hill1 
Women 
A. Happ. 
A. Ciru1niek 
H. Cat-.un •• n 

62 PM 98' 5 

66 AC 111-' 1 
67 PM 102. 7 
65 PM 89' 6 

HP 37' 9 
32 PM 37' 5 1/ 2 
31 GS 37 ' 0 
34 GS l5 ' 3 l / Z 

39 PM 39' 8 
35 PM 37' 1 1/ 2 
37 GS' lo' 5 

40 GS 35' 1/2 
41 NY 34' 1 LIZ 
43 NY 27'10 

41 UN 39' 2 . 
45 M 37' [) 
47 NY 34'11 

51 PV 47'10 
51 UN 31' 5 1/2 

55 WP 34' 0 
57 RA 28' 5 
56 PM 26' 5 

62 PM 35' 7 

66 AC 38' 3 ·1/ 2 
65 P}f 33' 4 
67 PM 26'10 1/2 

31 FIC ZO'10 
44 NY 2b' 1 
47 Ulf 19' 9 

.-~--- . 
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High Jump 
pO-34 
K. Johnson 
J • Lfttlej ohn 
J; Ackroyd 
R. Salvio 
~ -

K. Grant 
~ 
E. Zura,; 
L. Judd 
45-49 
W. Hutchins 
R. Ender. 
50- 54 
R. Wil11s 
55-59 

UN .5'8 
34 DL ;'6 
34 GS 5'2 
30 81i 4'10 

tm 5'2 

40 PV 5'4 
41 NT 5 ' 2 

47 PM 5'4 
47 PV 4'6 

50 UN 4'8 

1. Mondschein PM 4'10 
R. Peters 55 WP 4'6 
T. Ille 59 NJ 4'2 
P. Ebwehardin8~r PM '4 ' O 
60-64 
M. Neuhof 
M. Pickl 
65-69 
W. Ei pel 
G. Bracllland 
Women 
S. Pashki n 

Harraner Tht'ow 
J. Vogler 
J. Batber 
J. Ackro>,d 
35-39 
K. MacKenzie 
40-44 

.L. Judd 
45- 49 

61 NY 4'& 
61 PM 4'6 

66 A£ 4'4 
bS PH 4 ' 0 

36 FK 3'9 

30-34 
31 GS 94' 7 
31 NY 77' 9 
34 GS 68'10 

39 PH H ' 4 

41 NY 82' 4-

H. Brossman 47 RA 120 ' 8 
C. Fraundorfer 47 UN 120' 4 
P. Carstensen 47 NY lOS' 1 
55-59 

*1. Mond.chein PM 136' 5 
CD 103' 9 
wi> 97 '11 

T. QeVaughn 56 
R. Peters (16') 
60-64 

*H.Hand 
65-69 

62 PM 85"10 

*B . Detweilet 
W. Eipel 

65 PM 122' 7 
66 AI:. 99' 8 
67 PM 14' 2 C. Hilla 

Relays 
1600 meters 
Philade~ph1a Maatet:a "A" 
New York Masters 

3142.5 
3:43.5 
4: 00.2 Philade 1phia Ma.teri "B" 

3200 meters 
New tork Masters 10:05.5 

TEAM SCORES (6-4-3-2-1 per each 
S-year division for both men and 
women, after which all the scores are 
added together for each 10-year 
group) 

Phlla. 1iasters 
Manhattan Flight, Kings 
Garden State 
Potomac Valley 
Shore Athletic Club 
Phila. Pioneers 
New -York Masters 
High Point 
Eastern Ontario 
South Jersey 

. 30-39 
PH 118 
FK 75 
GS 73 
PV 39 
SH 19 
PP 16 
NY 15 
HP 14 
EO 10 
SJ Ii 
DL 7 Deleware Sports Club -

6 Ann Arbor Track Club AA 

40- 49 
NY 153 
PM 111 
PV 55 
RA 35 
GS 16 
SH 12 
FK 10 
JS 8 
PC 7 
DL 6 
PN 4 
IS 3 
TR - 2 

50-59 
PM 80 
NY 25 
NJ 21 

New York Master. 
Phila. Masters 
Potomac Valley 
Reading Athletic Attic 
Garden State 
Shore Athletic Club 
Manhattan Flight Kings 
Jersey Senior Masters 
New York Pioneers 
De1eware Sports Club 
Pllnn Athletic Club 
Island Track Club 
Teenton Track Club 

Phil a • Hasters 
New York Nasters 
North Jersey Mastera 

continued 
, t I f ;:.j " 1 J . '" 
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continued 

RA 20 ~adihg Athletit Attic 
WP 17 Welt Penn Masters 
CD 14 Corona Del Mar 
CA 14 Capital: Track Club 
JS 12 Jersey Senior Track Club 
GS 12 Garden State 
DL 10 Deleware 
PV 6 ' Potomac Valley 

60 + 
PM 128 ~hila. Malters 
AC 29 New York Athletic Club 
NY !7 New York Malter~ 
NJ 12 North Jersey Masters 
JM 12 Jersey Masters Swim Team 
JS 10 Jersey Senior Track Club 

, FA 7 Falmouth 

Bu·schman wins 9 
. . 

in Midwest Regionals 

EVANSTON , ILL., June 23 . 
Among top performances at the 
Midwest Masters Regional Track and 
Field Championships at Dyche 
Stadium at Northwestern University 
were: 

-Hal Higdon 's 10:36 in the age 
45-
49 3000 Steeplechase. 

-Ernie Billups' 4:12 in the 40-44 
1500. 

-Jack Greenwood's four wins in 
the 50-54 100 (11.87), 200 (23.97), 
ItO-hurdles (15.47) and 400-hurdles 
(62.24). 

-Dean Smith's four triumphs in 

the 50-54 400 (57.2), 800 (2:09) , 1500 
(4:34) and 5000 (18:46) . 

-Mary Czarapata's triple in the 
women's 40-
women's 40-44 800 (2:38.4), 1500 
(5:15) and 5000 (21:00). 

-Mel Buschman's wins in the 
55-59200 (27.48), 400H (80.2), 110H 
(19 :3) Long Jump (15'9Vo. " ), Triple 
Jump (29'11 " ), High Jump (4'0"), 
Shot Put (30'7 1/ 2 "), Discus (90'1"), 
and Javelin (106'1"). 

-Paul Wolf's win in the 2-mile 
predict-your-time run, missing by 
only 2 seconds in 15:42. 

MI IJWEST MAS'j Li:" 
REGIO!'lAL TtF UErT 

,l),CHE ST.-\DIt"! - NORTHWESTERN UNIVERSITY 
JUNE 23, 1979 

100 HETER DASH 

30-34 
r:-Jerry Hedgcock. Chi . 11 : 45 2. Chu'ck Holt, St. Louis , MO 11.9 
3 . John Hess, Bf r o n 12 : 37 4 . Rohell Miller , Chi . 12 : 4 5. Rich 
Steder, Chi. 12 : 96 
35-39 
r:-Jerr y Byrd , Chi . 11 : 2 2 . Lou Tutt , E . Lansing 11 : 5 3. Dave 
Shevitz, Highland Pk . 12 : 34 
35- 39W 
1. Lynn Ferguson, Hinsdale 15 : 1 2. Shirley Marshall, Chi . 17 : 57 
40-44 
1 . Robert Humke. l'rbana 12 : 24 2 . Do nald Zimmerman, Speedway , IN 
13 :02 3. Philip Marshall Chi , 13 : 7 
40-44W 
1 . JoAnne Gris som, Indianapolis 13 : 0 ,2 . Betty Mayer .. Chi . 13: 4 , 
45-49 
1. Dick Richardso n, De c atur 12 : 7 
3. Tom Hinkes, ~adison , WI 13 : 7 
50-54 

2 . Tom Twitchel , !.!t . Prospect 12 :8 
4 . Hershel Reiter , Chi. 13 : 8 

1. Jack Greenwoo d, Medicine Lodge, KS 11 : 87 2 . ,Rush Jacobs, Daviso n , !.II 
12:6 3 . Mel Albright, Davenport, 10 12 : 7 4. Al Treichel, !.Iilwaukee 
13 : 0 5 . Charles Olson Nevis , MN 13 : 35 
55-59 
Leon Potter, Ch i 12 : 2 2 . Jay Goodwin, Detroit 12:4 
60-64 
Harold Comm, Chi . 14 : 5 2. Robert Zenke, St. Louis 14 : 6 

200 ~IETER DASH 
30-34 
~rald Hedgcoc k, Chi. 24:4 2. Paul Skubic, Chi. 24 : 7 3. Mike 
Miller, Glencoe 25 : 1 4. , John Hess, Byron 25 : 8 5. Jim Hess, Byron 25 : 9 
35-39 
1. Lou Tutt, E . Lansing 23 : 4 2 . Jerry Byrd, Chi. 23 : 7 3. John Shaw, 
Davison, MI 25 : 6 4 . J. N. Pennington, Naperville 26:0 5 . Jim 
Ferguson, Chi 26 : 53 
40-44 
1. Robert Humke, Urbana 
3 . Bill Smith, Wilmette 
5 . Philip Marshall, Chi 
45-49 

25 : 19 2. Donald Zimmerman, Speedway, IN 27 : 1 
27 : 2 4. Thomas Allen, Western Spgs. 27 : 5 
28 : 95 

1. Dick Richardson , Decatur 26:54 2 . Dan Hendrix, Chi. 27:1 3. Thomas 
Twitchell , Chi . 27 : 7 4 . Robert Sonneman, Libertyville 27:9 5. Charles 
Cox, Madison 2R : 44 
50-54 
1. Jack Greenwood, Medicine Lodge, KS 23 : 97 2 . Dean Smith, Lombard 
25 : 9 3. Rush Jacobs, Davison, ~I 26 : 1 4. Al Treichel, Milwaukee 26 : 44 
5. Mel Albrignt, Davenport, 10 26:7 
55-59 
1. Mel Buschman, E. Lansing 27 : 48 2, Roy Smith, Rantoul 28 : 1 
60-64 
1. Frank Pillsticker Clarendon Hills 34 : 2 2 . Harold Comm Chi. 38 : 8 

30-3411' 
1. Gail Haston-Tutt, E . LanSing , 'fI 35 : 5 
35-39W 
1. Shirley !.Iarshall, Chi 35 : 6 
40-44W 
1. JoAnne Grisson , Evanston 31:1 

400 \IETER DASH 
30- 34 
r:-Jame s Ri ce, Chi 51:4 2 . Ga r y Ca r r , ~!ascoutah 51:6 3 . Chuck Ho lt, 
St. Lo uis 56 : 2 4. Jim Benton , Chi 64 : 07 5. Rich Zimmy, ~lexi co , 110 
64:62 
30- 34W 
1. Ga i l Haston-Tu tt, E. Lans i n'g 91 : 0 
35-39 
1 . Lo u Tutt, E . Lansing 54:2 2 . J . Pennington, Naperville 60:4 
40-4 4 
~bert Humke, Urbana 59 : 07 2 . Bruce Hills, Libert yville . 60:3 
3 . Philip Marshall , Chi 66:69 
45-49 
1 . Dick Katte, Warsaw , IN 58:7 2. Charles Edmonds, Chi 62 : 4 
50-54 
1. Dean Smith, Lombard 57 : 2 2. Al Treichel , Milwaukee 59 : 47 3. Rush 
Jacobs, Davison, MI 62 : 0 4. Donald Walsh, Western Spgs 63 : 13 
5. Morton Krakow, Chi 72 : 02 
55-59 
r:-Jack Rice, Tamps, FL 64 : 34 2. Frank Bucaro, Bartlett - 65 : 30 
3 . Bill Bennett, Chi 72 : 20 
60-64 
r:-7i'Tt ~lcLendon, Chi 83: 32 2 . Pat Wearen , Madison 85 : 4 
65-6.9 
r:-Jack Boulton , Chi. 86 : 28 2. Ray Edwards, Alton 92 : r -

400 ~IETER HURDLES 
30-34 
I:'"Charles Holt, St . Louis 61 : 5 2. Edwin Moss , Chi 62 :4 
40-44 
I':'I3ruce lIills , Libertyville 66:5 2 . Bill' Smitn, Wilmette _71 : 11 
50-54 
r:-Jack Greenwood, Medi Cine Lodge , KS 62 : 24 2. Donald Walsh, Western 
Spgs. 71 :42 
55-59 
1. Mel Buschman, E. Lansing 80 : 2 2 . Larry Largent, Valpariso , I N 84 : 2 

800 ~IETER RUN 
30-34 
1. Gary c a rr , Mascoutah 2 : 03 2. James Rice, Chi 2 : 05 
35-39 
r:-James O'Neill , Hoffman Estates 2 : 07 2. Warren O" Shea , Chi 2 : 12 
40-44 
1 . Robert Sadler, Chi . 2 :07 2 . Jay Avery, Wheaton 2 : 26 
40-441V 
1 . Mary Czarapata, New Berlin , WI 2:38 . 4 2 . Edie Smith , Chi 2 : 51.4 
45-49 
1. Billy Goedke, Clovis , Nil 2:11 2 . Dick Katte, Warsaw , IN 2:23 
3 . Terry Jayne , Decatur 2 : 24 4 ." Wendell Childs, Chi 2 : 32 5. Charles 
Edmonds, Chi 2 : 33 

50-54 
1. Dean Smith, Lombard 2:09 2 . Al Treichel , Ililwaukee 2 : 24 
3 . Harcus Muillo, Chi 3 : 29 
55-59 
r:-Jack Rice , Tamps , FL 2 : 31 2 . Frank Bucaro, Bartlett 2 : 32 
65-69 
1. William Andberg, Anoka 2 : 40 
2 : 59 

1500 MEtER RUN 
30-34 

2 . Bob Carlson, Winona 

1. Larry Leonard, 4 : 37 2. Frank Levy , Chi 4: 55 3 . Rich Zinn y, 
~exico, MO 4 : 58 4. Jim Benton.., Chi 5:07 5. Paul Skupic, _Chi 5 :~? 
35-39 
1. Eric Zemper, Mokemos 4 : 21 2. J. O ' Neill, Hoffman Estates 4 : 36 
3. Roget Shaw, 4 : 38 4. Paul Basbagill, 4 : 53 5. Tom Sefick, Chi 5 : 20 
30-34W 
1 . Linda Rhea, Gary 6:05 
40-44 
1. Ernie Bi 11 ups, Chi 4: 12 '2 . Bob Sadler, Chi 4 : 35 3. Bob Pates, 
Wilmette 4 : 59 4 . Guy McTarland, Iowa City 5 : 04 5. Bill Smith, 
Wilmette 5: 20 
40-44W 
1. Mary Czarapata, New Berl in S: 15 
45-49 
~l Higdo n, Michigan City IN 4:47 2 . Terry Jay r oe, Decatur 4:55 
3 . Wendell Childs, Chillicothe , IL 5 : 11 4 . Jim Isbe ll , South Bend 
5 : 22 5 . Robert Sonneman, Libertyville 5 : 21 
50-54 ' , 
~an Smith, Lombard 4:34 2 . Al Treichel, Milwaukee 4 : 51 3. Jack 
Githens, Nape r v ille 5:39 4. Mort Crackow , Milwaukee 6:35 5. Tom 
Mayen, Chi 6:37 
55-59 
~ck Rice , Tampa FL 5 : 12 2. ~rank Bucaro, Bartlett 5:13 3. Jim 
Stronks , Chi 5 :47 4 . ~e1 Bushman, E. Lansing 6 : 22 5. Ted Zimke, 
LaCrosse 6:27 
65 - 69 
~ll Andberg, Anoka 5 : 25 

5,000 METER RU!'l 
:10-34 
~hn Burrell, Evanston 16 : 40 2. Humphrey Godfrey Chi 17 : 55 

- 3 . .Tim Benten, Chi 18 : 06 
35-39 
1. Eric Zemper , MoJ~emos , .16 : 17 2 . Robert Schrader, Napervi lIe 16 : 18. 
3 . Bob Pates, Wilmette 18 : 08 4 . Guy McFarland, Iowa City 18 : 21 
5 . Fred Krueger, Chi 21 : 16 
40-44W 
1 . Mary Czarapata, New Berlin, WI 21 : 00 2. Barbara Battey, Chi 24:20 
3. Beth Gately, Chi 24 : 31 
45-49 
~yde Baker, Evanston 16:25 2. Dick Wilson, Chi 17 : 33 4. Jim 
Hunt, Golf 19 : 53 
50-54 
1. Dean Smith, Lombard 18 : 46 2. Ed Battey, Chi 19 : 00 3. Jack Githens 
Naperville 21 : 16 4 . John Kech, Addison 21:22 
55-59 
1. Dick King, Chi 22:49 2. Ed Murphy, Omaha 23 : 14 
65-69 
1. Bill Andberg , Anoka , 21:03 

10,000 llETFR ROI 
30-34 
~eve Kearney , So uth Bend 34 :45 2. Humphrey Godfrey. Chi 35 : 42 
3 . Roy Gillette, Sheboygan 35:42 : 1 4 . Rich Medema, Chi 37:39 5. Ray 
Poter, Chi 37 : 42 
35-39 
~e O'Shea , Chi 33 : 08 2 . Pat Moon ey" Berwyn 36: 58 3. Jim Bo hm. 
Deerfield 40 : 25 4. Dick McQuite, Dixon 42 : 14 5. Wayne Brown, 

. Edwardsville 42:27 
40-44 
1. Bob Pates, Wilmette 31'>:05 2. Guy McFa rland Iowa City, IA 37 : 10 
3. Dennis Twohig , Darien 39 : 03 . 4. lI'ally By ron, ~!ilwaukee 4 0: 1 3 
45-49 -
r:-AT Bro dzick, Chi 36 : 06 2. Terrv Jayroe , Decatur 37: 48 3. :'eil 
King, Winnetka 38 : 15 4. Paul WOlf ', Hi Park 39 : 46 5 . ,Leonard 
Evens , Chi 41 : 08 

colltillued 
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35-39W 
1. Bobbie Widman, Chi 43: 42. 2. Liz A1massy, Dolton 44: 12 
50-54 
1 . Gerry Schmidt, Chi 44 :38 2 . J ohn Keck, Winona 45:08 3 . Mark 
Muni110, Chi 56:30 
55 - 59 
l."IIT chard Ki n g, Chi 47 : 03 2 ·. John Gall .. Oak Park 48: 02 
60- 64 
T:"""Frank Prilsticker, Clare ndo n Hill s 45:50 2. Haro ld Comm , Chi ' 52 ": 5 1 
65-69 -
~ck Bolton, Chi 50:39 2. Ted Kaliski, Burbank 1 : 02 : 27 

110 METER HIGH HURDLES 
30-34 
1 . Charles Ho lt, St. Loui s 16:6 2 . Ray Warpeha, Oak Br oo k 16 : 9 
35-3g 
"l.""""Bruc e Mills, Libe rt yvi lIe 18 : 1 2. Dud l ey Knutson, Chi 18 : 8 
40-44 
T:"""Fred Gal1artio, Rivers ide, CA 18 : 77 2. Bud Qual Iowa City 18:9 
45-49 
l.""Jick Greenwood, \Iedicine Lo dge, KS 15 :47 2·. · A1 Gras, Chi 17:6 
3 . Donald Walsh, Western Spgs . 18:7 
50-54 
1. Mel Buschman, E . Lansing 19 : 3 2 . Fred Shurz , Mt . Prospect 19: 7 

STEEPLE CHASE 
30-34 
1 . Bill Bradna, ~apervil1e 10 : 21 2 . Jim Benton, Chi 12:05 
35-39 
~hn Shaw, Davison, ~I 13 : 32 2. Steve Willis , Flossmoor 14:04 
40-44 
1. Hal Rhea, Gary, IN 12 : 32 2,. Chuck Bednar, Quincy 12 : 79 
45-49 
1. Hal Higdon, Michigan City, IN 10 : 36 2. "Fred Leverez, Moline 13: 14 

- LONG JUMP 
30-34 
1 . Paul Skubic, Chi 18-5 1/4 2. ~at ~lorse , Chi 15-5 3 . Richard Steder , 
St. Paul 15-3 4 . Jim Hess, Byron 15-1 
35-39 
!.Robert Remm~rt , Wi1. 16-4 1/2 2. James Gerguson, Chi. 15-18 1/ 2 3 . John 
Shaw, Davison, MI . 13-10 1 /4 4 . TOM Sefick, Chi 13-1/4 
.!Q.=ii 
1 . Thomas Allen , Chi 15-11 2. Donald Zimmer~an, Speedway, IN 1~-9 3/4 

3 . Bill Smith, Wilmette 14-7 1 /2 4. Lou ~eficl:, Chi 12 1 3/4 
45-49 
~ar1es Cox, Carson 15 8 1/2 2.Robert Sonneman , Libertyville 1543/4 
3. Dan Hendrix, Chi. 12-11 1/2 
50-5~ 
1. Mel Albright, Davenport, IA 15-3 2 . Rush Jacobs, Davison ., MI 14-11 1 / 4 
3 . Al Treichel , Milwaukee 14-Cl 1 /2 ·1. :,lorton Krakow, Homewoo d 11-2 
55-59 
1. '·lel Buschman, E. Lan. 15- 0 3/4,2 . Leon Po t te r, Chi i.§.-7 3. Bill 
Larson, Gree'n Bay 14 3 3/4 / 
4')-44W 
1. JoAnne Grisson, Indianapo lis, IN 13 1/4 

TRIPL£ JUHP 
30-34 
1. Pat Morse, Carbondale 28- 1 1 /4 2. Dick Tesch, Charles City 27-9 
35-39 ,._ , 
1. -Fred Gallardo, ' Riverside, CA 
40-44 

-. .- , .. --- -.• ,: !' 

3~- i 3/4 , 2 . Charles Cox , Carso n 29-4 1/2 

r:JIT Treichel, ~Iil. 3091/4 2 . Hel Albright , Dave nport, 10 29-1 /2 
3. Charles Olson, Nevis, 1-1'< 28-1 
45-49 
~1 Buschman, East Lansing, 2<1-11 1/2 2. John· Stratton , lIunc te, 28-10 
IN 

HI GH JlJ'IP 
30-34 
r:-JTm Be nton, Chi 410" 2. Erv Nixon , Columbis 3' 10" 
35-39 
~ Sandstead, Mo rton Grove 5'6" 2 . Ron Symthe, Columbus 5'4" 
3. Fl oyd Smith, Clinton , 10 5'8" 4. Thomas Allen Western Spgs 5'0" 
5. Bruce Hi lIs, Libertyvi lIe 4' 10 " 
40-44 
l."IITc hard Ri c hardson , Decatur , IL 6'0" 2. Peter Peterson, Chi 5'0 " 
3 . Fre d G1lardo, Riverside, CA 4'10" 
45-49 
1 . ~.I e l Albright, Davenport, .10 4' 6" 2 . Charles Colson, Nevis, ~!N 
4'0" 
50-54 
~1 Buschman , E. Lansin g 4'0" 2 . Mike Dawson Springfield 3'10" 

POLE VAULT 
30-34 
r:-Jim Ben ton, Milwaukee 8' 10 " 
35-39 
1. Thomas All e n , Western Spgs 1,)'0 " 
40-44 
T:"""Fred Gallardo, Riverside, CA 10 '0" 2. Tom Hinkes, Madison 10'0" 
3. Neil King, Winnetka, 9'6" 

30-34 
~eve Kiser, Chi 
3. Jim Hess, By r o n 29'3 1 /2" 
26'4" 
35-39 
l.""'"Ed J o hnson, Palatine 38'9" 

SHOT PUT 

45'7 1/2" 2 . John Hess, Byron 33'10 " 
4 . Jerry Hedgecock 29'0" 5. Ri c h Steder, 

2 . George Doss, Carpe ntersville 31'4 " 

3. Tom Se fi c k , Chi 2ti ' 1}" 4. Ri c h )Ia g llir e , Chi 25' 3" 
40-44 
"f":"""Carl Klem,Ar]in g ton I!gt s 37']" 2 . Lee Slic k ; Pa l os Park 30' 9 ': 
3. Lou Sefick , Chi 25' 10 " 
45-49 
l.""'"Ed Zalig , Countryside 34'0" 2. Gene Hendrix, Auro ra 3 3 ' 111 / 2" 
3. Jack Scott , ,J o li ~t , 32' 2" 4, Bo b Sonn eman , Libe rt yvill e 28 ' 11 " 
5, Pete Pete r s o n . Ma nit owac , WI 26 '7 " 
50 - 54 
l."IITch IVaI ton, Chi 35' 0 " 2. ~I ort Krak ow , Home woo d 24 ' II " 3, J o hn 
Gustafson, Waukegan 24'9" 
55-50 
1. Hel Busc hman, E. Lan sin g, ~n 30 ' 7 1/2" 2 '. Rolli~ T-ibbits, Chi , 29 'S " 
30-3 411' 
r:-JOAnne Grisson, Ind id n ap o lis 31' 11" 2 , Sue Skerke Chi 20 '{'" 
35-39W 
1. Karen Huff, Wilmette 28 '}" 

DISCUS 
30-34 
~eve Kiser, Chi ·125' 7"" 2 , John Hess, By r on 96' 1" 
3. Paul Skubi c, Chi 87' 4 . Jim Hess, Byron 78 ' 
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35-39 
l.""""Pete To u ghhi 11 , Chi 112' 11 " 2. Geo rge Doss, Carpe n t ersv i ll e 
107 ' 3" 3. Ed Johnson, Chi 104'9" 4 . Tom Sefick, Chi 71 ' 5" 5. J o hn 
Shaw , Chi 53'5 " 
40 - 44 
Carl Klem, ARling ton Hgt s 99'6 " 2, Lee Slick , Palos Park 87 '3" 
3 , Bill Smith , Wilme tte 8 1 ' 11" 4, Thomas Allen, Chi 72'4 " 
5, Do n Zimmerman , Speedway, IN' 67' 9 " 
45-40 
~ck Sco tt, Chi 99 ' 11 " 2, Gen e Hendri x , Chi 94'7 " 3. Bob 
Sonneman, Liberty v ille 84'6 " 4, Pete Peterson, ~Iadison 72'10" 
5 " Dick Richardso n , Decatur 72'9" 
50-54 ' 
l."IITch'ar d Walton , ' Chi 68' 6" 2,. llorton Krakow, St. L'ouis 60' 5 " 
55 - 59 
1. J!el Buschman, E. Lansing 90' 1" 2. Lou Gr e ngs, Duluth 84' 2 " 
30- 34W 
I , Sue Ske rke, Chi 62' 2 " 
35-39W 
1. Robe rta Widman, Ch i , 70'4 " 2 . Kare n Huf f, Wilmett e 63'3 " 

JA\,ELI ~ 
30-34 . , 
r:-Pau1 Skubl.q, Chi 10'4-3 . 2 ~ ~khard Steder, Ch!l~p'a ;tkn 100-5 3, Jerry 
Hedgecock , Chi· 96-5 , 4 . Jim Hess, Byr~m ' 74 - 1 5. John Hess, Byron 7 3-9 
35-39 
1. Ed Johnson, Chi 158-5 2 . George Doss , Carpentersville 121-(' 
Sefick , Chi 107-1 4. John , ~haw , Davison, UI , 63-11 ' 
40-44 . "',, , 
r:-Lee $lick, Palos ParK :1l8":02, ,B'ill 'Smith, ' Wilmette 1I6-7 
3. Carl Klehm, Arlington Heights ~2-4 4. Tom Allen, Chi 86-11 
5 . Lou Sefick, . Chi 82-8 
45-49 
1 . Ed Za1ig, Countryside 163-11 2. Bob Sonneman, Libertyville 

3, Charles Cox, Chi li2-4 4, Gene Hendrix , Chi 104-4 
5. J ack Scott, Chi 89-4 
50-54 ' 
rRichard Walton, Chi 73-62, ~.Iorton Krakow, ,Chi 59-8 3, Ray 
Mack, 57-1 
55-59 

3. Tom 

112-9 

1. ~lel Buschman, E . Lansing 106-1 2 . Tom Thomas, Evanston 103-0 
30-34W 
1. Sue Skerke, Chi 54-3 
35-39W 

2. Barb Wilson, Waukegan. 51-7 

1. Karen Huff, Wilmette 98-2 2. Jane Lungly , Wilmette 91 1/4 

2 ~IILE PREDICTION 

1 . Paul Wolf, CNS 
2 . Kerry Ri chardson , Decatur 
3. Tim Miskiewicz 
3. Tom Keck 
4. Brad Stene 
5 . Ernie G1enesk, CNS 

-15 : 40-15: 42 
13 : 40-13:33 
10 : 30-10 : 42 
13 :48-14 :00 
13:00-12 : 42 
15:41-15 : 15 

+2 
-7 
+12 
+12 
-18 
-26 

30-34 
r:-Paul Skubic, Chi 2,164 2 . Jim Hess, Byron 1,289 
3. John Hess, Byron 1,228 

• I ,1 

PENTATHELON 
34-39 
1 . Tom Sefick, Chi 1,321 ' 2 . J ohn Shaw , Chi 919 
40-44 
1. Bi 11 Smith, Wilmette 1 , 703 2 . Tom Allen, Chi 1,292 3 , Do n 
Zimmerman, Chi 1 ,283 4. Lou Sefi ck, Chi 1,000 
45-49 
1. Bob' So nneman , Libe rtyville 1 , 709 2. Gene Hendrix , Chi 1,394 
3. Charles Cox , Carson 1,260 
50-54 
1. Morton Krakow, Chi 458 2, Jack Nesbitt , Ann Arbor 378 
55-59 
~1 Buschman , E. Lansin g 1,534 2. Noel Nelson, Madison 1, 240 

Higdon improves 1-8 
one-hour run mark 

Hal Higdon , running in a twilight 
All -Comers meet in his hom e town of 
Michigan City. Indiana, added nearly 
;1 quarter mile' to the American 1-B 
(age 45-49) One-Hour Run record. 

His distance of 11 miles ,'223 yards 
bettered the 1 b-mile, 1554-yard 
standard established by Dick Bartek 
llf Santa Barbara in ·1978 , 

The mark also improved on the 
li sted world age 48 recod:l of 10 n.1iles, 
512 yards by Bob Bartling of 
Brookings. South Dakota,)n 1947. 

Co-author of th~ recently published 
; 'Runner's Cookbook." his training 
meal , fqr lunchnad been a pean~t 
·hutter and jelly , sandwich. He 
I\ ' arn~ed up for the hour run by 
competing earlier in. the .330-yard low 
hurdles (3rd in h€at in 55.3) . . 

But the ' temperature was around 
60. the humidity low , the wind still, 
and Higdon may have been irritated 
11\' a sub-par 3000-meter steeplechase 
performance two days earlier in the 
Midwest Masters Regional Cham-

pionships in Evanston. He had 
tripped and fallen on his nose before 
one barrier. and had to clamber over 
another after misjudgIng his steps. 

"Sometimes you have those 
da~'s." he said. 

"The record was there for the 
lakin g. " Higdon remarked after­
I\·ards . ," Any time Ray Hatfon wants 
III step on a track, he ean add another ' 
lap to my mark. Get. u's both together 
an0 we mig ht add two or three." 

(France's Alain Mimoun., 1956 
Olympic Marathon: _Cha'mpion, owns 

. the world 1-8 ·record with 11 ~~iles, 
1268 \a rds at. age , 4,5 . ,. :Britain's 
Wil.liam Stoddart ,ra:n , II mile:s, 1309 
\ ;tnb at a:L:c 40.) · . ,(, 

'" If lIT LIIl the on,e-J:!our run ~more 

, 01 11' 11. IIL,'d probably have better 
, ' i' \ "~i)rds," said Hal, who ih 1958 set 

11ll' American open record in the 
\ \ \.'n t. a nel I\'on t he national AAU-t.itle 
III )903 . " Tha-t' s the first t l11e.J've 
r ll il I he race in 6 years." 
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263 compete in North American Championships 
By BRIAN OXLEY and the, high level Qf activity now was second in the 10,OOOm to Arthur Mountain A.A., Vermont, set a 

needs the kind of enlightened Taylor. C.O.R. of 12.78 in the Shot- Put. He 
Dear Friends: Thanks. It was such support we had from Pilkington. Art, transplant from Waterloo, also won the Discus and was second 

a pleasure to organize. now at Fort McMurray but soon to in the Javelin. 
A small committee of willing folk NOTES BY NORM BAUM return to city life in Calgary, is obv James Johnsoll (55-59), N. Cal 

who knew what they were doing; it viously back in form and ready' to Seniors, leapt 5.12 for a new Long 
Meet Director (George Mitchell) and Rudolph Valentine of New York defend his World titles in Hannover. Jump C.O.R. This was only .06 
officials who were the best you'll find City broke his own age 55-59 world His 10,OOOm. C.N.R. of 34:44.1 farther than Max pickl's mark. He 
anywhere; and 263 entrants, who 400 record of 54.8, set July 25, 1978, knocked almost 21/2 minutes off the won the Triple Jump, too . . 
were so much more than names on with a new world standard of 54.56. previous, long undisturbed record. John Satti (65-69), a clubmate of 
paper. Canadian records went to the Art also won the 5000m. Johnson's, broke two C.O.R.'s: Long 

A special thanks' to our sole following: Archie Messenger (55-59), New Jump of 4.39m and 290m of 29.22. He 
sponsor, Pilkington Glass. Due. to George Braceland (65-69) of York Masters, set a C.O.R. in 800m also won the 100m. 
their generous and immediate Philadelphia, Pa., ran the 110m of 2:20.3. He also won the 1500m. Jan Versteeg (SO-54) of Vancouver 
response to our approach, we w~re hurdles in 19.69. He broke another There were several field events Olympic Club shattered John Pav-
able to plan with confidence and live Canadian record in the Pole Vault records. elich's Shot record by half a metre 
with our entry fees despite the with 3 meters. William Eipel (65-69), U.S.A., with a new C.N.R. of 12.48m. In fact 
shortfall in entries. Diane Palmason (40-44) recorded a struck three times. He set a C.O.R. Jan cornered the throwing gold 

Travel difficulties and, I under- 19:24.9 in the 5000, an Open Record with a 12.00m Shot Put, another with marke t in his class with wins in 
stand, a conflicting event, kept many (i.e. made by any nationality in a a 35.04m Javelin and equalled the Discus, Javelin and Hammer. He 
away who we would otherwise have Canadian meet) and Native (i.e. High Jump C.O.R. with 1.30m. He showed his versatility with a third in 
been delighted to see. They missed a made by a Canadian anywhere in the did no better than first in the Discus. the Triple Jump. 
good meet. world.) Diane's 1500m in 5:12.5 was Nolan Fowler (65-69) of Mason- Albert White shares with Mark 

Sponsorship money also allowed us another C.N.R. Dixon A.C., Tennessee, broke the Brennan the distinction of oldest 
to absorb the cost of the banquet hall, Marcia Speath (SO Hammer C.O.R. by over 5 metres participant in the championships. 
the stadium, publishing and inciden- with a stupendous throw of 38.10m. Both are 75. Albert broke virgin 
tal expenses, and still come out Marcia Spaeth (SO-54) of Fingerlake Kermit Hollingsworth (45-49), territory as all his results established 
sufficiently ahead to make a modest T.C., U.S.A., won the 800m in Scarborough, Ontario, for the third both Open and Native marks in the 

contribution to the future operating 3:00.2, an open record .. She also won time equalled his own High Jump Shot, Javelin, Discus . and Hammer! 
expenses of the North American the 5K & 10K. Open and Native record of 1.75m. He Mark had already~ established 
Masters Council and the CMITT. Cliff Hall (SO-54) of Metro Toronto had the satisfaction of reaching 1.78 200m time. Now he owns, too, all 
Thanks indeed. . Fitness Club, a great runner from after the event and, no doubt , will Canadian records in 100m (18.17) , 

"Fitness Over Forty" is now more 400m to marathons, established a eventually raise his record. 400m (90.04), 800m (4:00.9). 
than a gleam in Hal Higdon's eye, new C.N.R. of 2:09.3 in 800m. Cliff . Leonard Olsen (45-49) of Green ...................... .. 

::: ::::::::::::::::::: ::::::::::::::::::::::::: :::: : ::::: :::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::;::: ::::::::::~::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::;:::::::::::::::::::::::: : :::::::::::~::::: ::::: ::::::::::::::~::::~::: ::::::::::;::::::::::~:::.:::::::~:::::::::::::~:::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::.:.:.:. :.:.:.:.:.:.:.: .:.:.:.: .:.:.:.:.:.:.:.;.: 

From the editor One is late results. Puttmg on a ft~o~ t.here. : ,J;::pe~ses ar~ pa'id , by 
. M asters event is an enormous FinanCial fltnes-sJ,!! _Ralelgh, . N. C. . 

project. Too ~ften, when it's over, the There ~a~ been -sn~~gs -a~c!. _delays . __ 
My thanks to everyone who took 

time -to respond to the June survey. 
From about 1000 subscribers we 

rece ived 43 replies; results are 
printed below. 

Twenty-five (58 %) of the replies 
feel the newsletter should cover both 
track & field and long distance 
running. Seventeen (40 % ) feel we 
should cover mostly T&F. 

Almost everyone wants national 
and regional results. Next, in order, 
ca me regional schedules, age-re­
cords, international results, entry 
blanks, national ran kings and world 
rankings . 

Survey for N'ational 

"Masters" is the clear choice over 
"Veterans" and " Seniors." Thirty­
two (74%) favor "Masters," vs. 3 for 
each of the others. 

Most like the present name and 
format, but say "do what you have to 
do to make it profitable." 

Meet directors should note that 25 
(58 %) want exact ages listed in the 
results. 19 want.the first name , 15 the 
first initial, 13 the home town, and 
~)J1ly 7 care about the club. 

We will do our best to follow your 
suggestions . 

Since this is your newsletter , I'll 
confide some problems to you. 

Masters Newsletter 
FINALaESULTS 

director heaves :l sigh of relief and We think we -have It under cuntrol 
feels the job is fi nished . . It isn't. :lOW , but that';-why-some-ite~ have-
Results are as important to been late . Please sen your ...... ..--...... :; 
competitors as good officials. Too contributions as early as possible. 
often, we receive results a month or We're going through a few 
more after the event. Sometimes not growing pains with the newsletter, 
at all. By the time yo~ read the~ in but hope that you enjoy reading it. 
the newsletter, they're old news. We Pass the word to your friends to 
urge directors (or even caring subscribe. Thanks, also, for your 
competitors) to send results, or even supportive comments . We didn't 
a few highlights, of your event to print them all, because it would get a 
NMN right away. bit boring, but Ed and I appreciate 

Another problem which we're your kind ' words. 
trying to .cure is logistics . I'm editing We welcome and " need your 
the material in Los Angeles, then criticisms and suggestions. 
sending it to Ed Gildea in 
Pennsylvania. He prints and mails it 

7. When meet directors submit 
results, what information on each 
entrant (besides last name, place 
& time) should be included: 
(Check one or more). 

9. What other sports publications 
to you read? . 

a. Track & Field News _...:2",:3~ 
b . Runner's World 4'2, 
c . On the Run 7 

I . The National Masters Newslet· 
ter should report on: I 
a. Only Track & Field __ 

q . Travel info ____ -'1~3~ 
r. AAU / IAAF info __ -,-' '!~ 
s. Regional reports __ ... J:-::4~ 

S. What style format do you 
prder: 

d . Runner's Gazette __ ......;r;4_ 
e. Track Master ____ .....:(f,'!I-
f. National Jogger ___ --'4:,-

a. First name ___ 1-::",-
b. First initial _.....:'~5'-
c. Home town ___ I~3:-

b . Only Long Distance __ 0_ 

c. Mostly Track & Field -..ll.. 
d . Mostly Long Distance --2.. 
e. BothT&F&LDR ~ 
f.Don'tcare ___ 
g. w'Al',(\NG .. 

2. The newsletter should feature : 
(check one or more) 

a. National results '. 4'2 
b. Regional results ·41 
c. Local results , " ! q 
d. International results ~ 
e. Entry blanks 31 
f. Regional schedules ---11... 
g. Local schedules 1 B 
h. Photos '2 
i. Age-records '" _ 
j. National rankings ? 'f 
k. World rankings 24 
L Profiles , 0 
m. Human interest , (jI 
n. Health tips 14 
o. Medical Q&A I ~ 
p. Letters to editor I 8 

t. International report _....:..' ~~ 
u. President's report --L1-
v. iRA'Nlt:!1f liPS 2 w. _______________ ___ 
x. ___________ _ 

y.-----------------z. _______ -------------

3. How should llge·groups be 
identified? For example, should 
the 40-44 men be listed as: 

. a.40-M _~Ie:;.. 
b:IA <,Q 

c. M I A ---r:;~r-
d. M40-44 __ ...lI-::I~ 
e. M40 g 
f. Don't care __ 2~_ 

g.-------------
4. Field events should be -list~d in: 

a. Feet & inches ~ 
b. Meters 7 
c. Both ICf 
d. Don't care 1 I e. _____________ _ 

a. Prese'nt newspaper tabloid J!2. 
b. 8'/1 X II" '. f 
c. Slick cover magazine 
d . Don ' t-care 1"2, 
e . . _.,.....-_______ --

6. How much should the annual 
su'bscription price be? 

a. S3 ca 
b. S6 17 
c. SIO 5 
d. SIS __ _ 

3. Don't care ..u. 
f. PRo •• , ~dl~ 1 

d . Club _____ .L..7_ 
e. Exact age __ t~5_ 
f. Don't care __ ",!,2~. 
g: S't,,"Tf' 1 

8. What should the name ofthe 
newsletter be : 

a. National Masters Newsletter Jj 
b. U.S. National Masters 

Newsletter __ -:-_____ -::-
c. U.S. Masters Newsletter----1. 
d. National Veterans Newsletter..!. 
e . National Seniors Newsletter -L 
f. Don't care " 
g. ,.,"SHt\, .... " N{,W$ " 

g. Club newsletter . __ -+\~s_ 
h. Sports Illustrated --.l.'7~ 
i. Tht (3, ... "".,. :3 

10. Internationally, we're known . 
as "veterans." In the U.S., it's 
" .masters ." Which do you prefer? . 

a. Masters 32 , 
b . Veterans :3 
c. Seniors 3 
d. Don't 'care---L-e. _______________ _ 

II. What results of competition 
should we publish'! itT " 

All 1st 3 
finishers places 

Winners High· 
only lights 

U,S 
None' 

Dont 
care 

a . World Games 4 
b. National Championships -L 

1 ---
c. Regional Championships _ 
d. local Championships _ . __ --e. local meets f . _________ _ 
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1978 National Masters 10,000-meter rankings 

1978 l(, P PL"U. k;; 

P U 'CE . Il AIH 

~ O~CAR ttO IJP.F. 
3 8P IIIH H A R R IS 
" DAVID LOIH: 
5 J . KETS I HG 
c; FALJL HOI<[EII 
7. 1>A RVL BE Af:.[)A L1. 
8 RIILPH BOWLE S 
'J lUH GEP.f<ITY 
lOB . OL RIC H 

11 BI! I AH HOIILEY 
1' 2 IIILLIAH HOSS 
13 CHARLES ROSS 
14 BII.L BUTLER 
15 JOE HCI(USKER 
16 JOE 8URCIISSER 
17 JOHH BUTTER f IELD 
18 GEORGE VERHOSkY 
19 R ALKOH~ 

;'U CIlARLEY ~ P. ATT 

21 K . IIIHH 
22 L . !'~!10H 

~ J CHAHDLER ROBBINS 
24 tiED PFlICE 
25 JfROHE C . LEWIS 
H PUll GUISTO 
27 ROH DAWS 
28' JACK TUTTLE 
2 9 ADP.IAH CRAYEH 
30 ilL !:LAIIEKOHT 

31 K BElL 
3 2 JOE CAREV 
33 LOWELL HONTGOMERY 
l4 GL YHH WOOD 
3~ J ERRY HCHEAl 
36 DICK GOTTSHALL 
3 7 HAROLD TINSLEV 
38 R . PAKLAIAH 

·3 3 C. FORT 1EP. 
4 0 ROBERI PA CK ARD 

41 TOH liARD 
"2 WERHER F . TER SAGO 
43 II WICI( 
H JOHII UNDRIII 
4S J(fN HUELLER 
H 'K EN BAHII 
4 7 ROCEA ROU ILlER 
48 BI!YAH HAWLEY 
4~ REAGAN BENEDICT 
:fo A. DOYLE 

4 J 
4 0 

4 0 

48 
44 

., 
4 .' 

41 

4 ~ 

41 

42 
~ I 
40 
40 

411 

ALEX RATELl( 54 
2 J IH O'NEIL 5 3 
3 PETE HUHDLE · ~ J 

RICHARD WIDEHER ~ I 

5 HOWARD RU6 1~ 5 0 
b HYROH HERER ~ 

7 DOH DIXOH ~I 
8 .. JERALD HOP.RI SOll5 S 
9 DOH ~DAHS ~ 3 
10 "AX NEHAZI ~? 

II R PACKARD 
12 lU I S TORli:ES 
13 II . "CCArFREY 
H L . D,RENE" 
15 AUGUSTUS PRIHCE 
16 R . GP.F\Y 
17 CARL LARSOH 
IB C. ETHERIHGTOH 
19 II . ItAIt·SOH 

' 20 GLE"H COLE"AH 

. 21 HERB CHISHOLH 
22 HARRISON ROH 
23 L . ! WILL! A"S 
24 ROLAND AHSPHCN 

· 25 kEN WALKER 
26 HICK COSTES 
27 RODERT CHRLSOH 
2& FRAHK RUlIF~SOH 
2 9 B(I D HCG IFFERT 
30 J . TOBEY 

31 ' T . . PERSOU S 
J2 DON ROSS 
33 EO CALLAHAN 
34 k['LS£Y BROWN 

_ 3 ~ HPROLD I(~APP 

3 6 R E .' BRUCE 
3 7 II YROH HEYi::R 
38 E . LORD 
39 R . HIHHOH 5 
40 C. BROWH 

41 CHRIS HEE~IIHN 

4 2 JOH H CAVAH~UCH 
43 RI CHARD J LYOHS 
44 liON KIEHL 
4 5 WILLIAH COUCHLIN 
46 DHVID HACKfNZIE 
47 HHROLD DAUCH1ERS 
4 & '1 . WALNUT 
4~ B08 BIANCALAIIA 
50 HORII LUHIHH 

50 
50 
~ 2 

54 
50 

50 

57 
54 
5 :-
51 

5 3 
~ 2 

5 2 

50 
~ u 

50 

5 7 

50 

53 

~O 

5 2 

~; 0 

COMPILED BYGEZA FELD 

E 'n N! ' l o , oon It£TO~ IIC [ CROUP : 40 - 4 9 

3 .:: 02 
.\ 2 : 11 
J 2 : I ~ 
:!?: 26 
~ 2 ' 2& 
3 ~ : :! f~ 
32 : ~9 

3 ~: 47 

3 ;, : 5 9 
J J :' 1 2 

:: J ' 18 
n : 22 
)3:25 
3 3 : J~ 

.. 3 -i; :? (. 
33: 36 
]1 : " ~ 

3 ~ : 43 

J] ' 46 
3 ] ' 49 

31 1 57 
'11: C;C 

31::;8 
3 4 : 0 0 
34 . f. I 
34 ' 01 
34 : 06 
3 4 : U7 
:: ~:n7 

3 4 : 0' 

34 I u 
34 : I I 
J .\ : 1 2 
14 : I ;, 
34 : I J 
H: '14 
34 : 15 
34 : 17 
3 'i: 2 3 
34 : 23 

H : 25 
34 : 36 
.14 : 37 
3 .. : ] 7 
34 : J7 _ 
34 : 3& 
.34 : 3 ~ 
34: 4 2 
:> 4 : 43 
J 4 : 044 

r' LA U 

(,1 

62 
63 
64 
65 
66 
6 7 
HI 
6 'J 
7 <1 

7 1 

r u : El. J O~ 

t , A~L£ " ~ .iI'l'F. ti :' EN 

I LH I.II 81 L CUTHV 
li P T aU. HOf FER 
E . r ONtlOR 
8 0 B " il ro ; D £. R 
J Itl CII~I HE SS 
l.EE U 1 LCfl X 
P . H . FAr. P. IER­
HARRY DII VI S 

ROBERT I :.CEHBACH 
E . DEl"qr: fAIS 
SHv!: S Il: 
W. HI ~:5 0 N 

H'EH~ Y KUPf:?V K 
JOH~ COHR Ot 
DICK KlOEPFER 
ARlIE. L BP.OWH 
,I . WOODS 
ED S TARlO' 

D . Ili4HFORD 
' ? ~ H' [ ~ ow 

' 73 HIGUEl RUIZ 
74 D . (H ll k T !£ R 
7~ TAD PI~r E p.TON 

;- 6 r. . fH.lLL I PS 
.77 YIHfE L HIAPETTA 
70 DA\.'[ COL TOH 
79 JOII" Hi<L 
80 RAY [ . DilT Z 

9 1 P . ~ A L THIl P- SH 
~ ~ Il lV IN !l ARCV 
U3 ART fO I1HO 
fl4 rRE !> ..-EAr.£.R 
8 S CL \' DE R.n.ER 
IHi T. n'l ( I{ 

fl7 TO" WII>H ALH 
88 TOH FO RT 
R'J J , HCGOWAN 
90 JAII[ S 'FlLLlS 

91 D j C ~ J AHBORS KV 
'J2 F . WICk 
~ 3 PHILLIP CRAF E 
~4 HYRh N ANDERS OH 
95 " EItHIE IIHLUPS 
9~ HI KE GuO DR ICH 
'J? I' . wn B oH 
~A DAVE ED[U 
9'J HARPV KENNEDY ' 
100 dOHI! WHITEHOUS[ 

AC( GROUF : 50 - 59 

33 : 3 : 
31 : 4C1 
J4 : . O~ 

j 4 : 4 (. 
J4 : 52 
J:i : u:' 
3 'j: 2 r, 
J'i '3B 
35 : ~5 

35 : 53 

36 ' O~ 
J b : 24 
36 : 31 
11> : 46 
H : 4f< 
lb : 5 7 
37 : I I 
37 . \3 
37 : 2{' 
37 , 2 " 

37 : 30 
37 : 35 
:;7 : 37 
37 : J7 
37:39 
37 : 4 I 
3 7 : 42 
37 : 4 2 
37 : '45 
, 1: 46 

J7 : 46 
3 7 : 5 2 
l B: 17 
38 : 1 7 
3A : 19 
38 ' 2 1 
3ij:22 
1U : 2 3 
38 '2 3 
30 : ? 4 

3 B: ;; 8 
3S '2 6 

. 38 : 4 I 

. 38 : ~ 2 
lR : <l3 
3A : 45 
:t~, !';? 

JII· ~ 3 
H : Or, 
39 ;ui' 

"I JAr K f: IcE 
5 " 10HII Y HOIiC r. S 
S3 B : lL JHC ~ SOH 

~4 BILl. JAC ~S O H 

5 5. GE e Re[ S~EEHHN 
Sf>. JOHII I. URTOH 
5 7 R . LA H E 
59 EI>['1£ LF.VINE 
~ 9 HHRR Y ~ ~kA 1 T 

60 f< . ~ A"VER 

1>1 ,I OHN COCHRAN 
1>2 H . Hftl~ I OUES 

63 C . lIu f< P .... • 
I> ~ co~ no ~ ~ [IFfP. T 

£5 TOI1 BAS " ICK 
6'; S GONEZ 
b7 RICH MUELLER 
£9 CEHE rA p. PELL 
Eo9 JA CK SCOTT 
70 H I, ,gUR RO W 

71 I<OB BR lIC E 
72 R . NC<~ {'J BLOH 

7 3 SAl1 dEL DELUCA 
74 JEP.RY BEA H R 
75 JOH'H Df, Y(HPOR T 
7 6 HARUl~ GREEH Rf R G 
( 7 uon CHRI ST IAH SEH 
79 WIlI.ARD SHI'H K · 
7'J JOHH PE P LIHS K I 
AO EDWIH KRAWITZ 

81 B08 TNIIR STEEN 
tl ~ SA" c r, .'tTLH 
fj .J WIL SG H vlBLE 
8~ D AH DA UGHERT Y 
il5 fl(L conn 
£I f. E. srUtiOH 
87 HAR ~Y fRE ESTONE 
88 C . El LI S 
fI ~ I1 f. RL£ ~. !IO ~ 

'I f, R . "lI IU' 

91 HEN n' S,i ll fHi 
92 RO D .J OH !I COu 
'3 a OB HIIIM 
9~ ROBun ~ AYHOP.H 
95 A . R IC Hfl ~ ~ 
96 PAUL SPtH r [~ 

'17 P.OBEr. T I flhELL 
9 0 ,IIIHN BA l £ 5 
99 I1 !1T I: A: ; 
1011 I· 1'~ H I r. U E 

AGE 

41 
43 
~3 

40 

<10 
41 

41 
48 

41 

43 

4Q 
45 
40 
4? 
45 

40 

47 
42 
41 

48 

<Ib 
40 

42 
46 

41 
4 

47. 

42 

51 

50 
5'J 
55 
50 

50 
53 

~3 

50 
51 
51 

53 
5 I 

'i1 

52 
50 

53 

50 

53 
-51 
50 

52 

52 
51 

Tl HE 

3~ ' H 
H ' 4 8 
34 ' 4 8 
34 : 4 ~ 
J 4 ; 5 il 
J 4: ~ 2 

J 4 : ~ 2 
34 : 57 
34: " a 
35 : 0 I 

35 ' () 1 
3 5 :0; 
35 : 03 

·35 : 06 
35 ' 06 
35 : C(' 
35.07 
35 ' 0 9 
35 , ) 0 
35 : 1 1 

35 : I 2 
J ~ . ~ ~ 
35:13 
35 : I 4 
35 : 14 

35 ' I' 
35 : 20 
35: i 0 
35: ;' 2 
J 5 : 2 i, 

35 : 2 9 
1 5 : 2~ 

35 ' J ) 
35 : ] 2 
35 . 34 
35 : 35 
35 : .Jb 
35 : 36 
35 . 3 7 
35 : 3 G 

35 . 39 
J5 139 
3 5 : 39 
3S , 3? 

-:J !r.-:r, 
3 5 . 4 0 
35 : 41 
35 ; 41 
35 : 42 
35 ' ~!i 

3 ~ : 0 B 
39 ' 1 5 
J I) : l~ 

3 9 : I 5 
B : l il 
3 '.l : 1 H 
B : 20 
3 ~j : 2 tt 
3 'j : .:! 7 
39 : 27 

3 91 28 
3 ~' 2 9 

31 : 3 2 
3 ~. 3 1 . 
39 : 3 ? 
3 9: 3 8 
39 : 19 
39 ' 4 I 
3 9 : 45 
3 9 : 4 7 

39 : 4 ij 
J9 !5 Z 
3 9 : 5 2 
39 ' ~3 
39 : 56 
39: S A 
40 10 G 
40 : 0 I 
40 : 0 2 
40 : ~ ~ 

'40 : 0 7 

4 l/ 1\ I 
40 : 11 
~ fl i I 1 
4 l/ ; I 3 
4 0 ' I ) 
4 0 ' 14 
40 : ) ,: 
4 0 I I .. 
4 (j I ) 8 

40 : ;' .) 

4 ° ': 5 
4 (l : 2 7 
40' 3 I 
40 . 31 
40 : 3 ' 
• v 13 b 
4 01 49 
40 149 

' 40 : 4 Q 

Pl. ACE AGf 

I CLIVE' OAYIES. ~3 
2 CHAN LIHC WAHG 
3 ROB HARMOH 
4 . DOH LOHGENECKER 
5 J OL'ESOH 
, FRANCISCO "ORALES 6~ 
7 RAI GORDON ' 60 
e . W[LSON VIelE ' 0 
9 "AW OUACKEHSOS 61 
10 B . SOAL . 

11 JOHH WOOOS 6 0 
12 H . "ARSHALL 
13 WALLACE HCRO\' 
14 RAY SEARS ~ ! 

15 IIA Y- PEISER U 

" BIll AHDBERG 
17 JOE CAREY ,r 
IB R. PHINHEY f3 
19 JOHH ARCH£R 
20 GE (I RC E H AJ OR 

21 JOHH "OHT OYA 
22 HANK BRADOOCk 
2J L . VOUHG 
24 DOH JOHHSON 
25 J . JOHHSON 
26 LARRY PATTERSON 
27" HUCKIHS. 
28 OSCAR HART"ANH 
29 J . nARTIH 
3D LUIS RI<;lU Il 

31 W. WESTERHOLH 
32 RI CHARO EL TOH 
J3 W. SHRADER ' 
34 R . HERBERT 
35 C. SHITH , 
36o/ AI ' CUTTAG I ,]I " P~Ul T. FAIRBAN K 

- 38 l 'OU P . GREGOR'( 
J'J EOWIH F . ESTLE 
40 H . SAWIZKV 

41 J OF E ICHOL Tl 

"I 

6 0 

o 
'; 0 
GO 
(, O 
7 I 
7f. 
-O R 
'3 

35: I' 
' 3 i : ~ q 

3 R ' 0 (Y 
3 '1 : 00 
J Q'J5 
4 ~: J 1 
4 ~ : 40 
4J : 4 J 
40: ~ 9 

'41 : 13 

41:t , 
41 ' 25 
4 I : 26 
41 : 3 9 
·Q 140 
4 I : 45 
<12 : 0 (· 
42 : 2 (, 
43 : 24 
43 : 25 

43 : n 
44 : 16 
44: 2~ 
4 ~ : 33 

' 44 : 39 
44 : 46 
4<1 ' 58 
4 ~ : 59 
4 ~: f.2 
0 : 10 

4 ~ , 12 
4 5 : I ~ 
45 ' 17 
4S ' 19 ' 
4 5: 28 
4~ ' 211 
4' : 33 
45 : 38 
4!\ : 40 
46 : () 4 

46 : 27 

I'L ACf 

~ I A . ARH , II ~' V' 

52 lES !'A r Oti 
:i3 -P I: !JI. S PHIIC I ER 
54 HOP.TuN r· HYEY 
5~ ,101114 r' JH.f fElT I 
% H . CIlH~nlf 

~ 7 JOliN UF.L H:IlH 
':8 CHHRLE <; .; t.ROHE 
S9 PHOH ""I! 'IEL 
( () II . RR.E S~ ANI 

61 JOSEPH GOODMAN 
'2 C . J . CROSSHIC KL E 
63 JOHH HAHPIOH 
t 4 ' Sr.".1I0h . HfiOSOH 
( 6 .J . ~OH T A IIlE 
G~ F GOO ) t4JW 
67 J . KELLER 
66 J . ~AR"[H 

69 D . aUAH(lJ: HI 
70 D. HIlDIHTH 

71 
72 
73 
:' -\ 
75 
h 
77 
1~ 

79 
00 

81 
82 
83 
A4 
lI S 

A" 
O? 
I' A 
~ 'l 

"0 

91 

CLIFF 1oi00LEV 
II . FfH, PI' j ER 
P . HCJU 
HF.HRV JAilHES 
WALTER F . £DERI CK 
F . DECE I.. L g 
PHI LL I P r II MA S 
C . I. L l t1 E ~ f, 
JOE 1In1:I II LC CI 
a AH nO ll A ;TERO 

DENH" fiElDS 
W. STANf ,. PD 
WAL TER "ORAWSKI 
UILL GEOfll:£ 
J . LAR~ J 

J . RIJ.OIH OIJ 
HARRY ~ rr,r.OL[ 

II . ~AIJE Y 

D . Ni CHOLSON 
HAR OLD C:""H 

. 
A'CE 

G3 

71 
61 

.. 3 

~O 

~, 

.. 0 

.3 
• '3 

,,1 
~5 

'0 

62 
.0 

TIHE 

47 ' '.i7 
48 : IS 
48 : t' 
-48 ' 1 'J 
48 : 2 7 
48 : H 
48 : 57 
·48 : 58 
49 : 28 
4'J'33 

. 49: 34 
4"3<1 
4'J ' 35 4' : .. 2 ' 
4' : 4~ 
.. 9 57 
50 : JI 
50 ' 44 
51 : OJ; 
S1 : 12 

51 : 16 
51 · 49 
52 : 05 
52 , 1)' 
5 2 : 0 7 
52 : I 2 
52 : 17 
5 2 : 1 1 
52 ' 45 
52 , 49 

53 . 0 .1 
51 : 4 9 
53 ' ~O 
'54 : J[, 
54 : 4 7 
~ ~ . ~. 
5~ ' ~ ~ 

:5~ , ) 8 
-:' 5 : 40 
5~ : ., I 

o A O..l , ] -7 ~----<r7 

T . CARH ORT 61 56 : 09 
U -;rlnflr O 5 ~ . ....-~ 5 i::'J.i 

043 AARuH FIAlOW 
44 J . FIELDING 
45 W. HURRAV 

. 46. 8 . HfI HL E Y 
H ,J . CARROLL 
48 CL IFF CHEEHW OO D 
4'1 S IEHKlfWIC Z 
5 C p . D£I.M4 P 

;'7 

1>0 
4 ~ : 38 

41> : 4" 
4 7: I I 
4 7 : 24 
4? · ;: f1 
~7 : 3 1 

4 : .. , 4 1 
1" : <. I 

93 
94 
~ 5 

9b 
97 
9 ~ 

4) l " 

l' Ie;: 1. ( ;:; 
U . rO UI. EP 70 
H. 1I0 DH IIU 69 
ROBE R T EI SENSTADT 
J . I/HIl OIIT S .4 
~fi ~ Lf ATHERnAN 66 
J n ~ ~ ~ fl TT EHBE RG 60 
r tH; PI [ " ~ 1''''' OH l ;"1 

5 Ii : 4 !i 
5 b : ~ 3 

57 : 0 1 
57 . :) 5 
57 , 2 3 
57 : ~ 1 
s ;- : ~ 5 
~ 7 : : 1 

Californians Earl Rippee, . Jim 
Olesson and Wilbur Buchanan. 

170 vie in New Jersey meet 
By KELSEY BROWN 

I'!\ I< !\ MUS . N.J., June 16. The 4th 
annual.l NJ!\!\ l) outdoor champion­
~ ll ip '" \\T IT ilv ld at Be rger ComnlU­
ni t\· Colkgl'. 

!\ rl'l'I lrC\ 170 entra nts , including 2S 
\\ 1 " ll l ' l1 . turned out to compe te in the 
l )l l · d l ~ 1'l' C' wcather. 

l<ullllill g w'it'hout spikes didn ' t 
"lT Il I It) hampe r the athletes as 26 
II lc e l rccords were set. One world age 
.l! I'OUp mark was se t bv Tim Dyas S9 
~()rth .J (T;'L'~· M as ter~ , iD_th€-2~1€- ­
walk. 1 4 : () 1 .<:::::T1i:i3~ S seconds 
helm\ his 19:0~the-fVISA--

/i :1' 1l j1 1i1I1 "hips May 27, 1979. 



'.-

page 20 National Masters Newsletter 

Masters 'win' mythical national 
championship over open women 

If the wInning marks in the AAU 
National Masters Track and' Field 
Championsh ips are compared to the 
winning marks in the AAU 
Women' ~ National Championships, 
the men-aver-40 win, 5-3, in the eight 
events where conditions are virtually 
the same. 

Howevcr. if the 8 events were 
scored like a dual meet (1 st-5 pts., 
2nd-3 pts., 3rd-l pt.), the greater ' 
depth of the. women win, 37-35. 

In the 100 and 200, EVelyn Ashford 
would haH' "beaten" Masters Lewis 
Smith and Gary Miller. 
. In the 400, Nick Newton edges 

Patricia Jackson. In the 800, Ernie 
Billups tops Essie Kelly in the 800 

and Francie Larrieu in the 1500. (Now 
therc's it race we'd really like to see.) 
. Jack Foster would have lapped 
Mary Shea in the 10,000. Ron Laird 
wins over Sue Braddock in the 5000 
walk. Debbie Brill easily takes Rich 
Richardson in the high jump. 
The 400-hurdles and triple jump are 

hard to compare. Gary Miller sailed 
over 33" barriers in 57.74, while 
Edna Br(l\~ ' n one-lapped 30" obstac­
les , in 57.60. Kathy McMillan 
out- leaped Kermit Walker in the 
triple. but .it was wind-aided . 

It ' makc'> for an interesting 
match-up . 

I Ill' "re,>u lts" : 

Race· Walking 
Lllri Maynard set a PR at an age 43 

\1 llmen's American mark in the 5000 
walk May 28 with a 26:39.2 in the 
Pacific Association AA U meet. 

Elcne Carola set an age ' 71 
-;landard at 41:41.2 

Bill Ranney was the 1st Master , 
6th overall, with a 48: 18 at the 
National AAu 10K Walk in Chicago 
May 26. Ranney is 44. 

Bonnie Dillon. 32, in her 1st mile 
race did 15:3·1, lowered it in 4 months 
to -:43. winning two open 

competitions against women and men 
in Northern California. 

Katherine York of Modesto set 
agc-66 women' s marks this year in 
thc 5K at 41 :58 and 2-mile' in 23:05 . 

Ranncv won tHe. Pacific AAU 30K 
Opcn Championship July 1 in 
2:33:45. Ron ' Laird was 2nd in 
2:34.20. 

Maynard won the open 10K 
PAAAU the same day in 56:49. Dillon 
I\as 3rd in 58:59. 

Letters to the Editor 
For your information, I resigned 

the position of Far Western Regional 
Masters Track & Field Meet 
Chairman on April 6, 1979. 

The powers-that-be had over 21/2 
months to find someone to run the 
Far Western Regionals Meet. I do not 

, feel that I, in any way, contributed to 
the problem of lack of time in 
obtaining a ' Meet Director. 

Hal Smith 
, Tarzana, Calif. 

Past results are interesting, of 
course; however, what I personally 
need most are dates of future meets 
and entries. 

Richard Lacey 
Pelham, N.Y. 

The local Queensland Veterans still 
will not answer my phone calls or 
correspondence. You ' wouldn't be­
lieve how petty they can be . 

They' cannot stop me running in 
Germany. I was going to run as an 
independent. However, the Austral­
ians wrote to Germany and told them 
I could run for Australia, only after I 
threatened to run in a black uniform , 
with "God save Australian Vet­
erans" written on the singlet. 

As yet , the Australians have not 
decided whether us ex-pros can run 
or not. We don 't know until we have a 
meeting in Germany. 

I've had a public apology from Wal 
Sheppard. Secretary of the Austral-

ian Veterans Association, for his 
claim that I used a false Australian 
card when I ran in Sweden, when in 
fact I , was running with the 
Amcricans. I took legal af:tion against 
both Sheppard and Jack Pennington 
for defamation, as a result , of their 
article in the Australian Veterans 
Magazine. 

Once again, I thank Helen Pain, 
Dave Pain, who I never met, Pete 
MundIe, Hal Smith, Ozzie Dawkins" 
Nick Newton, Dave Jackson and all 
you people who have helped me in 
my fijht to run against people of my 
own age group. 

I still have my problems here. 
However, they cannot stop me 
running internationally. I feel 
Germany will be my last effort, at 58. 
I feel I can't continue to fight 
stupidity any longer. I may take up 
parachute jumping; at least I may get 
a fair go at that sport. 

On the brighter side of things, I 
have trained harder for Germany 
than I have ever trained , mainly 
bccause I'm at the end of my age 
group . 

Aileen is the European and 
Australian 100 and 200 Champion 
with two world records. I'm still 
world champion-until Germany, 
anyway-so it's a very unique 
situation. 

Cheerio for now, 
Aileen and Bernie Hogan 

Brisbane, Australia 

100 Age 
r:-Evelyn Ashford 
2'. Brenda Morehead 
3. Chandra Cheeseborough 

Mark 
11. 01 
11.13 
11. 33 
11. 60 9. Lewis Smith 40 

20 0 
r:-Evelyn Ashford 
2. Valerie Briscoe 
3. Brenda Morehead 
9. Gary Miller ' 42 

400 
r:-Nick Newton 45 
2. Gary Miller 42 
3. Patricia Jackson 

800 
~Ernie Billups 42 
2; Jack Knebel 40 
3. Bill Mayer 42 
5. Essie Kelly 

1500 
r:-Ernie Billups 42 
2. Francie Larrieu 
3. Mary Decker 

1000G 
1. Jack' Foster 47 
2. Ray Hatton 47 
3. Mary Shea 

5000 WALK 
1_ Ron Laird 41 
2. Sue Broddock, 
3. 'Paula Kash 

HIGH JUMP 
1. Debbie Brill 
2. Louise Ritter 

22 .07 
22.53 
22.75 
23.56 

52.26 
52.28 
52.37 

1:56.0 
2:00.2 
2:00.9 
2:02.3 

4:03_4 
4:06.6 
4:06.8 

30:48.5 
32:17.4 
32:52.5 

22:26.9 
24:07.6 
25:21.2 

"-

U.S; Senator Alan 
Western Regionals . 

-

Cranston 

3. Pam Spencer 
4. Rich Richardson 46 

6" 4" ''''--_____. 
-fr-Li!.l:i '~ --,._ 

6'2l:/" 
6' 

Biltfitzgerald 

Jerry Wojcik, Granada Hills, Calif., 
throws hammer as admirer looks on. 

at 

.---------------------------
I 
I Subscribe now! 
I The National Masters News­
I letter is bigger and better than 
I ever and it's still a bargain at $3 
I for the rest of 1979. Take 
I advantage of the continued low 

subscription price and get aboard 
the publication that's going to be 
covering the Masters scene more 
thoroughly than ever. Subscribe 
now. 

I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 

o $3 enclosed for the newsletter for the rest of 1979. 
Send to 102W. Water St. , Lansford, Pa. 18232 

Name 

Address ______________ ------------------~-----

I ______ -~------~-----------~ 
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