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Figure S1. qPCR analyses of 
levels of six Kit isoforms in 
five tissues (brain, skin, 
testis, ovary, intestine) in 
control (WT BTT and WT 
WTT), and Kit paramutant 
(HET and 1st WT WTT) mice. 
Both gapdh and Hprt were used 
as endogenous control 
references, and the levels of 
the six isoforms were 
normalized relative to those in 
the WT BTT samples. Data are 
presented as means ± SEM. 
Biological triplicates were 
analyzed (n=3), and significant 
differences were determined 
using Student t-test, p<0.05. 
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Figure S2. CpG methylation 
status of the Kit promoter 
regions in sperm (A) and tail 
(B) DNA of controls (WT BTT 
and WT WTT), HET 
(Kit+/copGFP) and F1 WT WTT 
(1st WT WTT) mice, as 
determined by bisulfite 
sequencing assays.  Vertical 
columns stand for individual 
CpGs that are present in this 
region (10 in total).   Each row 
represents 10% of the clones 
sequenced.  Black dots 
denote full 100% 5mC, 
whereas white dots indicate 
0%.  Gray dots represent 5mC 
levels in between these two 
extremes. Average 
percentages are shown below 
each panel.  Ten clones from 
biological triplicates were 
analyzed for each sample set.  
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Figure S3. Levels of 5mC and 
hydroxyl-5mC methylation in 
sperm DNA of WT BTT, WT 
WTT, HET (Kit+/copGFP), and 
1st WT WTT (F1 WT WTT) 
mice.  (A) A schematic diagram 
of the promoter region of the Kit 
gene. The EPD-predicted 
promoter region is depicted as 
a lime green box, and the 
region that was analyzed using 
bisulfite sequencing is shown 
as a light grey box (denoted 
“Bisulfite Sequencing”), and the 
primer pairs used in MeDIP-
qPCR detection are indicated 
by the dark green (forward 
primer) and light green (reverse 
primer) pairs, 1-7, respectively.  
(B) 5mC-MeDIP qPCR 
analyses on sperm DNA.  
Primer pairs 1, 3, and 5 showed 
enrichment of DNA in the 
MeDIP products, relative to 
equivalent levels of input DNA 
control.  No significant 
difference was detected 
between WT BTT samples and 
any of the three other 
genotypes.  (C) h5mC-MeDIP 
qPCR analyses on sperm DNA 
from the four genotypes. No 
significant differences were 
observed between the four 
genotypes.  
 



Table S1. Oligonucleotides used in qPCR and bisulfite sequencing analyses. 

qPCR primer set: Fwd Oligo (5’-3’) Rev Oligo (5’-3’) 

MeDIP-Opt1 CACGCTGGCCAATAGAAATCA TGTTGGTAGAGGAGGACGGAT 

MeDIP-Opt2 CACCTCCACCATAAGCCGAAT ACGAGCGCATTAGGTACGG 

MeDIP-Opt3 CTCCTGGTCTTAGAGGGCACA CCACGCCCCTCCCTTCTCC 

MeDIP-Opt4 CTAGTGGCTCTGGGGGCTC AACAGGACGCAGAGCAGATC 

MeDIP-Opt5 TTTTCCCATGCCTACCACCTC AAAGCATCACCAAACTCGCC 

MeDIP-Opt6 TTGTTAAAAGTTGCGCGTGGG CAGTTGCGTCCCCAGCACT 

MeDIP-Opt7 GTGTTCGTTGCTGCCACGC CAAAGCTGGGGAGAACTGACT 

Coding Isoforms (1&2) AGACAGCCACGTCTCAGCCAT AGTCCATCTGACAAAGTCGGG 

Isoform 1 CTGGGAGGAGGGCTGGAGG CGCTAGACTCTGAGCTCCTCT 

Isoform 2 AACTGGTGGTTCAGAGTTCCA GGCCTGGATTTGCTCTTTGTT 

Isoform 3 GAGGCGGGATTATCTAAGGTA CGAGTCACGCTTCCTTCTCAA 

Isoform 4 ACCCTGCCTTCTTCCTTCCTA AAATGGGCACTTGGTTTGAGC 

Isoform 5 CTGGACAACATACCCACTGCA TGCAGGAAGAGAAATAGCCTCA 

Isoform 6 TACACCCTCTGCTTTGGCTTT CAGTCCTTCCTTCACAGTGGG 

Gapdh Control AACTTTGGCATTGTGGAAGG CACATTGGGGGTAGGAACAC 

Hprt Control TCAGTCAACGGGGGACATAAA GGGGCTGTACTGCTTAACCAG 

Kit promoter bisulfite PCR TTGTGGGGGTTTTTGGTTTTAGAG CACTAACGACGCGCGACAAC 

 

 

 




